
Unit Bid 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit Bid 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit Bid 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit Bid 
Price

Extended 
Price

1. L-3 Insight Technologies BNVD 
System, AN/PVS-31A, White 
Phosphur, 2376 Minimum FOM, 
Including Wilcox G24 Mount or 
approved equal

September 31, 
2019

4  No Bid  No Bid  $  11,053.00  $  44,212.00  $  11,053.00  $  44,212.00 

Avon Protection FM54 Specialist 
Responder's Kit or approved equal, 
Size:  Medium     

July 31, 2019

Includes: Twin-Port Mask, Clear 
Outsert, CBRNCF50 Filter, 
CTCF50 Riot Agent Filter
BlueBlocker Outsert,  Mask 
Carrier, and Mask Storage Bag
with Face Form
3M Scott X-3 with CGA, 4500PSI 
Quick Connect Regulator Hose

July 31, 2019

 Dual EBSS Buddy Breather Pak 
Tracker or approved equal

4. 3M Scott 45 minute, carbon 
cylinder 4500 PSI or approved 

July 31, 2019 5  No Bid  No Bid  $    1,045.00  $    5,225.00  $    1,123.06  $    5,615.30  No Bid  No Bid 

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 19-065

Purchase of Fire and Police Protection Equipment

20

Recommendation: Low bidder meeting specification per item

10  $    6,203.06  $  62,030.60 

Item Description Delivery 
Required By

3.

Funding: Homeland Security and Emergency Management SWAT and HAZMAT Grants

 $       869.00  $  17,380.00 

 No Bid  No Bid 

Item 
Number

 $    5,740.00  $  57,400.00 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

Quantity

2.

Safeware Inc.                  
Lanham, MD

 $       740.97  $  14,819.40 

Form 1295
Yes

 No Bid  No Bid 

Yes Yes

 Disqualified: Does not meet 
specifications. 

Lawmen's Shooter's               
Supply, Inc.                           

Vero Beach, FL

Metro Fire Apparatus 
Specialists, Inc.          

Houston, TX

National Safety                 
Supply, Inc.               

Frederick, MD


	Itemized

