


OFFICE OF COUNTY PURCHASING AGENT 
Fort Bend County, Texas 

Term Contract Renewal Form 

Solicitation #:  Bid 17-027 

Title:  Term Contract for Ammunition 

Contracted Vendor:  GT Distributors, Inc. 

Mr. Curtis, 

Our contract with your company for the above referenced expires March 31, 2019.  Contract provisions allow 
for renewal of this contract if mutually agreeable. 

If your company wishes to renew this contract through March 31, 2020 under the same terms and conditions, 
please complete the information below and return this form along with a Form 1295 by e-mail to 
cheryl.krejci@fortbendcountytx.gov .  Purchasing will then take the matter before the Commissioner’s Court of 
Fort Bend County for their consideration.  Please respond to this email by January 8, 2019, 5:00 PM. 

_______  Yes, I agree to renewing our agreement with Fort Bend County under the same terms and conditions. 

_______  No, I do not wish to renew our agreement with Fort Bend County. 

If Yes, please provide a new Form 1295 along with this renewal form by replying to this email.  The Form 
provided last year is not acceptable. 

Effective January 1, 2016 all contracts executed by Commissioners Court, regardless of the dollar amount, will 
require completion of Form 1295 "Certificate of Interested Parties", per the new Government Code Statute 

§2252.908. All vendors submitting a response to a formal Bid, RFP, SOQ or any contracts, contract amendments,

extensions or renewals are required to complete the Form 1295 online through the State of Texas 
Ethics Commission website. Please visit:    

 https://www.ethics.state.tx.us/whatsnew/elf_info_form1295.htm. 

On-line instructions: 

Name of governmental entity is to read:  Fort Bend County . 

Identification number used by the governmental entity is:  B17-027 . 

Description is to read:  Term Contract for Ammunition. 

After receiving the Form 1295 with the Certification Number and Date Filed, please print the form, have notarized 
and sign, then email the Form 1295 and this Term Contract Renewal Form to 
cheryl.krejci@fortbendcountytx.gov. 

Signature of Authorized Representative  Date 

Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative 

x

DAVID CURTIS, BIDS MANAGER

1/14/2019





Description                             Lawson 
Number

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box
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Price                        
per                  

Case
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per     

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  
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Price              
per   
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per                  
Box
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of                  

Delivery 
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Round 
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Rounds 
per            

Case
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Delivery 
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9.1:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 80265 75 GR.
Manufacturer:
HORNADY         No Sub
9.2:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 83278 55 GR. FPD
Manufacturer:
HORNADY         No Sub
9.3:  .223 REM, L223R3 
55 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.4:  9-MM Luger 
L9MM3 115 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.5:  9-MM Golden Saber 
GS9MMB 124 GR. 
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.6:  .40 S & W L40SW3 
180 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub

Term:  through 31 March 2018

Form 1295

200

500

500

500

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 

GT Distributors, Inc.                                                                              
Austin, TX

Precision Delta Corp                                      
Ruleville, MS

200

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $0.74000 $14.80  $148.00 9012945

12946

12947

12948

12949

 $0.38882  NA ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $  77.76 

 $0.27530  NA 

 $177.06 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $137.65 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 $0.21200  NA  $106.00 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.35412  NA 

 No Bid 

 Yes Yes  Yes 

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 17-027

Ammunition

Awarded 12.6.16:  Low Bidder per Item

Vendor Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.                                                 
Houston, TX

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 



 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Bid                     
Price                        
per                  

Case

Rounds 
per     

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Bid               
Price              
per   

Round

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            
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Days                  
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Price              
per   

Round 

 Bid           
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per                  
Box 

 Bid      
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per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.7:  .40 Golden Saber 
GS40SWB 180 GR. 
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.8:  .357 SIG 
GSB357SB Golden Saber 
357 SIG 125GR BJHP
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.9:  .357 SIG L357S1 
UMC 125GR MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.10:  38 SPL L38S11 
130 GR. MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON   No Sub
9.11:  45 Auto L45AP4 
UMC 45 ACP 230GR. 
MC
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.12:  45 Auto GS45APB
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON     No Sub
9.13:  12 GA. RR12BK8-
00 2 3/4" Buckshot 8 
pellets reduced recoil
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub

12955

12956

Description                             Lawson 
Number

12950

12951

12952

12953

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.                                                 GT Distributors, Inc.                                                                          

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

No Bid

500

500

500

500

250

Precision Delta Corp                                                               

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

12954

 $0.31280  NA 

 $0.38236  NA 

 $0.29412 

 $156.40 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $191.18 

500

500

No Bid

No Bid

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA  $147.02 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.27059  NA  $135.29 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.29766  NA  $147.33 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.40588  NA  $202.94 

 $0.54706  NA  $136.76 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

No Bid



 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Bid                     
Price                        
per                  

Case

Rounds 
per     

Case
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of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Bid               
Price              
per   

Round

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.14:  12 GA. RR12RSB 
12 GA 2 3/4" Foster slug 
reduced recoil
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.15:  12 GA. GC127 2 
3/4" 7 1/2 target loads
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.16:  R30301 Core-Lokt, 
30-30 win. 150 gr. SPCL.
Manufacturer:
REMINGTON    No Sub
9.17:  Blank Popper, 
Winchester 12 GA. 2 3/4" 
smokeless power
Manufacturer:
WINCHESTER   No Sub

12957

12959

12960

Description                             Lawson 
Number

12961  $0.83105 

500

250

200

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.

 $118.05 

 NA  $207.76 250  $0.50520  $12.63  $126.30 250ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

30-90

Precision Delta Corp

 $0.47223  NA 

GT Distributors, Inc.

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

 $0.30352  NA  $  75.88 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.69824 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $139.64 No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box
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per                  

Case
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per     

Case
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of                  
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Days                  
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Price              
per   
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Box

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 
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per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.18:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 80265 75 GR.
HORNADY or Equal 
WINCHESTER  
9.19:  .223 HORNADY 
TAP 83278 55 GR. FPD
HORNADY or Equal 
WINCHESTER  
RA223BSTA
9.20:  .223 REM, 
L223R3 55 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
HORNADY 9754EL
9.21:  9-MM Luger 
L9MM3 115 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER Q4172
9.22:  9-MM Golden 
Saber GS9MMB 124 GR. 
BJHP
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER RA9BA
9.23:  .40 S & W 
L40SW3 180 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER Q4238
9.24:  .40 Golden Saber 
GS40SWB 180 GR. 
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON  

12964

12965

12966 $0.35412

 $  77.76 200

12968

 $148.00 200

 NA  $177.06 500

Description                           Bailey's House of Guns, Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corp

12962  $0.71300 

Lawson 
Number

 $0.74000 $14.80No Bid 90  $14.26  $142.60 

 $148.00 200 90

200 90-180+

 NA 

12963 No Bid  $0.74000 200 Currently 
In Stock

$0.38882 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

$14.80

 $0.32000 $16.00  $160.00 

 $0.71900  $14.38  $143.80 

500

 NA 500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.18900 500 180+ $106.00 

90

$17.00  $170.00 500

 $0.33900  $  6.78 

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 $0.34800  $17.40 

12967 $0.27530

 $339.00 400

 $  9.45  $  94.50 

500

300+

 $156.40 500

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 500$0.31280

 NA  $137.65 500

 $174.00 

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

120-180

 $0.23500  $11.75 

$0.21200 90

$25.50  $255.00 500

 $117.50 500 Currently 
In Stock

 $205.00 90

90

$20.50

 $0.51000 

 $0.34000 

 $0.51000 

 $0.41000 

90  $0.36400 

500

$25.50  $255.00 120-180 $182.00 500 $18.20 
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9.25:  .357 SIG 
GSB357SB Golden Saber 
357 SIG 125GR BJHP
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON 
9.26:  .357 SIG L357S1 
UMC 125GR MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON 
9.27:  38 SPL L38S11 
130 GR. MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON 
9.28:  45 Auto L45AP4 
UMC 45 ACP 230GR. 
MC
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER Q4170
9.29:  45 Auto GS45APB
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON  
9.30:  12 GA. RR12BK8-
00 2 3/4" Buckshot 8 
pellets reduced recoil
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER 
9.31:  12 GA. RR12RSB 
12 GA 2 3/4" Foster slug 
reduced recoil
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON 

12969  $191.18 

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.

12971

12970

 $0.27059 

 $0.29766  $230.00 500 90

Currently 
In Stock

12973  $0.40588 

 $0.54706 

 NA 

 $136.76 250 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

12975  $0.47223 $5.45  $109.00 

500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 

GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corp

 $0.47000 

 $0.46000 $23.00

 $147.02 500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

12974

12972

$0.38236

 $202.94 500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 

 NA  $135.29 500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA  $147.33 500 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 

 NA  $118.05 250 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

90500

No Bid

$29.50  $295.00 500

 $0.29412 

 $0.62000 $31.00  $310.00 500 90

Description                           Lawson 
Number

 $0.55500  $27.75 

 $0.37100  $18.55 $23.50  $235.00 

500 120-180

500 120-180

 $139.50 500

 $277.50 

 $185.50 

 $  73.00 100 90

100 90

90

 $0.30600  $15.30 

 $0.59000  $0.43100  $21.55  $215.50 500 Currently 
In Stock

 $153.00 500

 $0.27900  $13.95 

 $105.80 250 Currently 
In Stock

 $0.53000  $  2.65  $132.50 250 $1.09000 

 $0.42320  $0.73000 $7.30

Currently 
In Stock

 $10.58 

Currently 
In Stock
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Price              
per   

Round 

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

Bid                     
Price                        
per                  

Case

Rounds 
per     

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

Bid               
Price              
per   

Round

Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
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Delivery 
Days                  

 Bid               
Price              
per   

Round 

 Bid           
Price           
per                  
Box 

 Bid      
Price                        
per                  

Case 

Rounds 
per            

Case

Number               
of                  

Delivery 
Days                  

9.32:  12 GA. GC127 2 
3/4" 7 1/2 target loads
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER 
9.33:  R30301 Core-Lokt, 
30-30 win. 150 gr. SPCL.
REMINGTON or Equal 
REMINGTON
9.34:  Blank Popper, 
Winchester 12 GA. 2 3/4" 
smokeless power
REMINGTON or Equal 
WINCHESTER 38SBLP

 NA  $207.76 250 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

 NA 12976  $0.30352 250

GT Distributors, Inc. Precision Delta Corp

12977  $0.69824 

12978  $0.83105 

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.

 NA  $139.64 200 ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

ASAP 
Some in 

Stock

Description                           Lawson 
Number

 $  75.88 

No Bid  $0.70300  $35.15 

No Bid

 $703.00 1000 120

 $0.28720  $  7.18  $  71.80 250

 $0.73000  $14.60  $146.00 200 120

Currently 
In Stock

No Bid


	B17-027.Ren Resp.2019.GT Distributors.pdf
	B17-027.Tabulation.pdf
	Tabulation





