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MISCELLANEOUS DESIGN SERVICES

INVOICE No.12
SERVICES FOR SEPTEMBER 1, 2018 TO SEPTEMBER 30,2018
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November 30, 2018

Mr. Richard Stolleis, PE

County Engineer

Fort Bend County Engineering Department
301 Jackson Street, 4% floor

Richmond, Texas 77469

Attention:  Stacy Slawinski, PE

Ref: US 90A @ SH 99; Purchase Order No. 153660
Invoice No.12

Dear Bassem:

The following is our status report for the US 90A @ SH 99 project for the period of
September 1, 2018 to September 30, 2018:

Work completed during reporting period
e Completed most of plans and details for the 90% submittal.
e Continued utility coordination and coordination with TxDOT bridge design
team.
¢ Working on general notes and quantity takeoffs.

Work planned for coming month
¢ Complete plans to 90% stage.

» Complete development of applicable details.
e Complete quantity takeoffs and summaries.
¢ Continue coordination with utilities and UPRR.
» Prepare for 90% submittal.
3131 Briarpark Dr., Suite 200 T 713 6221444

Houston, TX 77042 F 7139689333




Issues to be resolved

¢ None.

Sincerely,

b

Costas Georghiou. P.E.
Principal
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November 30, 2018

Mr. Richard Stolleis, PE

County Engineer

Fort Bend County Engineering Department

301 Jackson Street, 4™ floor
Richmond, Texas 77469

Ref: US 90A @ SH 99; Purchase Order No. 153660
Invoice No.12

Dear Bassem:

Attached please find our Invoice No. 12 for your review and processing. The invoice, in the
amount of $81,499.17, covers the period from September 1, 2018 to September 30, 2018,

Please let me know if you have any questions or comments.

Sincerely,

Costas Georghiou, PE
Praoject Principal

3131 Briarpark Dr., Suite 200 T 713622 1444
PGAL.COM Houston, TX 77042 F 713968 9333



Svatek, Donna

= T
From: Bassem Talje <Bassem.Talje@rpsgroup.com>
Sent: Friday, December 07, 2018 9:35 AM
To: Svatek, Donna
Subject: RE: [EXT] FW: US 90A @ SH 99; Invoice No. 13

Donna
We have no objection to Invoice 12, please move forward.

Thanks

Bassem Talje

Project Manager

RPS | Infrastructure

1160 N Dairy Ashford, Suite 500,
Houston, Texas 77079

USA

T +1281589 7257

F +1281 5897309

M +1832 921 3272

E bassem.talie@rpsgroup.com
W www.rpsgroup.com/usa

Formerly Klotz Associates

From: Svatek, Donna <Donna.Svatek@fortbendcountytx.gov>
Sent: Thursday, December 06, 2018 9:44 AM

To: Bassem Talje <Bassem.Talje@rpsgroup.com>

Subject: [EXT] FW: US 90A @ SH 99; Invoice No. 13

Please review and advise.

Thank you

Donna Svatek

Fort Bend County Engineering
281-633-7504

From: Costas Georghiou <CGeorghiou@pgal.com>

Sent: Thursday, December 06, 2018 8:15 AM

To: Svatek, Donna <Donna.Svatek@fortbendcountytx.gov>

Cc: Bassem Talje (Bassem.Talje@klotz.com) <Bassem.Talje@klotz.com>; Harris, Britten
<Britten.Harris@fortbendcountytx.gov>

Subject: RE: US 90A @ SH 99; Invoice No. 13




