
Vehicle # Qty Department Replacement/   
Addition

Unit Price Total Vendor Funding

12 1 Facilities - Building Maint. Replacement $25,159.82 $25,159.82 Helfman Ford 2019 Budget

3 1 Facilities - Building Maint. Addition $24,477.22 $24,477.22 Helfman Ford 2019 Budget

3 3 Facilities - IDC Replacement $24,477.22 $73,431.66 Helfman Ford 2019 Budget

5 1 Sheriff's Office - Detention Replacement $25,850.50 $25,850.50 Helfman Ford 2019 Budget

4 2 Sheriff's Office - George 
Academy

Replacement $24,723.00 $49,446.00 Helfman Ford 2019 Budget

5 1 Engineering Replacement $24,723.00 $24,723.00 Helfman Ford 2019 Budget

5 1 Library Addition $24,723.00 $24,723.00 Helfman Ford 2019 Budget

2019 Vehicle Orders
CC 11/6/18   Bid 18-022



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Classic 
Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Grapevine 
DCJ                         

Grapevine

Helfman 
Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman Ford             
Stafford

**Vehicle 3: Truck, 1/2 ton, Ext Cab,  SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 
locks), TTP

$21,998.00 $25,050.00 $23,959.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $22,477.22                               
within 3% from 
a local vendor

pursuant to 
§271.905

**Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, with Hard Cover, Cloth 
Bucket, No Console,  Power (windows, locks, mirrors), TTP

$26,588.00 $32,216.00 $27,449.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $25,850.50 

**Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket,  Power 
(windows, locks, mirrors),  TTP

$24,985.00 $26,569.00 $30,665.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $24,723.00 

**Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket, No Console, 
Power (windows, locks, mirrors),  TTP

$24,975.00 $31,316.00 $26,355.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $24,723.00 

**Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, Reg Cab,  LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, 
locks), TTP

$21,810.00 $24,239.00 $22,836.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $21,564.97 

*Vehicle 8: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, SWB, Cloth Split Bench, Power (windows, 
locks, mirrors), TTP

No Bid $26,196.00 $26,540.00 $26,505.00 No Bid $24,732.51 

Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles
Bid 18-022

Awarded 10/24/2017:  Low Bidder Per Vehicle
*Renewal and increase approved 8/07/2018 through 9/30/2019  **Renewal and increase approved 9/25/2018 through 9/30/2019



*Vehicle 12: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power (windows, locks), 
Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, Limited Slip, TTP, 8.42" min Ground 
Clearance

$24,976.00 $26,619.00 $26,717.00 No Bid No Bid $25,159.82 

*Vehicle 15: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, 4-Wheel Drive, Cloth Bucket, No 
Console, Power (windows, locks), Towing Mirrors, Integrated Brake System, TTP

No Bid $29,064.00 $29,356.00 Disqualiied:  
Does not meet 

minimum 
specifications

No Bid $29,018.85 
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