Tabulation
Bid 19-017
Purchase of Vehicles

Recommendation: Low Bidder Per Vehicle

Description Caldwell Country Classic Chevrolet Grapevine DCJ
Chevrolet Sugar Land Grapevine
Caldwell

Form 1295 Yes Yes Yes
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight, without console and dual batteries $31,475.00 $33,534.00 No Bid
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight, console and dual batteries $31,690.00 $33,734.00 No Bid
Vehicle 3: Truck, 1/2 ton, Ext Cab, SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, locks), TTP, Non Aluminum $22,775.00 $25,352.00 Disqualified: Does not
Bed Floor meet minimum specs
Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, No Console, Vinyl Bucket, Power (windows, locks), TTP, $26,046.00 $27,471.00 Disqualified: Does not
non aluminum bed meet minimum specs
Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket, Power (windows, locks, mirrors), TTP, Non $26,246.00 $34,132.00 Disqualified: Does not
Aluminum Bed Floor meet minimum specs
Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB with Hard Cover, Cloth Bucket, Power (windows, locks, $27,588.00 $35,627.00 Disqualified: Does not
mirrors), TTP, Non Aluminum Bed Floor meet minimum specs
Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, locks), TTP, Non Aluminum $23,590.00 No Bid $20,142.00
Bed Floor
Vehicle 8: Truck, 3/4 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, locks, mirrors), TTP, Locking $26,675.00 No Bid No Bid
Read Differential, Integrated Trailer Brake System, Non Aluminum Bed Floor
Vehicle 9: Truck, 3/4 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, locks), TTP, Front Tow Hooks, $26,375.00 No Bid No Bid
Limited Slip, 8.8" min Ground Clearance, Non Aluminum Bed Floor
Vehicle 10: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, locks), TTP, Locking Rear $26,250.00 No Bid No Bid
Differential, Front Tow Hooks, 8.78" min Ground Clearance, Non Aluminum Bed Floor
Vehicle 11: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, locks), TTP, Trailer Towing $26,280.00 No Bid No Bid

Mirrors, Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, Limited Slip, 9.6" min Ground Clearance, Non
Aluminum Bed Floor




Description Caldwell Country Classic Chevrolet Grapevine DCJ
Chevrolet Sugar Land Grapevine
Caldwell

Vehicle 12: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 Door Crew Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bucket, No Console, Power (windows, locks), TTP, $31,335.00 No Bid No Bid
Trailer Towing Mirrors, Front Tow Hooks, Integrated Trailer Brake System, Non Aluminum Bed Floor
Vehicle 13: Truck, 3/4 ton, 4 Door Crew Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bucket, No Console, Power (windows, locks), TTP, $31,335.00 No Bid No Bid
Trailer Towing Mirrors, Front Tow Hooks, Integrated Trailer Brake System, Non Aluminum Bed Floor
Vehicle 14: Ambulance Cab and Chassis, Reg Cab, Power (windows, locks) No Bid No Bid $39,980.00
Vehicle 15: Truck, 1 Ton, 4 Door Crew Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, locks), TTP, Rubber $32,695.00 No Bid No Bid
Floor Mats, Non Aluminum Bed Floor
Vehicle 16: Truck, 5500, Reg Cab, Dually, 4 Wheel Drive, Cab and Chassis Only, Vinyl Split Bench, Power $44,445.00 $45,246.00 Disqualified: Does not
(windors, locks), Trailer Towing Mirrors, Limited Slip, Tow Hooks, Integrated Trailer Brake System meet minimum specs
Vehicle 17: Truck, Colorado or Equal, Ext Cab, LWB, Cloth Bucket, Power (windows, locks) $23,475.00 $25,987.00 No Bid
Vehicle 18: Special Service Truck, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab, 4 Wheel Drive, Cloth, Power (windows, locks, mirrors), $28,945.00 $30,182.00 No Bid
TTP
Vehicle 19: Van, Cargo, 3/4 Ton, Extended Length, Panel Type, Rear AC, Vinyl, Power (windows, locks), TTP $25,725.00 $26,289.00 No Bid

within 3% from a local

vendor

pursuant to §271.905
Vehicle 20: Van, Cargo, 1 Ton, Extended Length, Panel Type, Rear AC, Vinyl, Power (windows, locks), TTP $27,820.00 $27,958.00 No Bid

within 3% from a local

vendor

pursuant to §271.905
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