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TERRA

ASSOCIATES, INC.
CONSULTING ENGINEERS

1445 North Loop West, Suite 450
Houston, TX 77008

713-993-0333
FORT BEND COUNTY ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT Invoice number 29000
Richard Stolleis, County Engineer Date 06/15/2018
301 Jackson Strest
Richmond, TX 77469 Project 0522-1802 Lake Olympia Parkway Segment #2
Billing Period through: May 31, 2018
Current Charges:
Professional Engineering Services $ 42,508.00
Professional Surveying / Consulting Services $ 17,570.00
Reimbursable $ 274.29
TOTAL AMOUNT THIS INVOICE: $ 60,352.29
OUTSTANDING INVOICES $ 0.00

BALANCE DUE: 60,352.29
Ok ,T55
BYo5)%
Aging Summary v
Invoice Number Invoice Date Outstanding Current Over 30 Over 60 Over 90 Over 120
29000 06/15/2018 60,352.29 60,352.29

Total 60,352.29 60,352.29 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

To insure proper credif, please include Project Number and Invoice Number on your remittance.
Payment due upon Receipt of Invoice.

FORT BEND COUNTY ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT Invoice number 29000 Invoice date 06/15/2018
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FORT BEND COUNTY ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT

Inveice number 28000
Date 06/15/2018
Project: 05221802 Lake Olympia Parkway Segment #2

Invoice Detail by Task

Contract % Billed Total Remaining Current
Description Amount To Date Biiled Balance Billed
Preliminary Design Totals - PO#
A01 Preliminary Design Services 429,130.00 14.00 60,078.00 369,052.00 60,078.00
A02 Preliminary Design Reimbursable Expenses 5,320.00 5.16 274.29 5,045.71 274.29
Subtotal 434,450.00 13.89 60,352.29 374,097.71 60,352.29
Final Design Totals
CO01 Final Design Services 529,900.00 0.00 0.00 529,900.00 0.00
CO02 Final Design Reimbursable Expenses 1,800.00 0.00 0.00 1,800.00 0.00
Subtotal  531,800.00 0.00 0.00  531,800.00 0.00
Bid & Construction Phase Totals
D01 Bid & Construction Phase Services 39,800.00 0.00 0.00 39,900.00 0.00
D02 Bid & Construction Phase Reimbursable 2,500.00 0.00 0.00 2,500.00 0.00
Expenses
Subtotal 42 .400.00 0.00 0.00 42,400.00 0.00
Additional Services Total
X01 ROW Parcel Maps 38,600.00 0.00 0.00 38,600.00 0.00
X02 FM 521 Signal 29,730.00 0.00 0.00 29,730.00 0.00
X03 CLOMR 60,440.00 0.00 0.00 60,440.00 0.00
X04 Additional Services Expenses 7,000.00 0.00 0.00 7,000.00 0.00
Subtotal 135,770.00 0.00 0.00 135,770.00 0.00
Total 5.27 60,352.29 60,352.29

1,144,420.00

1,084,067.71

FORT BEND COUNTY ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT

Invoice number 28000

Invoice date 06/15/2018
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Svatelk, Donna

From: Don Durgin <Don.Durgin@rpsgroup.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 03, 2018 11:50 AM

To: Svatek, Donna

Cc: Harris, Britten; Slawinski, Stacy; Jonathan Griffin
Subject: RE: Invoice Lake Olympia Parkway Segment #2
Attachments: 20180618135207268.pdf

Donna,

| recommend approval of this invoice. Please process for payment.
| will ask Terra to include the invoice sequence number on future invoices.

Thanks.

Don Durgin

Department Manager

RPS | Infrastructure

1160 N Dairy Ashford, Suite 500,
Houston, Texas 77079

USA

T +1281589 7257

F +1281589 7309

M +1713269 3913

E don.durgin@rpsgroup.com
W www.rpsgroup.com/usa

Formerly Klotz Associates

————— Original Message-----

From: Svatek, Donna [mailto:Donna.Svatek@fortbendcountytx.gov]

Sent: Thursday, June 21, 2018 7:19 AM

To: Don Durgin <Don.Durgin@rpsgroup.com>

Cc: Harris, Britten <Britten.Harris@fortbendcountytx.gov>; Slawinski, Stacy <Stacy.Slawinski@fortbendcountytx.gov>
Subject: [EXT] FW: Invoice Lake Olympia Parkway Segment #2

Good morning Mr. Durgin,

| was following up on the status of review and advise on this invoice.
Thank you

Donna Svatek

Fort Bend County Engineering
281-633-7504



