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- omsS (4
P.O. Box 1029
IVI O r Fulshear, Texas 77441
. e LS Telephone: (832) 252-8100

E-Mail: tkuykendali@civilcorp.us

March 15, 2018

Mr. Mark Dessens, PE
Schaumburg & Polk, Inc.
11767 Katy Freeway; Suite 900
Houston, Texas 77079

Re: Invoice No. 3066
Project: Katy Flewellen Road
P.O. Number: 130976

CivilCorp No.: 14-2-0170

Enclosed please find Billing No. 11 in the amount of $57,104.85for your consideration and
processing. The following items are attached: \

e Schedule of Values (SOV)
e Progress Report

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please call me.

Very truly yours,

Vo C Volttt

Thomas C. Kuykendall, Jr., PE
Vice President
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Katy Flewellen Road
Progress Report No. 11

Contractor: CivilCorp
Period of Performance: 11/01/2017 to 02/25/2018

Current Period Acfivities
1. Coordinated with adjacent project designers
Addressed 80% review comments
Addressed comments on ROW Documents
Submitted updated ROW Documents
Obtained additional survey information at north end of project
Updated design with additional survey information

NSOy wN

Next Period Activities
1. Address 95% review comments
2. Prepare and submit 100% design pians

Deliverables This Period
1. Updated ROW Documents—2/1/18
2. 95pct Submittal — 2/8/18

Deliverables Next Period
1. 100% Design Plans

Outstanding Issues
1. None

Submitted 95% Plans, Cross Sections, Bid Form, Specification List, Utility Table & Kmz

Page | 1



Svatek, Donna

T T PR PPTT]
From: Harris, Britten

Sent: Friday, March 16, 2018 10:58 AM

To: Svatek, Donna

Subject: FW: Katy Flewellen Rd Invoice

Attachments: 11_Invoice Package_Katy Flewellen_CivilCorp_180225.pdf

From: Elise Dillow [mailto:edillow@spi-eng.com]

Sent: Friday, March 16, 2018 10:05 AM

To: Peterson, Jillian <lillian.Peterson@fortbendcountytx.gov>
Cc: Harris, Britten <Britten.Harris@forthendcountytx.gov>
Subject: Katy Flewellen Rd Invoice

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Jillian,

Attached is CivilCorp’s invoice for Katy Flewellen Rd. | have reviewed the invoice and everything looks good. Please let
me know if you have any questions.

Thank you,

Elise Dillow | E.I.T.
p 281.920.0487 | f281.920.9924

SCHAUMBURG - POLK,

www.SPI-ENG.com

Report This Message as Spam to FBCIT

Report This Message as Phishing to FBCIT

Attach the message to the E-Mail

Right-Click the Spam/Phish message (not the text) copy and paste into the body of the new message. Should
show as an envelope under attachments.



