CC 02/13/18 Bid 18-022

2018 Vehicle Orders

Vehicle # |Qty Department Replacement/ | Unit Price Total Vendor Funding
Addition
6: Truck 2 |Office of Emergency 1=Replacement | $24,120.00 $48,240.00 Helfman Ford UASI Grant
Management 1=Addition




Tabulation
Bid 18-022

Purchase of Vehicles

Awarded 10/24/2017: Low Bidder Per Vehicle

Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grapevine Helfman Helfman Ford
Country Country Ford | Chevrolet DCJ Dodge Stafford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land Grapevine Houston
Caldwell
Form 1295 Yes Yes Yes N/A Yes Yes
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight, without console and dual batteries $30,990.00 No Bid $32,999.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight, console and dual batteries $31,445.00 No Bid $33,219.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Vehicle 3: Truck, 1/2 ton, Ext Cab, SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, $21,998.00 $25,050.00 $23,959.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $21,929.00
locks), TTP Does not meet
minimum
specifications
Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, with Hard Cover, Cloth Bucket,| $26,588.00 $32,216.00 $27,449.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $25,220.00
No Console, Power (windows, locks, mirrors), TTP Does not meet
minimum
specifications
Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket, Power $24,985.00 $26,569.00 $30,665.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $24,120.00
(windows, locks, mirrors), TTP Does not meet
minimum
specifications
Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket, No Console, $24,975.00 $31,316.00 $26,355.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $24,120.00
Power (windows, locks, mirrors), TTP Does not meet
minimum
specifications
Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, $21,810.00 $24,239.00 $22,836.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $21,039.00
locks), TTP Does not meet
minimum

specifications
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