Po # 150707
oms M 430432

Binkley Invoic
.- Barfield, inc. =

consulting engineers

Stacy Slawinski

Fort Bend County Engineering Dept.
301 Jackson Street, 4th Floor
Richmond, TX 77469

December 4, 2017
Project No: 0170000095.000
Invoice No: 30128

Project Manager: James Hornsby PE

Contract Number: 13102
Authorization Number: 150707
Total Contract Value: 398,453.00
Project Description: Fort Bend County - A. Myers Road Extension from Berdett Road to FM 762
i rvi fr r1. 2017 to November 30, 2017
Authorized Percent Invoiced Previously Amount
Billing Phase Budget Complete To Date Invoiced This Invoice

Ph | Basic Services: Preliminary 90,726.48 100.00 90,726.48 90,726.48 0.00

Eng.

Ph Il Basic Services: Final Eng. 200,507.52 100.00 200,507.52 200,507.52 0.00
Add'l Services: Geotechnical 8,586.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Add'l Services: Survey 38,100.00 100.00 38,100.00 38,100.00 0.00
Amendment #1: Add'l Design 17,367.00 100.00 17,367.00 17,367.00 0.00
Services
Amendment #1: Add'l Survey 6,850.00 100.00 6,850.00 6,850.00 0.00
Services
Amendement #2: Add'l Design 25,191.00 59.5451 15,000.00 0.00 15,000.00
Berdett
Amendement #2: Add'l Survey 11,125.00 0.00 0.00 / 0.00 0.00

Total Fee 398,453.00 368,551.00V/ 353,551.00 15,000.00
Total Fees: 15,000.00

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE:

$15,000.00
Ok, 755

)z/)z/n

| certify that the services are true and correct: Zm ﬂ‘[f\/m// Date: 12-5-| 2
J#es Hornsby, PE

Binkley & Barfield, Inc. | TBPE F-257 + 1710 Seamist Drive - Houston, Texas 77008 + Tel: 713.869.3433 | Fax: 713.869.6702 + www BinkleyBarfield com




- Barfield

consulting engineers

MONTHLY PROGRESS REPORT — November 2017

. Project

A. Myers Road Extension from Berdett Road to FM 762
Fort Bend County Project #13102

Il Work Completed to Date

Phase I: Preliminary Engineering
e No Activity was performed in this period.

Phase Il: Final Design
e Incorporated comments on 100% signed submittal.
e Modified and completed plans for Berdett Road widening. 100% submittal pending
survey completion and final design of drainage

Additional Services: Geotechnical
e Continued coordination of soil borings during this period.

Additional Services: Survey
e Survey of Berdett Road and FM 762 began on 11/30.

1. Work Planned for Next Period

Phase I: Preliminary Engineering
e No activity was performed in this period.

Phase IlI: Final Design
e Incorporate survey data as available.

Additional Services: Geotechnical
e Complete geotechnical investigation.

Additional Services: Survey
e Complete additional survey.

Issues Pending: none
Zwﬁv ﬂW Date: _12/5/17
Jmes Hornsby, P.Z

Project Manager




Svatek, Donna

et R S
From: Robert Barnett <rbarnett@lja.com>
Sent: Friday, December 08, 2017 12:05 PM
To: Svatek, Donna
Subject: FW: FW: PO#150707, Project #30128 - A. Myers Road Extension
Attachments: Invoice 13102.pdf

LJA Concurs. See email below.
Bob Barnett

Robert W. Barnett, P.E.
Vice President/Transportation

LJA Engineering | We Build Civilization
© West Houston

P: 713.953.5200

D: 713.953.5248

C:281.615.9683
www.ljaengineering.com

Facebook ¢ Twitter  LinkedIn

From: Robert Barnett

Sent: Tuesday, December 05, 2017 11:41 AM

To: Harris, Britten <Britten.Harris@fortbendcountytx.gov>

Cc: 'James Hornsby' <JHornsby @binkleybarfield.com>; 'Paul Voiles' <PVoiles@binkleybarfield.com>; 'Youssef Laham'
<YL@binkleybarfield.com>; 'Kevin A. Mineo' <kmineo@binkleybarfield.com>

Subject: FW: PO#150707, Project #30128 - A. Myers Road Extension [Filed 05 Dec 2017 11:41]

Britten,
LJA has reviewed the attached invoice for A Myers Road and concurs with the percentage of completion shown.

Bob Barnett

Robert W. Barnett, P.E.
Vice President/Transportation

LJA Engineering | We Build Civilization
© West Houston

P: 713.953.5200

D: 713.953.5248

C: 281.615.9683
www.ljaengineering.com

Facebook ¢ Twitter e LinkedIn

From: Accounting Corporate [mailto:Acct@binkleybarfield.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 05, 2017 10:15 AM
To: Jillian.Peterson@fortbendcountytx.gov
Cc: Robert Barnett <rbarnett@lja.com>; James Hornshy <JHornsby@binkleybarfield.com>; Paul Voiles
<PVoiles@binkleybarfield.com>; Youssef Laham <YL@binkleybarfield.com>
Subject: RE: PO#150707, Project #30128 - A. Myers Road Extension
1




Good Morning,

Attached is our November invoice and report for processing.
Confirmation of this email is appreciated.

Thanks,

Jaclyn Perez
Accounting Assistant

Binkley
- Barfield, Inc.

consulting engineers

L IEH B

1710 Seamist Drive
Houston, TX 77008

713.869.3433 Tel
713.869.6702 Fax

iperez@binkleybarfield.com

www.binkleybarfield.com

HOUSTON HQ - Gulf Coast Region | AUSTIN - Central Texas Region | PLANO - DFW Region
SERVING TEXAS COMMUNITIES FOR 40 YEARS.

This e-mail (to include any enclosures or attachments thereto) contains confidential and proprietary information that is protected under the Electronic
Communications Privacy Act, 18 USC Sections 2510-2521. If you are not the intended recipient, any further retention, dissemination, or duplication of
this message is strictly prohibited by law. Please notify the author if you received this transmission in error, and delete the message to include all
associated attachments and enclosures immediately.

Report This Message as Spam to FBCIT

Report This Message as Phishing to FBCIT

Attach the message to the E-Mail

Right-Click the Spam/Phish message (not the text) copy and paste into the body of the new message. Should
show as an envelope under attachments.



