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Telephone: (832) 252-8100
E-Mail: tkuykendall@civilcorp.us

CivilCorp

November 14, 2017

Mr. Mark Dessens, PE
Schaumburg & Polk, Inc.
11767 Katy Freeway; Suite 900
Houston, Texas 77079

Re: Invoice No. 3019
Project: Katy Flewellen Road
P.0. Number: 130976
CivilCorp No.: 14-2-0170

Enclosed please find Billing No. 10 in the amount 0f|$41,529.69(for your consideration and
processing. The following items are attached: ;

e Schedule of Values (SOV)
e Progress Report

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please call me.

Very truly yours,

Tio C ottt

Thomas C. Kuykendall, Jr., PE
Vice President
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Katy Flewellen Road
Progress Report No. 10

Contractor: CivilCorp
Period of Performance: 2/27/2017 to 10/31/2017

Current Pericd Activities

1.

N WN

Coordinated with utility companies

Coordinated with adjacent project designers

Meeting with SPI to review 80% comments 3/24/17

Began addressing 80% review comments

Addressed comments on ROW Documents

Submitted updated ROW Documents

Meeting with SPl and CenterPoint to review utility relocations 7/13/17
Began obtaining additional survey information at north end of project

Next Period Activities

1
2.
3.

Finalize survey at north end of project
Finish addressing 80% review comments
Prepare and submit 95% design plans

Deliverables This Period

1

ROW Documents

Deliverables Next Period

1.

95% Design Plans

Outstanding Issues

1.

None
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Svatek, Donna

SRS i
From: Harris, Britten
Sent: Woednesday, November 29, 2017 3:53 PM
To: Svatek, Donna
Cc: Peterson, Jillian
Subject: FW: Katy Flewellen Invoice
Attachments: 10_Invoice Package_Katy Flewellen_CivilCorp_171031.pdf
Donna,

You may process this invoice. No approval email is needed for this one. Just verify the numbers with Lawson and our
spreadsheet before giving to Stacy for signature. Let me know if you have any questions.

Britlen Harnis
Admin Assistant - Engineering
Fort Bend County Engineering
301 Jackson St. Ste 401 | Richmond Tx 77469

Britten.harris@fortbendcountytx.gov
Phone: 281-633-7539

From: Elise Dillow [mailto:edillow@spi-eng.com]
Sent: Wednesday, November 29, 2017 3:48 PM
To: Peterson, Jillian

Cc: Harris, Britten

Subject: Katy Flewellen Invoice

Jillian,

Attached is CivilCorp’s invoice for Katy Flewellen Rd. | have reviewed the invoice and everything looks good. Please let
me know if you have any questions.

Thank you,

Elise Dillow | E.I.T.
p 281.920.0487 | f 281.920.9924



SCHAUMBURG  POLK,

www.SPI-ENG.com

Report This Message as Spam to Microsoft

Report This Message as Phishing to Microsoft

Attach the message to the E-Mail



