INVOICE

Invoice Date: 10/02/2017
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Associated Testing Laboratories, Inc.
P:713-748-3717 F:713-748-3748
www.associatedtesting.com

Client Address: Fortbend County Engineering Customer No: 1435
Steven L Evans .
1124 Blume Road Job No: 17204
Rosenberg, TX. 77471 Project Desc.: Roadway Improvements to Sycamore Road from
Eaglewood Trail Dr. to Rabb Road in Fort Bend
County, Texas Precint 1

= ===== [nvoice Detail by Report == ===

Report No. Sampled Billing Description Unit Type Oty Unit Rate Amount
4 09/11/2017 Concrete Mix Design Review each 1.00 $115.00

Total for this Invoice: $115.00
ok, 5%

192217

Invoice Approved for Payment

/[L_,,__:g M,.C?\&.n-"

10/23/17

REMIT TO:Associated Testing Laboratories Due Upon Receipt
3143 Yellowstone Blvd.
Houston, Tx 77054

PAST DUE BALANCES SUBJECT TO 1.5% SERVICE CHARGE PER MONTH
PLEASE REFERENCE INVOICE NUMBER WITH PAYMENT



Associated Testing Laboratories, Inc
3143 Yellowstone Blvd
Houston, Texas-77054

Phone: 713-748-3717, Fax: 713-748-3748

ESTABLISHED 1959

Invoice Summary Sheet

Fort Bend County Engineering

Date: October 12, 2017

Attn: Steven Evans
1124 Blume Road

Rosenberg, TX 77471

Project Name: Roadway Improvements to Sycamore Rd from Eaglewood Trail Dr. to Rabb Rd.

Contract Amount GFS/WBS/P.0 No ATL Job No:
V' $19,387.00 Fort Bend Count, texas PCTI 17204
Date Invoice No Amount Invoiced Total Invoiced to date % of Budget used
v 09/01/17 17-8-000004 $700.25 $700.25 3.61%
V1010217 17-9-00007 $115.00 $115.00 0.59%

The invoice presented here is correct to the best of my knowledge. If there are any questions concerning the accuracy or validity

of thi%e Zj? representative ASAP.

Hossein Zandi, P.E.
CMT Project Engineer




Harris, Britten

s P Rkl R 2R O R T et
From: Vincent Jacob <vjacob@isaniconsultants.com>

Sent: Monday, October 23, 2017 1:22 PM

To: Slawinski, Stacy

Cc: Peterson, Jillian; Harris, Britten; zandi@associatedtesting.com

Subject: Sycamore Road Paving and Drainage Improvements; FBC Mobility Project No.13113
Attachments: Isani Transmittal for Testing Lab Invoice (10-23-17).pdf

Stacy,

Please find attached Testing Lab Invoice No.17-3-000007 from Associated Testing Laboratories, Inc., for work performed
on the referenced project.

It has been reviewed by us and we recommend payment.

By copy of this E-mail, Associated Testing Laboratories, Inc. is requested to take not of the comments (listing PO #,
correct mailing address, electronic submittal, etc.) below for future invoices.

Thanks,

VINCENT N. JACOB, PE / Managing Engineer
Isani Consultants L.P

m /832 477 6617 e /vjacob@isaniconsultants.com
o/713747 2399 f /713748 3748
a /3143 Yellowstone Blvd., Houston, TX 77054

ISANICONSULTANTS.COM

From: Harris, Britten [mailto:Britten.Harris@fortbendcountytx.gov]

Sent: Friday, October 20, 2017 3:36 PM

To: Vincent Jacob <vjacob@isaniconsultants.com>; zandi@associatedtesting.com

Cc: Peterson, Jillian <Jillian.Peterson@fortbendcountytx.gov>; Slawinski, Stacy <Stacy.Slawinski@fortbendcountytx.gov>
Subject: ATL: Sycamore

Good Afternoon,
Please see attached and approve or advise.

We will need to inform Associated Testing that we have received their invoice for processing, however please revise future
invoices to show the Purchase order number #157113. This is the second invoice that was forwarded to our office because
the mailing address they have is no longer correct. Please be advised that a hardcopy invoice is not required. When
submitting invoices by email be sure to include myself and Jillian Peterson (whom is copied) when sending electronically.
Electronic invoices are not required, however it is preferred. If you have any questions please let me know.

Future invoices may be addressed to:

Jillian Peterson
FBC Engineering



301 Jackson St. Ste. 401
Richmond Tx. 77469

Thanks!

Britten Farnnis
Admin Assistant - Engineering

Fort Bend County Engineering

301 Jackson St. Ste 401 | Richmond Tx 77469
Britten.harris@fortbendcountytx.gov
Phone: 281-633-7539




