Tabulation
Bid 18-022

Purchase of Vehicles

Recommendation: Low Bidder Per Vehicle

Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grapevine Helfman Helfman Ford
Country Country Ford | Chevrolet DCJ Dodge Stafford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land Grapevine Houston
Caldwell
Form 1295 Yes Yes Yes N/A Yes Yes
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight, without console and dual batteries $30,990.00 No Bid $32,999.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with spotlight, console and dual batteries $31,445.00 No Bid $33,219.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Vehicle 3: Truck, 1/2 ton, Ext Cab, SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, $21,998.00 $25,050.00 $23,959.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $21,929.00
locks), TTP Does not meet
minimum
specifications
Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, with Hard Cover, Cloth Bucket,| $26,588.00 $32,216.00 $27,449.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $25,220.00
No Console, Power (windows, locks, mirrors), TTP Does not meet
minimum
specifications
Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket, Power $24,985.00 $26,569.00 $30,665.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $24,120.00
(windows, locks, mirrors), TTP Does not meet
minimum
specifications
Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Bucket, No Console, $24,975.00 $31,316.00 $26,355.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $24,120.00
Power (windows, locks, mirrors), TTP Does not meet
minimum
specifications
Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, $21,810.00 $24,239.00 $22,836.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $21,039.00
locks), TTP Does not meet
minimum

specifications




Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grapevine Helfman Helfman Ford

Country Country Ford | Chevrolet DCJ Dodge Stafford

Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land Grapevine Houston

Caldwell
Vehicle 8: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, SWB, Cloth Split Bench, Power (windows, No Bid $26,196.00 $26,540.00 $26,505.00 No Bid $24,367.00
locks, mirrors), TTP
Vehicle 9: Truck, 3/4 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, 4-Wheel Drive, Vinyl Split Bench, $27,310.00 $26,847.00 $27,816.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Power (windows, locks), Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, Limited Slip,
TTP, 8.42" min Ground Clearance
Vehicle 10: Truck, 3/4 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, $25,490.00 Disqualiied: $26,727.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
locks), Trailer Towing Mirrors, Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, Does not meet
Limited Slip, Integrated Trailer Brake System, TTP, 8.8" min Ground Clearance minimum

specifications
Vehicle 11: Truck, 3/4 ton, Reg Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, $24,990.00 Disqualiied: $26,177.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
locks), Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, Limited Slip, TTP, 8.8" min Does not meet
Ground Clearance minimum
specifications
Vehicle 12: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power (windows, locks), $24,976.00 $26,619.00 $26,717.00 No Bid No Bid $24,788.00
Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, Limited Slip, TTP, 8.42" min Ground
Clearance
Vehicle 13: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, $25,275.00 $26,619.00 $26,717.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
locks), Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks, TTP, 8.78" min Ground
Clearance
Vehicle 14: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power (windows, $26,335.00 $26,849.00 $27,267.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
locks), Trailer Towing Mirrors, Locking Rear Differential, Front Tow Hooks,
Limited Slip, Integrated Trailer Brake System, TTP, 9.6" min Ground Clearance
Vehicle 15: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext Cab, LWB, 4-Wheel Drive, Cloth Bucket, No No Bid $29,064.00 $29,356.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $28,590.00
Console, Power (windows, locks), Towing Mirrors, Integrated Brake System, TTP Does not meet
minimum
specifications

Vehicle 16: Ambulance Cab and Chassis, Reg Cab, Power (windows, locks) No Bid No Bid No Bid $34,958.00 $34,199.00 No Bid




Power (windows, locks), TTP

within 3% from

a local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905

Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grapevine Helfman Helfman Ford
Country Country Ford | Chevrolet DCJ Dodge Stafford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land Grapevine Houston
Caldwell
Vehicle 17: Special Service Truck, 1/2 Ton, Crew Cab, 4WD, Cloth, Power $27,984.00 $29,458.00 $28,989.00 Disqualiied: No Bid $27,925.00
(windows, locks, mirrors), TTP Does not meet
minimum
specifications
Vehicle 18: Van, Cargo, 3/4 Ton, Extended Length, Panel Type, Rear AC, Vinyl, $26,425.00 No Bid $26,528.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Power (windows, locks), TTP within 3% from
a local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 19: Van, Cargo, 1 Ton, Extended Length, Panel Type, Rear AC, Vinyl, $28,125.00 No Bid $28,239.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid




CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES ForM 1295

1ofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY

Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no inferested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:

of business. 2017-272555

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

Caldwell, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity of State agency that Is a party fo the contract for which the form is 10/16/2017

being filed.

Fort Bend County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or |dentify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property 1o be provided under the contract.

#18-022

Vehicles
4 Nature of interest

Name of Interested Party City, State, Country {place of business) (check applicabls)
Contrelling | Intermediary

Knapp, Averyt Caldwell, TX United States X
Hildebrand, Jon Caldwell, TX United States X
Way, Stephen Caldwell, TX United States X
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. D
6 AFFIDAVIT

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

ID No. 125260244 Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Swormn lo and subscribed before me, by the said A\lﬁv\!‘\' ‘LWP , this the l b day of_Cj:O_DO_E

20 r-, . to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

hatls  Notany

Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.stale.tx.us Version V1.0.3337



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

FOrRm 1295
lofl
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business. 2017-272986
Caldwell Country Ford
Rockdale, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 10/17/2017
being filed.
Fort Bend County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

BID# 18-022
Vehicles
4 Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
Way, Stephen Caldwell, TX United States X
Hildebrand, Jon Caldwell, TX United States X
Knapp, Averyt Caldwell, TX United States X
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. D

g AF% | swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

KALYN M COMSTOCK

My Commission Expires
August 21, 2018

Signature of authorized agént of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

A
Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said m‘ "“" I Nl ‘7 . this the I " day of 00'15 “”

20 l’\ , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

sl Connaad  wanueSepasiaiic Qehany

Signature of oliicer administering oath Printed name of-affiter administering oath Title of officer admidistering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.3337



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES FORM 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Certificate Number:
2017-272701

Classic chevrolet Sugarland

Sugarland, TX United States

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.

Date Filed:

2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 10/16/2017
being filed.
Fort Bend County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.
18-022
Chevrolet vehicles

4

Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)

Controlling Intermediary

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

P

Signature of authorized #nt of contracting business entity
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AFFIX NO¥/

aw
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= T

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said \ew©O LPRANT

thisthe Mo day of UCTU ,
20\ 1\ , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.
%_\ R eORU e CAPCe, MANARY
Signature of oWﬂistering oath Printed name of officer administering oath

Title of officer administering oath
Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission

www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.3337



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

ForM 1295
lofl
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business. 2017-269306
helfman dodge
houston, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 10/06/2017
being filed.
FORT BEND COUNTY Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

18-022
vehicles
% Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. .
6 AFFIDAVIT

I swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

P | et
y : lSSIon Exp”es | / - g = (-;____.,_.--—-—.\._.—--._.._..,_.._.,__
November 1, 2018 )/ /d"r“ | et

S i Vi

" AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE 4

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said 5 o7 14/;/;9/7‘7 AT thisthe 4; B day of DC T ;z‘i" ]
20/ ’ 2 , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

KQVWM%QB QEfExQ;b Qg&\«ua M\‘I@

Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oaths Pt

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version v1.0.3337



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

ForM 1295
lof1l

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business, 2017-268741
HELFMAN FORD
stafford, TX United States Date Filed:
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 10/05/2017
being filed.
FORT BEND COUNTY Date Acknowledged:

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

18-022
vehicles
Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country {place of business) {check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
Check only if there is NO Interested Party. .
AFFIDAVIT

I swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

SRR, AMANDA PARKER

-_‘? .ﬁ Q” Z Notary Public, State of Texas - L il

Z4 'S Comm. Expires 06-12-2021 P, /7 O, s

S D 2 Y. o,
AN Notary |D 131 12?305 - Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

/: 4 £ - L

2
Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said _ |/, 7/ £ /775 78 A~ ,thisthe __9 day of CCTO 7
20___/ "7 . 1o certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

Q/'V\\kaxdbi M/\ fooair

Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath

wffr—"'

Title of officer administerin

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.3337



