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Stacy Slawinski

Fort Bend County Engineering Dept. September 28, 2017

301 Jackson Street, 4th Floor [iiviiee No: 29371
Richmond, TX 77469

Project 0170000095.00 Fort Bend County - A. Myers Road Extension from Berdett Road to FM
762; Purchase Order 150707 Project #13102

Authorized Percent Invoiced Previously Amount
Billing Phase Budget Complete ToDate  Invoiced This Invoice

Ph [ Basic Services: Preliminary 90,726.48 100.00 90,726.48 90,726.48 0.00

Eng.

Ph 11 Basic Services: Final Eng. 200,507.52 98.00 196,497.37 190,482.14 6,015.23
Additional Services: Geotechnical 8,586.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Additional Services: Survey 38,100.00 100.00 38,100.00 38,100.00 0.00
Amendment #1: Additional Design 17,367.00 98.00 17,019.66 16,498.65 521.01
Services
Amendment #1: Additional Survey 6,850.00 100.00 6,850.00 6,850.00 0.00
Services , 4

Total Fee v/ 362,137.00 v 349,193.51 V§42,657.27 6,536.24
Total Fees: 6,536.24

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE: $6,536.24

- . . ok,>7>
Email invoice to: Jillian Peterson at jillian.peterson@fortbendcountytx.gov
CC: Robert Barnett at rbarnett@lja.com, James Hornsby, Paul Voiles, and Youssef Laham )b//z/// 7
Requires monthly progress report, schedule & pmJecZ performance certification.

4‘4“»»’4/ Date: ‘(7-3*12

mes Hornsby, PE

[ certify that the services are true and correct:

Binkley & Barfield, Inc. | TBPE F-257 « 1710 Seamist Drive - Houston, Texas 77008 « Tel: 713.869.3433 | Fax: 713.869.6702 » www.BinkleyBarfield.com



Binkley
Barfield

consulting engineers

MONTHLY PROGRESS REPORT — AUG 2017

Project

A. Myers Road Extension from Berdett Road to FM 762
Fort Bend County Project #13102

Work Completed to Date

Phase I: Preliminary Engineering
e No Activity was performed in this period.

Phase II: Final Design
e Received and reviewed county comments on 100% signed submittal,
e Submitted ROW maps and Metes and Bound documentation and exhibits on 9/26/2017.

Additional Services: Geotechnical
e Continued coordination of soil borings during this period.

Additional Services: Survey
e No Activity was performed in this period.

Work Planned for Next Period
Phase I: Preliminary Engineering

e No activity was performed in this period.

Phase ll: Final Design
e Review and address any comments on 100% submittal.

Additional Services: Geotechnical
e Complete geotechnical investigation.

Additional Services: Survey
e No activity planned.

Isspes Pending: none

4 Date: 10/3/17

ames Hornsby, P.E.
Project Manager



Harris, Britten

From: Robert Barnett <rbarnett@lja.com>

Sent: Wednesday, October 11, 2017 3:03 PM

To: Harris, Britten

Subject: RE: FBC PO 150707 BBI inv 29301 - 170000095.pdf
Britten,

LJA concurs with the percent completion and charges shown.
Bob Barnett

Robert W. Barnett, P.E.
Vice President/Transportation

LJA Engineering | We Build Civilization
o West Houston

P: 713.953.5200

D:713.953.5248

C: 281.615.9683
www.ljaengineering.com

Facebook » Twitter ¢ LinkedIn

From: Harris, Britten [mailto:Britten.Harris@fortbendcountytx.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, October 04, 2017 12:07 PM

To: Robert Barnett <rbarnett@Ija.com>

Subject: FW: FBC PO 150707 BBl inv 29301 - 170000095.pdf

Can you please review and advise?

Britten Hannis
Admin Assistant - Engineering
Fort Bend County Engineering
301 Jackson St. Ste 401 | Richmond Tx 77469

Britten.harris@fortbendcountytx.gov
Phone: 281-633-7539

From: Peterson, Jillian
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 1:10 PM



To: Harris, Britten
Subject: FW: FBC PO 150707 BBI inv 29301 - 170000095.pdf

Will you check on this, please?

Jillian Peterson

Special Projects Coordinator

Fort Bend County Engineering

W. 281-633-7507
Jillian.Peterson@FortBendCountyTx.gov

ENGINEERING HAS MOVED TO 301 JACKSON STREET RICHMOND, TX 77469.

From: Ritch, Debbie

Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 11:47 AM

To: Peterson, Jillian

Cc: Kovar, Christie

Subject: FW: FBC PO 150707 BBI inv 29301 - 170000095.pdf

Jillian,

Binkley & Barfield were just verifying that we received this invoice. | didn’t see it received against your po, so | thought |
would forward it to you.

Thanks,

Debbie

From: Brenda G. Bates [mailto:BGB@binkleybarfield.com]
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2017 11:42 AM

To: Ritch, Debbie <Debbie.Ritch@fortbendcountytx.gov>
Subject: FBC PO 150707 BBI inv 29301 - 170000095.pdf

Debbie
Attached is invoice 29301
Thank you

Brenda G. Batesy
Accounting Associate
Corporate Office

~—= Binkley
' &  Barfield, Inc.
e_ipqsylting engineers

i

1710 Seamist Drive
Houston, TX 77008

713.869.3433 Tel
713.869.6702 Fax

bgb@binkleybarfield.com
www.binkleybarfield.com
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SERVING TEXAS COMMUNITIES FOR 40 YEARS.

This e-mail (to include any enclosures or attachments thereto) contains confidential and proprietary information that is protected under the Electronic
Communications Privacy Act, 18 USC Sections 2510-2521. If you are not the intended recipient, any further retention, dissemination, or duplication of
this message is strictly prohibited by law. Please notify the author if you received this transmission in error, and delete the message to include all
associated attachments and enclosures immediately.



