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Associated Testing Laboratories, Inc.
P:713-748-3717 F:713-748-3748
Wwww.associatedtesting.com

Client Address: Fortbend County Engineering Customer No: 1435
Steven L Evans .
1124 Blume Road Job No: 17204
Rosenberg, TX. 77471 Project Desc.: Roadway Improvements to Sycamore Road from

Eaglewood Trail Dr. to Rabb Road in Fort Bend
County, Texas Precint 1

= Invoice Detail by Report ======

Report No. Sampled Billing Description Unit Type Qty Unit Rate Amount
1 08/09/2017 sr. Engineer, P.E. (10 years Exp.) hour 2.50 $123.00 $307.50
1 08/09/2017 Vehicle Charge (per hr) hour 2.50 37.50 318.75
2 08/14/2017  Asphalt Mix Design Review each 1.00 $187.00 $187.00
3 08/31/2017 Asphalt Mix Design Review each 1.00 $187.00 $187.00

Total for this Invoice:

REMIT TO:Associated Testing Laboratories Due Upon Receipt
3143 Yellowstone Blvd.
Houston, Tx 77054

PAST DUE BALANCES SUBJECT TO 1.5% SERVICE CHARGE PER MONTH
PLEASE REFERENCE INVOICE NUMBER WITH PAYMENT



Harris, Britten
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From: Slawinski, Stacy
Sent: Wednesday, October 11, 2017 3:49 PM
To: Harris, Britten
Cc: Crawford, Wesley; Vincent Jacob
Subject: FW: Sycamore Road Paving and Drainage Improvements; FBC Mobility Project
No.13113
Attachments: 2017.09.07 Invoice 17-8-00004_ATL_Sycamore.pdf
Britten,

Please process the attached invoice.

Thanks,

Stacy Slawinski
stacy.slawinski@fortbendcountytx.gov
281-633-7508 office

From: Vincent Jacob [mailto:vjacob@isaniconsultants.com]

Sent: Wednesday, October 11, 2017 12:56 PM

To: Slawinski, Stacy

Cc: Crawford, Wesley; Peterson, Jillian; Harris, Britten; 'Hossein Zandi'

Subject: Sycamore Road Paving and Drainage Improvements; FBC Mobility Project No.13113

Stacy,
Please find attached Testing Lab Invoice No.17-8-000004 from Associated Testing Laboratories, Inc., for work performed
on the referenced project up to 8/31/17,

It has been reviewed by us and we recommend payment.
Thanks,

VINCENT N. JACOB, PE / Managing Engineer
Isani Consultants L.P

m /832477 6617 e /vjacob@isaniconsultants.com
o/713747 2395 /7137483748
a /3143 Yellowstone Blvd., Houston, TX 77054

ISANICONSULTANTS.COM



Harris, Britten
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From: Peterson, Jillian
Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 2:05 PM
To: Harris, Britten
Subject: FW: Parcel 002 ( 762 ) CC packet

Jillian Peterson
Special Projects Coordinator

Fort Bend County Engineering
W. 281-633-7507

Jillian.Peterson@FortBendCountyTx.gov
ENGINEERING HAS MOVED TO 301 JACKSON STREET RICHMOND, TX 77469.

From: Norton, Bryan

Sent: Tuesday, October 10, 2017 1:39 PM
To: Peterson, Jillian

Subject: FW: Parcel 002 ( 762 ) CC packet

See Below

Thanks,

Bryan Norton

Special Projects Coordinator

Fort Bend County Engineering

Office: 301 Jackson St. Richmond, TX 77469
Email: bryan.norton@fortbendcountytx.gov
Phone: 281-633-7529

Website: www.fortbendcountvtx.gov

From: Norton, Bryan
Sent: Thursday, October 05, 2017 3:23 PM
To: Spencer, Marcus
Subject: RE: Parcel 002 ( 762 ) CC packet

Parcel 6, | will correct the coversheet.

Thanks,

Bryan Norton

Special Projects Coordinator

Fort Bend County Engineering

Office: 301 Jackson St. Richmond, TX 77469
Email: bryan.norton@fortbendcountytx.gov
Phone: 281-633-7529

Website: www.fortbendcountvtx.gov




From: Spencer, Marcus

Sent: Thursday, October 05, 2017 2:53 PM
To: Norton, Bryan

Subject: RE: Parcel 002 ( 762 ) CC packet

Is this for Parcel 2 or 67

From: Norton, Bryan

Sent: Thursday, October 05, 2017 11:03 AM

To: Spencer, Marcus <Marcus.Spencer@fortbendcountytx.gov>
Subject: Parcel 002 ( 762 ) CC packet

Marcus,
Please find attached F.M. 762 Parcel 002 for your review and approval as to legal.
Thanks,

Bryan Norton

Special Projects Coordinator

Fort Bend County Engineering

Office: 301 Jackson St. Richmond, TX 77469
Email: bryan.norton@fortbendcountytx.gov
Phone: 281-633-7529

Website: www.fortbendcountytx.gov




