
Oil and Lubricants Apache Oil     
Company  

Pasadena, TX 

Arnold Oil 
Company 

Houston, TX

 A.J. 
Hurt/Reladyn 

Company 
Houston, TX 

 Midtex Oil  
Conroe, TX 

Lawson   
Numbers 

Form 1295 Yes Yes  Yes 

Per Quart in Quart Container  N/B  $                4.33  $                2.81  $                4.09 
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle  N/B  $              17.32  $              11.23  $              15.88 
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  N/B  $              10.78  $                9.66  $              12.89 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  N/B  $              10.15  $                9.25  $              11.90 

Per Quart in Quart Container  N/B  $                3.46  $                3.11  $                3.99 
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  N/B  $              11.13  $                9.78  $              12.89 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  N/B  $              10.50  $                9.35  $              11.90 
Per Gallon in Bulk  N/B  $                9.88  $                9.31  $              11.17 

Per Quart in Quart Container  N/B  $                4.01  $                2.55  $                3.76 
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  N/B  $              15.61  $                9.60  $              14.17 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  N/B  $              15.21  $                8.84  $              13.48 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $              44.45  $              11.65  $              11.10  $              11.14 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            488.95  $              11.15  $                9.84  $              10.15 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $                7.48  $                6.61  $              12.20 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $                6.85  $                5.94  $              11.21 
Per Gallon in Bulk  $                4.98  $                5.44  $              10.48 

SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400

SAE 30 Delo 400

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s requiring TO-4 Fluids)

Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)

Term: 1 October 2017 through 30 September 2018

Recommendation:  Sections 1 and 2 to Low Bidder per Item and                                         
Section 3 to Low Bidder per Subsection  

 Disqualified:       
Does not meet 
specifications. 

SECTION 1: Chevron Products          

Fort Bend County Tabulation
BID 18-009

Term Contract for Oil and Lubricants



Oil and Lubricants Apache Oil     
Company  

Pasadena, TX 

Arnold Oil 
Company 

Houston, TX

 A.J. 
Hurt/Reladyn 

Company 
Houston, TX 

 Midtex Oil  
Conroe, TX 

Lawson   
Numbers 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $              27.80  $                7.48  $                6.75  $              12.20 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            274.45  $                6.85  $                6.05  $              11.21 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $              44.95  $                8.42  $                7.74  $              10.88 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            462.00  $                7.79  $                7.07  $                9.89 
Per Gallon in Bulk  $                8.07  $                7.17  $                6.50  $                9.15 

Per Tube  $                3.17  $                3.15 
Per 35# Container  $            122.29  $            121.63 
Per 120# Container  $            413.25  $            411.00 

Per 35# Container  $              54.58  $              47.82  $              76.67  $              80.63 

Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5

Grease Ultra-Duty EP2

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-286-S)

TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)

SECTION 1: Chevron Products (cont'd)          

 Disqualified:       
Does not meet 
specifications. 

 Disqualified:       
Does not meet 
specifications. 



Oil and Lubricants Apache Oil     
Company  

Pasadena, TX 

Arnold Oil 
Company 

Houston, TX

 A.J. 
Hurt/Reladyn 

Company 
Houston, TX 

 Midtex Oil  
Conroe, TX 

Lawson   
Numbers 

Per Quart, in Quart Container  $                2.91  $                2.98  $                1.70 No Bid

Per Quart, in Quart Container  $                2.94  $                2.98  $                1.74 No Bid

Per Quart, in Quart Container  $                2.96  $                3.92  $                1.62 No Bid

Per Quart, in Quart Container  $                2.82  NA  $                2.89 No Bid
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail  $              10.99  $              13.23  $                8.71  $              18.17 
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $              42.55  $              10.54  $                7.90  $              12.89 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            441.10  $                9.92  $                7.20  $              11.90 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $              38.40  $              11.78  $              10.81 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            405.35  $              11.03  $                9.61  $              13.48 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $              42.80  $              11.47  $                9.60  $              14.17 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            444.40  $              10.72  $                8.83  $              13.48 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $              52.20  $              11.82  $              11.10  $              11.14 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            517.55  $              11.19  $                9.84  $              10.15 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $            157.10  $              36.01 26.71  $              40.33 

Per Quart, in Quart Container  $                2.94  $                3.39  $                2.45  $                5.00 
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail              $              58.20  N/A  $              10.81  No Bid 

SAE 5W-20 SM, GF-4  76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

SAE 5W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

SAE 10W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil

SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 SM Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend

SAE 10W 76 T5X 10

SAE 30 76 T5X 30

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train 76 HT-4 50 (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Specification)

Synthetic Transoil 50 GL-1/MP-1 (Eaton Roadranger PS-164 Rev 7)

Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid  

SECTION 2: Conoco/Phillips A108  



Oil and Lubricants Apache Oil     
Company  

Pasadena, TX 

Arnold Oil 
Company 

Houston, TX

 A.J. 
Hurt/Reladyn 

Company 
Houston, TX 

 Midtex Oil  
Conroe, TX 

Lawson   
Numbers 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $              27.60  $                6.04  $                6.61  No Bid 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            263.45  $                5.42  $                5.94  No Bid 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $              28.85  $                6.04  $                6.75  No Bid 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            291.50  $                5.42  $                6.05  No Bid 

Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail  $              46.60  $              11.69  $                7.74  $              10.88 
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            479.05  $              10.94  $                7.07  $                9.89 
Per Gallon in Bulk  $                8.27  $                7.25  $                6.50  $                9.15 

Per Tube, in Case lot  $                2.83  $                2.92  $                3.47  No Bid 
Per 35# Container  $            109.58  $            109.38  $            126.42  No Bid 
Per 120# Container  $            364.24  $            363.00  $            430.92  No Bid 

Per 35# Container  $              54.58  $              91.32  $              73.61  No Bid 
Per 120# Container  $            121.95  $            249.20  $            250.92  No Bid 

Per Quart, in Quart Container  $                3.34  $                4.62  $                2.45  No Bid 

Per Quart, in Quart Container  $                3.34  $                4.62  $                2.45  $                5.09 

Per Quart, in Quart Container  $                3.01  $                4.62  $                2.45  $                5.00 

Per Quart, in Quart Container  $                5.93  $                6.00  No Bid  $              10.66 

Per Quart, in Quart Container  $                6.78  $              11.13  No Bid  $              12.85 

Gear Oil 75W-90 Synthetic 

Hydraulic Oil ISO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-268-S)

Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers I-286-S)

TDH Oil Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere J20C)

Grease NLGI GC-LB Calcium Sulfonate

SECTION 2: Conoco/Phillips A108 (cont'd) 

Gear Oil 75W-140 Synthetic 

Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5/MP-1 76MP Gear Lube

Mercon VI Automatic Transmission Fluid  

ATF+4 Transmission Fluid  

Dexron VI Automatic Transmission Fluid



Oil and Lubricants Apache Oil     
Company  

Pasadena, TX 

Arnold Oil 
Company 

Houston, TX

 A.J. 
Hurt/Reladyn 

Company 
Houston, TX 

 Midtex Oil  
Conroe, TX 

Lawson   
Numbers 

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail  $                8.28  $              11.12  $                8.19 

Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            415.18  $              10.87  $                7.61 

Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            253.54  $                4.97  $            220.00  $                6.84 

Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail  $                5.89  $                7.68  $                6.06 

Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum  $            294.25  $                6.25  $                5.24 

Total of Subsection 3.3:  $       32,956.50  $         1,455.50  $         1,182.38 

O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, LLC - Disqualified:  Altered Terms and Conditions.
Sun Coast Resources, Inc. - Disqualified:  Altered Terms and Conditions.

Chevron Havoline Universal 50/50

Advance (Green) ready to use

Subsection 3.2

SECTION 4

Subsection 3.3

Antifreeze, ready-to-use

SECTION 3: Antifreeze

Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, ready-to-use

 Disqualified:       
Did not bid all in 

subsection. 

 Disqualified:       
Did not bid all in 

subsection. 

Item Removed

Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, concentrated

Chevron Havoline Universal 100%

Mobile Jet II Turbine Oil 

Subsection 3.1








