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. \ - - ; Telephone: (832) 252-8100

E-Mail: tkuykendall@civilcorp.us

March 21, 2017

B\ 22|\ 7

Mr. Mark Dessens, PE
Schaumburg & Polk, Inc.
11767 Katy Freeway; Suite 900
Houston, Texas 77079

Re: Invoice No. 2942
Project: Katy Flewellen Road
P.O. Number: 130976

CivilCorp No.: 14-2-0170

Enclosed please find Billing No. 9 in the amount of $32,552.83 for your consideration and

e Schedule of Values (SOV)
e Progress Report

If you have any questions regarding this invoice, please call me.

Very truly yours,

Vo € Valttt\)

Thomas C. Kuykendall, Ir., PE
Vice President
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Katy Flewellen Road
Progress Report No. 9

Centractor: CivilCorp
Period of Performance: 1/01/2017 to 2/26/2017

Current Period Activities

1.

ik wnN

Responded to FBC comments received 1/12/17 for additional right turn lanes at
intersection of Katy Flewellen Road and Gaston Road. '

Updated ROW at intersection and incorporated in ROW Documents
Coordinated with utility companies within project vicinity

Updated utility table with contacts and conflicts

Submitted ROW Documents

Next Period Activities

1.

2.
3.
4.

Update plans for additional right turn lanes at intersection of Katy Flewellen Road and
Gaston Road

Address review comments on 80% submittal

Address comments on ROW Documents

Submit updated ROW Documents

Deliverables This Period

1.

ROW Documents

Deliverables Next Period

1.
2.

Updated ROW documents
Updated Design Plans

Qutstanding issues

1.

CenterPoint Energy — Determine location of proposed power line easement (adjacent
to outfall channel south ROW or at Willow Lane)
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Harris, Britten

From: Peterson, Jillian

Sent: Tuesday, March 21, 2017 3:28 PM

To: Harris, Britten

Subject: FW: Katy Flewellen Invoice 9

Attachments: 09_Invoice Package_Katy Flewellen_CivilCorp_170226.pdf

Jillian Peterson

Special Projects Coordinator

Fort Bend County Engineering

W. 281-633-7507

Jillian. Peterson@F ortBendCountyTx.gov

ENGINEERING HAS MOVED TO 301 JACKSON STREET RICHMOND, TX 77469.

From: Elise Dillow [mailto:edillow@spi-eng.com]
Sent: Tuesday, March 21, 2017 3:28 PM

To: Peterson, Jillian

Subject: Katy Flewellen Invoice 9

Jillian,

Attached is CivilCorp's invoice for Katy Flewellen Rd. I have reviewed the invoice and everything looks good.
Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thank you,

Elise Dillow, EIT

Schaumburg & Polk, Inc.
(281) 920-0487 office



