Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 17-050
Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Type Road Materials

Term: April 1,2017 through March 31, 2018

Recommendation: Award to all bidders meeting specifications

Asphalt Stabilized Base, TXDOT 292, Black Base GR2 without RAP, Price Per Ton

Lawson 12985- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Lawson 12986- Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
laydown Materials James James
Const. Const.

Form 1295 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Plant/Pit/Siding 54.00 51.90 50.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.25 3.00 3.00
Ist mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20
Laydown No Bid 14.00 18.00 20.00
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 500 tons 800 tons

& 800 tons per day




Asphalt Stabilized Base, TXDOT 292, Black Base GR2 with RAP, Price Per Ton

Lawson 12987- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Lawson 12988- Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
laydown Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 49.00 41.90 43.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.25 3.00 3.00
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20
Laydown No Bid 14.00 18.00 20.00
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 500 tons 800 tons
& 800 tons per day
Cement Stabilized Sand, THD & PT #400.5 Portland Cement, Type I, 2 sack minimum, Price Per Ton
Lawson 12989- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North | Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 18.00 23.00
Plant to Jobsite- 1.74 3.08
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.20 0.25
Laydown No bid
Plant Location Richmond
Per 1/2 sack 2.50 3.00

cement




Flexible Base, must be free of foreign materils (asphalt, base, dirt, wire or any uncommon items), Type "A", Grade "'1", Crushed Concrete,
Price Per Ton

Lawson 12990- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North | Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Lawson 12991- Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
laydown Materials James James

Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 17.50 17.00 17.50 24.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.25 2.90 1.74 11.12
Ist mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20
Laydown No bid No bid No bid 18.00 40.00
Plant Location Mo City Katy Fresno Houston Port
Minimum $5.00 haul 15 tons| 500 tons 500 tons 25 tons
per day

Flexible Base, must be free of foreign materils (asphalt, base, dirt, wire or any uncommon items), Type "A", Grade "1", Crushed Concrete with 3%
cement added, Price Per Ton

Lawson 12992- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North | Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 26.80
Plant to Jobsite- 1.74
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.20
Laydown No bid
Plant Location Richmond
Minimum 15 tons




Gravel, River Unwashed, 5/8'" Diameter Maximum, Price Per Yard

Lawson 12993- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 16.00 18.50
Plant to Jobsite- 3.30 3.00
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.26 0.21
Plant Location Garwood Simonton
Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement, TXDOT 340, Type D without RAP, Sac B, PG, 64-22, Price Per Ton
Lawson 12994- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Lawson 12995- Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
laydown Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 63.00 56.00 56.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.25 3.00 3.00
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20
Laydown No bid 14.00 18.00 20.00
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 500 tons 800 tons
& 800 tons per day




Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement, TXDOT 340, Type D with RAP, Sac B, PG, 64-22, Price Per Ton

Lawson 12996- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Lawson 12997- Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
laydown Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 55.00 45.90 48.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.25 3.00 3.00
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20
Laydown No bid 14.00 18.00 20.00
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 500 tons 800 tons
& 800 tons per day
Hot Mix-Cold Laid, Asphaltic Concrete Pavement, Type D, TXDOT 350, Price Per Ton
Lawson 12998- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North | Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 105.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.00
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.20
Laydown
Plant Location Rosenberg

Minimum




Precoated Coverstone, PB-3, Price Per Ton

Lawson 12999- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Lawson 13000- Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
laydown Materials James James
Const. Const.

Plant/Pit/Siding 80.00 21.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.00 0.16
Ist mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.16
Laydown 25.00
Plant Location Rosenberg Dabney
Minimum 500 tons 25 tons

Precoated Coverstone, PB-4 & PB-5, Price Per Ton
Lawson 13001- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Lawson 13002- Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
laydown Materials James James
Const. Const.

Plant/Pit/Siding 80.00 22.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.00 0.16
Ist mile

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.16
Laydown 25.00
Plant Location Rosenberg Dabney
Minimum 500 tons 25 tons




Pulverizing Existing Asphalt and/or Base Road , Price Per Foot

Lawson number | American| Century [ Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
beside each item | Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Up to 2" Depth 2.00 2.50 2.50
13003
Up to 4" Depth 3.00 3.50 3.50
13004
Up to 6" Depth 4.00 4.50 4.50
13005
Up to 8" Depth 5.00 5.50 5.50
13006
Up to 10" Depth 6.00 6.50 6.50
13007
Up to 12" Depth 7.00 7.50 7.50
13008
Up to 14" Depth 8.00 8.50 8.50
13009
Pulverizing 9.00 5.00 5.00
Existing
13010
Contractor Credit 5.00
for Pulverized
Transported by 50.00 50.00 100.00
FBC
13011
Transported by 10.00 10.00 50.00
Contractors

13012




Recycled Asphalt, Screened, 3" Diameter Maximum, Price Per Ton

Lawson 13013- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 28.00
Plant to Jobsite- 1.74
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.20
Laydown No bid
Plant Location Fresno
Minimum 15 tons
Field Sand, Price Per Ton
Lawson 13014- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 12.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.00
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.21
Plant Location Simonton




Fly Ash, Price Per Ton

American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding
Plant to Jobsite-
Ist mile
Each add'l mile
Plant Location
Installation
Minimum
Fly Ash Stabilized Road Mix 50/50, Price Per Ton
American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding
Plant to Jobsite-
Ist mile
Each add'l mile

Plant Location

Installation




Texas ASPPM Grade IV Cold Mix - Road repair material, Price Per Ton

Lawson 13015- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 89.00
Plant to Jobsite- 1.00
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.23
Laydown
Plant Location Hempstead
Lime and Lime Slurry - TXDOT 264, Price Per Ton
Lawson 13016- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North | Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
31% Dry Solids 159.00
35% Dry Solids 159.00
46% Dry Solids
Type A Hydrated Lime, THD #264, 90.0% Ca(OH) 2 Min., Delivered in Closed Tankers, Price Per Ton
American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Delivered and
applied




Asphalt Aggregate, limestone Type D, 7/16" by #4 Graduation, Price Per Ton

Lawson 13017- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 32.00 27.50
Plant to Jobsite- 4.05 8.30
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.26 No Bid
Plant Location Rosenberg Mykawa
Type C, Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement: TXDOT 341, Class A Aggregates with PG7622 Oil, Price Per Ton
Lawson 13018- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 75.00 72.00 75.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.25 3.00 3.00
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 800 tons

& 800 tons




623 Traprock

Grade 3, THD #302, Price Per Ton

Lawson 13019- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 23.00
Plant to Jobsite- 0.16
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.16
Plant Location Knippa
Minimum 25 tons
623 Traprock, Grade 5, THD #302, Price Per Ton
Lawson 13020- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North | Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 23.00
Plant to Jobsite- 0.16
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.16
Plant Location Knippa
Minimum 25 tons




Bullrock, 3" x 5", Price Per Ton

Lawson 13021- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 23.00 21.00 26.50 35.00 35.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.25 2.90 1.74 4.05 10.00
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 0.20 0.26 No bid
Plant Location Mo City Katy Fresno Rosenberg Mykawa
Installation $5.00 haul No bid 20.00 No bid
Rip Rap, Grade 1, 12" to 18", Price Per Ton
Lawson 13022- | American| Century | Cherry | Durwood Gulf Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt | Crushed | Greene Coast North | Marietta | Division | Division | Construction| County
Concrete Stabilized | America of of Materials Asphalt
Materials James James
Const. Const.
Plant/Pit/Siding 30.00 26.00 32.00 55.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.50 2.90 2.74 12.00
Ist mile
Each add'l mile 0.25 0.20 0.20 No bid
Plant Location Mo City Katy Fresno Mykawa
Minimum $5.00 haul 15 tons 25 tons




CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES FORM 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY

Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:

of business. 2017-168034

American Materials, Inc.

Stafford, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 02/16/2017

being filed.

Fort Bend County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

Bid No: 17-050
Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Road Materials

2 Nature of interest

Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary

Loughrie-Moore, Brandy Stafford, TX United States X

Maynard, Stephen Stafford, TX United States X

Berry, Jerry Stafford, TX United States X

Greene, Jonathan Stafford, TX United States X

Greene, Daniel Stafford, TX United States X

Greene, Bradley Stafford, TX United States X

Greene, Jeffrey Stafford, TX United States X

Greene, Richard Stafford, TX United States X

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. D

8 AFEIDAVIT | swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

\’ i, STEVE L HEAD

Az .d(:lu"\-’ public, State of Texas J
(% erry L. Berry
iz .'-sllﬂf?/”‘;’ 5//
X35 comm. Expl N 20 \l-nQD-P-FGHdgFﬂ——
g business entl

‘& Notary 1D 13043500-0 / Sign@lre of authorized ﬁﬂ of contractin

v OF
"y
fmul\“ .....

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said J‘B‘(‘\"V\ Lv B 3\"\"‘&[ , this the /é @' day of Ebm?f&f#—

20 / , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office. (I

/k' Z M STEVE o. 1Rl NOTARY Pvi/c

’ Signature of officer admlnrstenng oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

Form 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

of business.

1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place

being filed.
Fort Bend County

2017-165531
Century Asphalt, Ltd.
Houston, TX United States Date Filed:
7 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 02/13/2017

CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Certificate Number:

Date Acknowledged:

OFFICE USE ONLY

Bid 17-050

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Road Materials

Nature of interest

4
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
Angel, Greg Houston, TX United States X
Angel, Gary Houston, TX United States X

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.

O

6 AFFIDAVIT

LINDA ROSALES
NOTARY PUBLIC-STATE OF TEXAS
COMM. EXP 04-28-2019

Wiy

o iy,
oY P Y
SePllls

o

£
KOTIT

NOTARY |D 128598463

[

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABQVE

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

/Signdtu% of\aglhoyéd agent of contracting business entity

Sworn feyand subscribed before me, by the said
20 l l , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

ph[(ip K(IU\\Q\J , this the qT{/dayof '%,h ,

(
namnd

ﬂa‘gﬁfw of officer administering oath

uda Q»S&Qﬂ/\/ Un&_a sales

Printed name of officer administering oath Title of bfficer admristering oath

Forms-provided by Texas Ethics Commission

www.ethics.state.tx.us

Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES FORM 1295

lofl

OFFICE USE ONLY
CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Certificate Number:
2017-167880

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.

Cherry Crushed Concrete

Houston, TX United States

2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is
being filed.

Fort Bend County

Date Filed:
02/16/2017

Date Acknowledged:

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a

3
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.
B17-050
Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Road Materials
4 Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
Cherry, Leonard Houston, TX United States X
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. I:]
6 AFFIDAVIT | swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.
R0, CHERYL NICOLE GRANTHAM
SFL 2 Notary Public, State of Texas
2o N, My Commission Expires
”'Z?? A October 10, 2017
' \?1ature of nzed agent of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said \ﬂQJ HD/FC}’?\/C/HU 0”&4!’0) this the /(/%Ll day of /?/9 ,

20 |/ , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

(o, C /}@ Y / gfmﬂ/ /(aﬂfk ﬁ/m,maé@ﬁ/
Signaﬂe of officer administering oath Prinied name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath
Version V1.0.277

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

FOrRM 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

OFFICE USE ONLY
CERTIFICATION OF FILING

of business.
Durwood Greene Construction Co.
Stafford, TX United States

1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place

Certificate Number:
2017-168043

Date Filed:

being filed.
Fort Bend County

2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is

02/16/2017

Date Acknowledged:

Bid No. 17-050

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Road Materials

Name of Interested Party

City, State, Country {place of business)

Loughrie-Moore, Brandy

Stafford, TX United States

Maynard, Stephen

Stafford, TX United States

Berry, Jerry

Stafford, TX United States

Greene, Jonathan

Stafford, TX United States

Greene, Daniel

Stafford, TX United States

Greene, Bradley

Stafford, TX United States

Greene, Jeffrey

Stafford, TX United States

Greene, Richard

Stafford, TX United States

Nature of interest
(check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. D

6 AFFIDAVIT

\\l:!!lrr,
.'\"1'\»‘“' "”

= Motary Pubhc

STEVE L. HEAD

. State of Texas

Comm, Expires 11-09-2019
Notary 1D 13043500-U

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said ;I%Y"(‘% L B ey

I swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

(G2rny

Jerry L. Berry
Vice President

ature of aulhcrlze

gent of contracting business entity

. this the {"éé day of E@m&;%

20_/ 2 , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of oﬂlcq

T B o s

Mo77e ) PUBL/C

Slgnature of officer admlnlstenng oath

Printed name of officer administering oath

Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission

www. ethics.state.tx.us

Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

FOorM 1295
l1ofl
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF EILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business. 2017-168684
Gulf Coast Stabilized Material LLC
Sugarland, TX United States Date Filed:
3 Name of governmental entity or State agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 02/19/2017
being filed.
Fort Bend County Purchasing Date Acknowledged:

description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

B17-050
Cement Stalbiized Sand

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a

Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) {check applicable)

Mature of interest

Controlling Intermediary

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.

6 AFFIDAVIT

ida Castillo
Notary 1D:11617663-

My Commission Expires:
December 23, 2019

b XD

b

o | swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

7

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

- » r .
Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said D a1 d L , ( )-"Ab L this the
201 7] . to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

20“" day of f‘_-cl“_m:d}( g

/- XM\ Dk L OGO R ez

Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath

Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us

Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

Form 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties.

Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties.

OFFICE USE ONLY
CERTIFICATION OF FILING

Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place

of business.
James Construction Group, LLC- Silva
Richmond, TX United States

Certificate Number:
2017-167889

Date Filed:

Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is

being filed.
Fort Bend County

02/16/2017

Date Acknowledged:

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

B17-050
Purchase and Haul of Earthen Road Materials

Nature of interest

Name of Interested Party

City, State, Country (place of business)

{check applicable)

Controlling

Intermediary

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.

.

£

6 AFFIDAVIT

Wiz,
\ i WY -"00"-’
S e
3 :
o

,)b OF 1*1}
’tnmu"

i

llr,

i

A
X
-~

Nt et Ay 0T

CAROLYN YVETTE GUTOWSKY
= Notary Public, State of Texas

£ Comm. Expires 03-23-2020

Notary ID 11151763

20

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

| swear, or affirm, undey pen

]

O

/

erjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

/Signefure of authorized agent of contracting business entity

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said K% )//7 TP ﬁ/l [//% ,Z?_/—

to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

Sig ture(/t)f officer administering oath _g//

mﬁM % ﬂﬂfﬁ/‘v%ﬁﬁf zé'/ 2y /ﬁwﬁ/é_’/ T AL AN

Printed name of officer administering oath

Title of officer administering oath

thisthe _/ 6 dayof Zﬁ/ﬁ{i c/ﬁ’f,\/

hY

Aot

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission

www ethics.state.tx.us

Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES ForMm 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY

Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:

of business, 2017-167887

James Construction Group, LLC- Tarmac Materials

Richmond, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency thatis a party to the contract for which the form is 02/16/2017

being filed.

Fort Bend County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

B17-050
Purchase and Haul of Earthen Road Material

3 Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) {check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. -
& AFFIDAVIT I swear, or affirm, under pen perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

i, CAROLYN YVETTE GUTOWSKY

SR p"s %

==‘°- Gz Notorv Public, State of Texas

=,w,}; 5. Comm. Expires 03-23-2020
oGS Notary ID 11151763

s

=5

K Sigyp Ature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Sworn to and subscribed hefore me, by the saiddé’mﬂ& %é y/?,ZZZ , this the /é day 0% /y//

20/ 2 , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

ij_/ M %/ %«b’/f/ ///’/ z: /«ﬁwé/[ L TS e s R (e

’ Signature of officer adm|n1stew‘{§ oath Printed name of officer admmlstenng oath Title of officer administering oath

Z= 8

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES FORM 1295

lofl
Complete Nos 1 -4 and 6 it tt OFF|CE 'S oLy
-4 and 6 it there are interested parnies

Complete Nos 1, 2, 3,5, and 6 if there are no interested parties CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of husiness entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:

of business. 2017-169669

Lhoist North America

Laporte, TX Urited States Date Filed:
2 g:_me :‘lf %overnmentai enfity or state agency that Is a party to the contract for which the formis 02/21/2017

ing filed.
Fort Bend County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.
B17-050

Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Road Material

4 Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) {check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
Sotelo, Armando Laporte, TX United States X
Sulak, Chrystal Laporte, TX United States X
5 Check only if there is NO interested Party. D

1 swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct

 ommiir o Mol St ol

ngnaﬂne of authorized agent of contracting business entity

Swom to and subscribed before me, by the said dc‘ v W’_& L 5 U'MJ (’J » this the _&ﬁﬁ_ _day of 4'%

20_1"_ | , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

Uu— eekolle Bonzalez ok

oath d Printed name of officer administening oath

- ef Y -
Signature of officer administ Title of officer admijistering oath

i ssion WWW.
Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commisst ethics.state tx,us Version V1.0277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

Form 1295
lof1l

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business. 2017-164999
Martin Marietta
Houston, TX United States Date Filed:
Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 02/10/2017
being filed.
Fort Bend County Date Acknowledged:

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

B17-050
Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Road Material

Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)

Controlling Intermediary

Martin Marietta Houston, TX United States X

Check only if there is NO Interested Party. D

A VIT .
FFIDA | swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

I L

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

———
;,,v'“"’ MICHELLE RUSSELL
‘gﬂobrv Public, Siate of Texas|
5, 5 Comm. Expires 0S- 17-2020
"'3""! Nofary ID 124927981

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

2 ; b T
Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said S‘]f Vg_.. \f\,!a F(, , this the }O—f ) day of EE&"!{H&_@

20 I < to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

J)\wf ff/ﬂi;{agwg/ff ‘/Hr(h(‘/)(_'i }2)/&(1’// Wﬁfam ])IJ b))&,

ignature of officer adnjnlstenng oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officiay-niﬁist'ering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

Form 1295
lofl
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business. 2017-161873
Vulcan Construction Materials LLC
San Antonio, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 02/03/2017
being filed.
Fort Bend County, Texas Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

17-050
supply aggregate materials

i Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) {check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
Vulcan Materials Company Birmingham, AL United States X
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. D
6 AFFIDAVIT

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of‘merjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

wa\\

\\_,‘ifgnature of authorized ?p'gnt of contracting business entity

ADELA WHITE
Notary Public, State of Texas
My Commission Expires
October 20, 2018 |

s oF L
it |

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Swaorn to and subscribed before me, by the said L e dm SR L\L this the ( day of Y"Q.k\)
20 A\, to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

(\llad )1/7/ Adel (Chie Nilara,

ﬁ',n‘é of officer admlms'f&fﬁb’oam "Printed name of officer administering oath Title of ofﬁ administering oath

._--.._,____

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www .ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

FOrRM 1295
lof1l
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business. 2017-165097
Waller County Asphalt, Inc.
Hempstead, TX United States Date Filed:
Z Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 02/10/2017
being filed.
Fort Bend County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

Bid 17-050 g Tl
Earthen Road Materials =
v Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
' Controlling Intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. .
6 AFFIDAVIT

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

oy,

Signatur¢’ of authorized agent of cont—ractinﬁ‘b*usiness entity

75

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said QJ'e/]ﬂf ,‘ Q{/ ,/\[1 F*’f [hIS lhe ﬁ(o HJK day of r’_& b{f ,LJ_sz_

20 { ;{ , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

{__/ §* o ) fon Ex : :;\
>Nl b ez £ Huser FamERy fible

Slgnatufé of officer administering oath " Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath

LY

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277





