
Vehicle # Qty Department Replacement/   
Addition

Vendor Unit Price Total Funding

1: Tahoe 1 Sheriff's Office Enforcement-
CID

Replacement Classic 
Chevrolet

$31,576.30 $31,576.30 2017 budget                                      
in lieu of 2 Fusions 
previously approved

1: Tahoe 3 Constable Pct 3-Contract 
Deputy-MUD 58

Addition Classic 
Chevrolet

$31,576.30 $94,728.90 MUD 58-CDC3

1: Tahoe 1 Sheriff's Office Cinco 
Southwest MUD 4 Contract 
Deputy

Addition Classic 
Chevrolet

$31,576.30 $31,576.30 Cinco Southwest MUD 4        
(previously approved for 
2016 model-no longer 
available)

1: Tahoe 3 Fire Marshal for City of 
Stafford in lieu of fire run 
reimbursement for 3 years

N/A Classic 
Chevrolet

$31,576.30 $94,728.90 Fire Run Reimbursement        
(previously approved for 
2016 models-no longer 
available)

4: Truck 2 Engineering 1 Replacement/ 1 
Addition

Helfman 
Ford

$25,099.00 $50,198.00 2017 Budget

11: Van 1 Animal Services Addition Classic 
Chevrolet

$27,072.75 $27,072.75 2017 Budget

13: Van 2 Library Replacement Classic 
Chevrolet

$25,362.25 $50,724.50 2017 Budget

Vehicle Order utilizing Bid 17-021
Commissioners Court 11/22/16



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Classic 
Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Grapevine 
DCJ                         

Grapevine

Helfman 
Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman Ford             
Stafford

Randall 
Reed's 

Prestige Ford    
Garland

Reliable 
Chevrolet            

Richardson

Tommie 
Vaughn 
Motors                                 
Houston

Form 1295 NA NA Yes Yes Yes Yes NA NA NA

Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe 
with spotlight, without console and 
dual batteries

$31,490.00 No Bid $31,576..30             
within 3% from 
a local vendor

pursuant to 
§271.905

No Bid No Bid No Bid Disqualified: 
Bid Explorer

$31,698.75 No Bid

Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe 
with spotlight, console and dual 
batteries

$31,665.00 No Bid $31,796.30          
within 3% from 
a local vendor

pursuant to 
§271.905

No Bid No Bid No Bid Disqualified: 
Bid Explorer

$31,698.75 No Bid

Vehicle 3: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, 
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Split 
Bench, Power (windows, locks, 
mirrors), TTP

$25,588.00 $26,643.00 $25,873.63 $26,397.00 No Bid $23,999.00 $25,340.00 $24,537.75 Disqualified: 
Did not include 

mats as 
required

Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, 
Crew Cab, SWB, with Hard 
Cover, Cloth Split Bench with 
console, Power (windows, locks, 
mirrors), TTP

$26,945.00 $27,443.00 $27,073.63 $27,597.00 No Bid $25,099.00 $26,840.00 $25,890.75 Disqualified: 
Did not include 

mats as 
required

Vehicle 5: Truck, 3/4 ton, Reg 
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power 
(windows, locks), Locking Rear 
Differential, Front Tow Hooks, 
8.42" Ground Clearance, TTP

No Bid $23,993.00 $25,131.85 Disqualified: 
Ground 

Clearance

No Bid $23,299.00 $23,440.00 $25,822.85 Disqualified: 
Did not include 

mats as 
required

Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles
Bid 17-021

Awarded Commissioners Court 10/25/2016:  Low Bidder Per Vehicle



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Classic 
Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Grapevine 
DCJ                         

Grapevine

Helfman 
Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman Ford             
Stafford

Randall 
Reed's 

Prestige Ford    
Garland

Reliable 
Chevrolet            

Richardson

Tommie 
Vaughn 
Motors                                 
Houston

Vehicle 6: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext 
Cab, SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, 
Power (windows, locks, mirrors), 
TTP

No Bid $25,510.00 $26,494.45 $24,951.00 No Bid $24,975.00  
within 3% from 
a local vendor

pursuant to 
§271.905         

$24,920.00 $27,440.45 Disqualified: 
Did not include 

mats as 
required

Vehicle 7: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext 
Cab, SWB, Cloth Split Bench, 
Power (windows, locks, mirrors), 
TTP

No Bid $25,595.00 $26,494.45 $25,521.00 No Bid $25,070.00   
within 3% from 
a local vendor

pursuant to 
§271.905

$24,960.00 $27,440.45 Disqualified: 
Did not include 

mats as 
required

Vehicle 8: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext 
Cab, LWB, 4WD, Cloth Bucket, 
Power (windows, locks, mirrors), 
TTP

No Bid $29,586.00 No Bid Disqualified: 
Seating

No Bid $29,050.00  
within 3% from 
a local vendor

pursuant to 
§271.905

$28,660.00 $29,451.75 Disqualified: 
Did not include 

mats as 
required

Vehicle 9: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext 
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power 
(windows, locks), Locking Rear 
Differential, Front Tow Hooks, 
TTP

No Bid $26,018.00 No Bid $25,488.00 No Bid $25,195.00 $25,430.00 $27,301.11 Disqualified: 
Did not include 

mats as 
required

Vehicle 10: Ambulance Cab and 
Chassis, Reg Cab, Power 
(windows, locks)

No Bid No Bid No Bid $34,833.00 $34,199.00 No Bid Disqualified: 
Engine

No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 11: Van, Cargo, 1 Ton, 
Extended Length, Panel Type, 
Rear AC, Vinyl, Power (windows, 
locks), TTP

No Bid No Bid $27,072.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid Disqualified:                 
Engine

$27,419.75 Disqualified: 
Engine

Vehicle 12: Special Service Truck, 
1/2 Ton, Crew Cab, 4WD,  Cloth, 
Power (windows, locks, mirrors), 
TTP

$28,540.00     
Modifying 

alternator at 
dealership

$28,983.00 Disqualified: 
Alternator

$26,195.00 No Bid $27,725.00 $28,600.00 $28,109.75 Disqualified: 
Did not include 

mats as 
required



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Classic 
Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Grapevine 
DCJ                         

Grapevine

Helfman 
Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman Ford             
Stafford

Randall 
Reed's 

Prestige Ford    
Garland

Reliable 
Chevrolet            

Richardson

Tommie 
Vaughn 
Motors                                 
Houston

Vehicle 13: Van, Cargo, 3/4 Ton, 
Extended Length, Panel Type, 
Rear AC, Vinyl, Power (windows, 
locks), TTP

No Bid No Bid $25,362.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid Disqualified:                 
Engine

$25,709.26 Disqualified: 
Engine
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