Tabulation
Bid 17-021
Purchase of Vehicles

Recommendation: Low Bidder Per Vehicle

Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grapevine Helfman Helfman Ford Randall Reliable Tommie
Country Country Ford [ Chevrolet DCJ Dodge Stafford Reed's Chevrolet Vaughn
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land Grapevine Houston Prestige Ford | Richardson Motors
Caldwell Garland Houston
Form 1295 NA NA Yes Yes Yes Yes NA NA NA
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe $31,490.00 No Bid $31,576..30 No Bid No Bid No Bid Disqualified: $31,698.75 No Bid
with spotlight, without console and within 3% from Bid Explorer
dual batteries a local vendor
pursuant to
8271.905
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe $31,665.00 No Bid $31,796.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid Disqualified: $31,698.75 No Bid
with spotlight, console and dual within 3% from Bid Explorer
batteries a local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 3: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, | $25,588.00 $26,643.00 $25,873.63 $26,397.00 No Bid $23,999.00 $25,340.00 $24,537.75 Disqualified:
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Split Did not include
Bench, Power (windows, locks, mats as
mirrors), TTP required
Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, | $26,945.00 $27,443.00 $27,073.63 $27,597.00 No Bid $25,099.00 $26,840.00 $25,890.75 Disqualified:
Crew Cab, SWB, with Hard Did not include
Cover, Cloth Split Bench with mats as
console, Power (windows, locks, required
mirrors), TTP
Vehicle 5: Truck, 3/4 ton, Reg No Bid $23,993.00 $25,131.85 Disqualified: No Bid $23,299.00 $23,440.00 $25,822.85 Disqualified:
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power Ground Did not include
(windows, locks), Locking Rear Clearance mats as
Differential, Front Tow Hooks, required
8.42" Ground Clearance, TTP




Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grapevine Helfman Helfman Ford Randall Reliable Tommie
Country Country Ford [ Chevrolet DCJ Dodge Stafford Reed's Chevrolet Vaughn
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land Grapevine Houston Prestige Ford | Richardson Motors
Caldwell Garland Houston
Vehicle 6: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext No Bid $25,510.00 $26,494.45 $24,951.00 No Bid $24,975.00 $24,920.00 $27,440.45 Disqualified:
Cab, SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, within 3% from Did not include
Power (windows, locks, mirrors), a local vendor mats as
TTP pursuant to required
§271.905
Vehicle 7: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext No Bid $25,595.00 $26,494.45 $25,521.00 No Bid $25,070.00 $24,960.00 $27,440.45 Disqualified:
Cab, SWB, Cloth Split Bench, within 3% from Did not include
Power (windows, locks, mirrors), a local vendor mats as
TTP pursuant to required
§271.905
Vehicle 8: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext No Bid $29,586.00 No Bid Disqualified: No Bid $29,050.00 $28,660.00 $29,451.75 Disqualified:
Cab, LWB, 4WD, Cloth Bucket, Seating within 3% from Did not include
Power (windows, locks, mirrors), a local vendor mats as
TTP pursuant to required
§271.905
Vehicle 9: Truck, 3/4 ton, Ext No Bid $26,018.00 No Bid $25,488.00 No Bid $25,195.00 $25,430.00 $27,301.11 Disqualified:
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power Did not include
(windows, locks), Locking Rear mats as
Differential, Front Tow Hooks, required
TTP
Vehicle 10: Ambulance Cab and No Bid No Bid No Bid $34,833.00 $34,199.00 No Bid Disqualified: No Bid No Bid
Chassis, Reg Cab, Power Engine
(windows, locks)
Vehicle 11: Van, Cargo, 1 Ton, No Bid No Bid $27,072.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid Disqualified: | $27,419.75 Disqualified:
Extended Length, Panel Type, Engine Engine
Rear AC, Vinyl, Power (windows,
locks), TTP
Vehicle 12: Special Service Truck,| $28,540.00 $28,983.00 Disqualified: $26,195.00 No Bid $27,725.00 $28,600.00 $28,109.75 Disqualified:
1/2 Ton, Crew Cab, 4WD, Cloth, Modifying Alternator Did not include
Power (windows, locks, mirrors), alternator at mats as
TTP dealership required




Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grapevine Helfman Helfman Ford Randall Reliable Tommie
Country Country Ford [ Chevrolet DCJ Dodge Stafford Reed's Chevrolet Vaughn
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land Grapevine Houston Prestige Ford | Richardson Motors
Caldwell Garland Houston
Vehicle 13: Van, Cargo, 3/4 Ton, No Bid No Bid $25,362.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid Disqualified: | $25,709.26 Disqualified:
Engine Engine

Extended Length, Panel Type,
Rear AC, Vinyl, Power (windows,
locks), TTP




2017 Vehicle Order utilizing Bid 17-021

Commissioners Court 10/25/16

Vehicle # [Quantity Department Replacement/ Unit Price Total Funding
Addition
2: Tahoe 1 Vehicle Maintenance Replacement $31,796.30 $31,796.30 2017 Budget
3: Truck 1 Sheriff's Office Detention Addition $23,999.00 $23,999.00 |2017 Budget
5: Truck 2 Drainage Replacement $23,299.00 $46,598.00  |2017 Budget
6: Truck 1 IDC Replacement $24,975.00 $24,975.00 |2017 Budget
6: Truck 1 Jones Creek Addition $24,975.00 $24,975.00 |2017 Budget
7: Truck 2 Sheriff's Office Enforcement [ Replacement $25,070.00 $50,140.00 2017 Budget
8: Truck 2 Sheriff's Office Enforcement | Replacement $29,050.00 $58,100.00  |2017 Budget
10: Truck 5 EMS 4 Replacement $34,199.00 $170,995.00 (2017 Budget

1 Addition
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CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

of business.
Grapevine DCJ, LLC

ForM 1295
lofl
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:

2016-119434

GRAPEVINE, TX United States Date Filed:
5 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 10/04/2016
being filed.
FORT BEND COUNTY Date Acknowledged:

17-021
NEW VEHICLES

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

Name of Interested Party

Nature of interest
City, State, Country (place of business) {check applicable)

Controlling Intermediary

TENNANT, BILL

Grapevine, TX United States X

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.

[

6 AFFIDAVIT

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said

QU A4

Signature of Offi ministering oath

b T e . -
\)e“'\\s e o , this the u day of @C‘l;c,\b‘t/,

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

Sos] (16

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

20 lb 1o certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

4»«_3—1‘- /W 5 %gj Q}’P/?é/—

Printed name of officer administering oath Title &f officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission

www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

FOrRM 1295
lofl
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business. 2016-118979
helfman dodge
houston, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 10/03/2016
being filed.
FORT BEND COUNTY Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

B17-021
vehicles
Nature of interest
P Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.
X

6 AFFIDAVIT

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

_ - T
// el ﬂ)
L s— ]
/ ’ //"7 L/__Q - e
& Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity
Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said / 3/ Y ¢ éf Tre Ak , this the 5 day of € 72200

20_1 {é , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

Lﬁﬂ_&@?ﬁfé EA R e &i&t M%.

Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering o

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277



CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

ForM 1295
lofl
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:

of business. 2016-118976

helfman ford
stafford, TX United States Date Filed:
5 Name of governmental entity of state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 10/03/2016
being filed.
FORT BEND COUNTY Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

B17-021
vehicles
. Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.
6 AFFIDAVIT

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

-

27_ > o
2L P = B

Signa(ur‘é"éf authorized agent of contracting business entity

ELIZABETH A WILLIAMS RIOS

My Commission Expires
November 1, 2018

w"‘raogﬁ‘#
- P & 2
Sworn tp’and subscribed before me, by the said / ; 2L / g ¢7/, yid e Mo thisthe :5 day of 47[7-2?44;/,7 ,
20 /. to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.
%@x TudNawms s CReice Y
Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering sa}h

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.277
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