
Vehicle # Quantity Department Replacement/   
Addition

Unit Price Total Funding

1: Tahoe 1 Sheriff's Office-Cinco 
Southwest MUD 4 Contract 
Deputy

Addition $33,900.00 $33,900.00 Cinco Southwest MUD 4 
Contract Deputy Program

1: Tahoe 3 Fire Marshal for City of 
Stafford in lieu of fire run 
reimbursement for 3 years

N/A $33,900.00 $101,700.00 Fire Run Reimbursement

2017 Vehicle Order utilizing Bid 16-024
Commissioners Court 10/25/16



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Classic 
Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Grande 
Truck Center                      
San Antonio

Grapevine 
DCJ                         

Grapevine

Helfman 
Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman 
Ford             

Stafford

Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with 
spotlight and dual battery

$33,395.00 No Bid $33,900.00                  
within 3% from a 

local vendor
pursuant to 
§271.905

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with 
console, spotlight and dual battery

$33,576.00 No Bid $34,309.00                      
within 3% from a 

local vendor
pursuant to 
§271.905

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 3: Chevrolet PPV Caprice 
with spotlight

$25,525.00 No Bid $25,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, 
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets, 
Power (seat, windows, locks, 
mirrors), TTP

No Bid $29,604.00 $26,097.00 $28,931.00 $30,314.00 No Bid $26,300.00 

Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, 
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets, 
Power (seat, windows, locks, 
mirrors), TTP, Plastic Running 

No Bid $29,804.00 $26,259.00 $29,136.00 $30,914.00 No Bid $26,515.00 

Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles
Bid 16-024

*Amended 10/27/2015
Awarded 10/6/15:  Low Bidder Per Item
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