Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 16-054

Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Type Road Materials

Term: April 1, 2016 through March 31, 2017

03/01/16: Award to all bidders meeting specifications

*Amended 5.24.16

Asphalt Stabilized Base, THD #292, Black Base without RAP, Price Per Ton

Lawson 12466- | American| Century | Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Greene Stabilized North Marietta |Division of | Division of | Materials County
Lawson 12467- Materials America James James Asphalt
laydown Const. Const.
Plant 56.00 50.00 Disqualified| Disqualified| Disqualified 46.70
Plant from Entire| from Entire| from Entire
Plant Bid: Bid: Bid:
Plant to Jobsite- 3.25 3.00 Failed to Failed to Failed to 3.00
1st mile provide Form| provide Form| provide Form
Each add'l 0.20 0.20 1295 1295 1295 0.20
Laydown No Bid 18.00 20.00 15.00
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum $5.25 haul 800 tons

& 800 tons




*Asphalt Aggregate, limestone Type D, 7/16™ b

#4 Graduation, Price Per Ton

Lawson 12493 | American| Century | Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Greene Stabilized North Marietta |Division of [ Division of [ Materials County
Materials America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.

*Plant Disqualified| Disqualified| Disqualified *'No Bid
Plant to Jobsite- from Entire| from Entire| from Entire No Bid
1st mile Bid: Bid: Bid:

Each add'l mile Failed to Failed to Failed to No Bid
*Plant Location provide Form| provide Form| provide Form *No Bid
*Comment 1295 1295 1295 *No Bid

Type C, Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement: THD #341, Class A Aggregates with PG7622 Qil, Price Per Ton

Lawson 12494- | American| Century | Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Greene Stabilized North Marietta |Division of [ Division of [ Materials County
Lawson 12495- Materials America James James Asphalt
laydown Const. Const.
Plant 95.00 72.00 Disqualified| Disqualified| Disqualified 65.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.25 3.00 from Entire| from Entire| from Entire 3.00
1st mile Bid: Bid: Bid:

Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 Failed to Failed to Failed to 0.20
Laydown No bid 18.00 25.00 | provide Form| provide Form| provide Form 15.00 | Rosenberg
Plant Location Mo City| Rosenberg 1295 1295 1295
Minimum $5.25 haul 800 tons

& 800 tons




Bullrock, 3" x 5", Price Per Ton

Lawson 12498- | American| Century | Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Greene Stabilized North Marietta |Division of [ Division of [ Materials County
Materials America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.
Plant 25.00 20.50 Disqualified| Disqualified| Disqualified 37.00
Plant to Jobsite- 3.25 2.90 from Entire| from Entire| from Entire 5.50
1st mile Bid: Bid: Bid:
Each add'l mile 0.20 0.20 Failed to Failed to Failed to 0.50
Laydown No bid No bid provide Form| provide Form| provide Form No bid
Plant Location Mo City Katy 1295 1295 1295 Stafford
Installation 20.00 No bid
Minimum $5.00 haul
*Rip Rap, Grade 1, 12" to 18", Price Per Ton
*Lawson 12499- [ American| Century | Durwood | Gulf Coast Lhoist Martin Silva Tarmac Vulcan Waller
material Materials | Asphalt Greene Stabilized North Marietta |Division of [ Division of [ Materials County
Materials America James James Asphalt
Const. Const.
*Plant *30.00 26.00 Disqualified| Disqualified| Disqualified 57.00
*Plant to Jobsite- *3.50 2.90 from Entire| from Entire| from Entire 5.50
1st mile Bid: Bid: Bid:
Each add'l mile 0.25 0.20 Failed to Failed to Failed to 0.50
Installation No bid No bid 20.00 | provide Form| provide Form| provide Form No bid
Plant Location Mo City Katy 1295 1295 1295 Stafford
Minimum $5.00 haul

Comment




CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES FORM 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY

Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:

of business. 2016-52680

American Materials, Inc.

Stafford, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 05/10/2016

being filed.

Fort Bend County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

Bid 16-054
Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Type Road Materials - Term April 1, 2016 through March 31, 2017

4 Nature of interest
Name of interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary
Berry, Jerry Stafford, TX United States X
Greene, Jonathan Stafford, TX United States X
Greene, Daniel Stafford, TX United States X
Loughrie-Moore, Brandy Stafford, TX United States X
Maynard, Stephen Stafford, TX United States X
Greene, Bradley Stafford, TX United States X
Greene, Jeffrey Stafford, TX United States X
Greene, Richard Stafford, TX United States X
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. D
% AERIDAVIT 1 sweatr, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.
F\q“;':ga,,, STEVE L. HEAD
See% Notary Public., State of Texos Jerry L. Berry
ok PN f8S Comm. Expites 11-09-2019 _ o :
"’:f,",:f,"“‘:}"\ Nofary ID 13043500-0 ature of authorized agéft of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

, this the /"7‘? day of MAY Y

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said
20_/ é , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of offi

/. /M TEVE ¢, HEAo MMOTARS PUAcse

Sidnalure of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.1021
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