
Vehicle # Quantity Department Replacement/   
Addition

Unit Price Total Funding

23: Explorer 1 County Attorney Replacement $24,650.00 $24,650.00 Insurance $12,033                                                
County Attorney $12,617

2016 Vehicle Order
Bid 15-028

Commissioners Court 05/10/16



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Classic 
Chevrolet 

Sugar Land

Helfman 
Dodge                      

Houston

Helfman 
Ford             

Stafford

Meador 
Dodge                

Fort Worth

Randall 
Reed's 

Prestige Ford          
Garland

Tommie 
Vaughn 
Motors                      

Houston
Vehicle 4: Non-Police Package 4-
Door Sedan

$18,342.00 Disqualified: 
Not as 

specified

No Bid $16,550.00 No Bid $17,300.00 No Bid

Vehicle 11: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended 
Cab, SWB, Vinyl Split Bench, Power 
(windows, locks), TTP

$25,640.00 $24,692.00 No Bid $22,765.00 No Bid $23,200.00 $23,789.77 

Vehicle 12: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended 
Cab, SWB, Cloth Split Bench,  Power 
(windows, locks), TTP

$25,640.00 $24,692.00 No Bid $22,850.00 No Bid $23,300.00 $23,885.77

Vehicle 13: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended 
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Split Bench, No 
Power, TTP

$25,490.00 $24,598.00 No Bid $22,100.00 No Bid $22,600.00 $23,227.67 

Vehicle 15: Truck, 1 ton, 4-Door 
Crew Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench & 
Flooring, Power (windows,lock), TTP

$28,545.00 $27,327.00 No Bid $26,175.00 Disqualified: 
Not as 

specified

$26,850.00 $27,451.77

Vehicle 19: Ford, Explorer Police 
Inceptor Utility, Cloth, Power (seat, 
windows, locks, mirrors), No 
Spotlight, No Backup Camera

No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,000.00 No Bid $24,950.00 No Bid

Vehicle 23: Ford, Explorer (or equal), 
Cloth, Power (windows, locks), TTP

No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,650.00 No Bid $25,400.00 $29,012.56

Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles
Bid 15-028

Awarded 10/14/14:  Low bidder per item as highlighted
Renewal approved 9/8/2015 through 9/30/2016
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