
Lawson 11936-
material                
Lawson 11937-
laydown     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant          56.00 50.00        46.70         
Plant
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

3.25          3.00          3.00           

     Each add'l            0.20 0.20          0.20           
Laydown No Bid 18.00        20.00        15.00        
Plant Location  Mo City  Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum  $5.25 haul  

& 800 tons 
800 tons

 Disqualified 
from Entire 

Bid:       
Failed to 

provide Form 
1295 

 Disqualified 
from Entire 

Bid:       
Failed to 

provide Form 
1295 

 Disqualified 
from Entire 

Bid:       
Failed to 

provide Form 
1295 

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 16-054

Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Earthen Type Road Materials 

Term:  April 1, 2016 through March 31, 2017

Recommendation:  Award to all bidders meeting specifications

Asphalt Stabilized Base, THD #292, Black Base without RAP, Price Per Ton



Lawson 11938-
material                
Lawson 11939-
laydown     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant          51.00 45.50        40.45         
Plant
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

           3.25 3.00          3.00           

     Each add'l            0.20 0.20          0.20           
Laydown No Bid 18.00        20.00        15.00        
Plant Location  Mo City  Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum  $5.25 haul  

& 800 tons 
800 tons

Lawson 11940-
material 

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile
     Each add'l 
Laydown
Plant Location
Per 1/2 sack 
cement 

Asphalt Stabilized Base, THD #292, Black Base with RAP, Price Per Ton

Cement Stabilized Sand, THD & PT #400.5 Portland Cement, Type I, 2 sack minimum, Price Per Ton    



Lawson 11941-
material                
Lawson 11942-
laydown     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant 17.50        18.00        
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

3.25          2.90          

     Each add'l 0.20          0.20          
Laydown No bid No bid 20.00        25.00        
Plant Location Mo City Katy
Minimum  $5.00 haul   500 tons

Lawson 11943-
material                  

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile
     Each add'l 
Laydown
Plant Location
Minimum

Flexible Base, must be free of foreign materils (asphalt, base, dirt, wire or any uncommon items), Type "A", Grade "1", Crushed Concrete with 
3% cement added, Price Per Ton

Flexible Base, must be free of foreign materils (asphalt, base, dirt, wire or any uncommon items), Type "A", Grade "1", Crushed Concrete, Price 
Per Ton



Lawson 11944-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant 18.50        
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

3.00          

     Each add'l 0.21          
Plant Location Simonton

Lawson 11945-
material                
Lawson 11946-
laydown     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant          63.00 62.00        51.70         
Plant
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

           3.25 3.00          3.00           

     Each add'l            0.20 0.20          0.20           
Laydown No bid 18.00        20.00        15.00        
Plant Location  Mo City  Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum  $5.25 haul  

& 800 tons 
800 tons

Gravel, River Unwashed, 5/8" Diameter Maximum, Price Per Yard

Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement, THD #340, Type D without RAP, Price Per Ton



Lawson 11947-
material                
Lawson 11948-
laydown     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant          58.00 52.00        44.50         
Plant
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

           3.25 3.00          3.00           

     Each add'l            0.20 0.20          0.20           
Laydown No bid 18.00        20.00        15.00        

Plant Location  Mo City  Rosenberg Rosenberg
Minimum  $5.25 haul  

& 800 tons 
800 tons

Lawson 11949-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant 105.00       
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

3.00           

     Each add'l 0.20           
Laydown
Plant Location Rosenberg
Minimum

Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement, THD #340, Type D with RAP, Price Per Ton

Hot Mix-Cold Laid, Asphaltic Concrete Pavement, Type D, THD #350, Price Per Ton



Lawson 11950-
material                
Lawson 11951-
laydown     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant 80.00         20.00        
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

3.00           0.16          

     Each add'l 0.20           0.16          
Laydown 25.00        
Plant Location Rosenberg Dabney
Minimum 500 tons

Lawson 11952-
material                
Lawson 11953-
laydown     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant 80.00         21.00        
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

3.00           0.16          

     Each add'l 0.20           0.16          
Laydown 25.00        
Plant Location Rosenberg Dabney
Minimum 500 tons

Precoated Coverstone, PB-3, Price Per Ton

Precoated Coverstone, PB-4 & PB-5, Price Per Ton



Lawson 11954-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile
     Each add'l 
Laydown
Plant Location

Minimum

Lawson 11955-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Delivered and 
applied 

Type A Hydrated Lime, THD #264, 90.0% Ca(OH) 2 Min., Delivered in Closed Tankers, Price Per Ton

Recycled Asphalt, Screened, 3" Diameter Maximum, Price Per Ton



Lawson number 
beside each item

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Up to 2" Depth 
11956

2.50          2.00          

Up to 4" Depth 
11957

3.50          3.00          

Up to 6" Depth 
11958

4.50          4.00          

Up to 8" Depth 
11959

5.50          5.00          

Up to 10" Depth 
11960

6.50          6.00          

Up to 12" Depth 
11961

7.50          7.00          

Up to 14" Depth 
11962

8.50          8.00          

Pulverizing 
existing     11963

5.00          4.50          

Transported by 
FBC     11964

50.00        100.00      

Transported by         
Contractors 
vehicles      

10.00        50.00        

Pulverizing Existing Asphalt and/or Base Road , Price Per Foot



Lawson 11966-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant 12.00        
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

3.00          

     Each add'l 0.21          
Plant Location Simonton

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

`

  Each add'l mile
Plant Location
Installation
Minimum

Field Sand, Price Per Ton

Fly Ash, Price Per Ton



Lawson 11967-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant
Delivered to 
jobsite
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile
  Each add'l mile
Laydown
Plant Location

Lawson 11968-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

31% Dry Solids
35% Dry Solids
46% Dry Solids

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile
  Each add'l mile
Plant Location
Installation

Lime and Lime Slurry - #264, Price Per Ton

 Disqualified:   
Vendor did 

not return 
addendum. 

Texas ASPPM Grade IV Cold Mix - Road repair material, Price Per Ton

Fly Ash Stabilized Road Mix 50/50, Price Per Ton



Lawson 11969 
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant 25.50        
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

No Bid

  Each add'l mile No Bid
Plant Location Mykawa
Comment D/F Blend

Lawson 11970-
material                
Lawson 11971-
laydown     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant          95.00 72.00        65.00         
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

           3.25 3.00          3.00           

  Each add'l mile            0.20 0.20          0.20           
Laydown No bid 18.00        25.00        15.00        Rosenberg
Plant Location  Mo City  Rosenberg 
Minimum  $5.25 haul  

& 800 tons 
800 tons

Type C, Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement: THD #341, Class A Aggregates with PG7622 Oil, Price Per Ton

Asphalt Aggregate, limestone Type D, 7/16" by #4 Graduation, Price Per Ton



Lawson 11972-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant 45.00        
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

No bid

  Each add'l mile No bid
Laydown No bid
Plant Location Stafford
Minimum

Lawson 11973-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant 45.00        
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

No bid

  Each add'l mile No bid
Laydown No bid
Plant Location Stafford
Minimum

623 Traprock, Grade 5, THD #302, Price Per Ton

623 Traprock, Grade 3, THD #302, Price Per Ton



Lawson 11974-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant          25.00 20.50        37.00        
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

           3.25 2.90          5.50          

  Each add'l mile            0.20 0.20          0.50          
Laydown No bid No bid No bid
Plant Location  Mo City Katy Stafford
Installation 20.00        No bid
Minimum  $5.00 haul   

Lawson 11975-
material                     

 American 
Materials 

 Century 
Asphalt 

 Durwood 
Greene 

 Gulf Coast 
Stabilized 
Materials 

 Lhoist 
North 

America 

 Martin 
Marietta 

 Silva 
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Tarmac     
Division of 

James 
Const. 

 Vulcan 
Materials 

 Waller 
County 
Asphalt 

Plant          25.00 26.00        57.00        
Plant to Jobsite-
1st mile

           3.25 2.90          5.50          

  Each add'l mile            0.25 0.20          0.50          
Installation  No bid No bid 20.00        No bid
Plant Location  Mo City  Katy Stafford
Minimum  $5.00 haul   
Comment

Rip Rap, Grade 1, 12" to 18", Price Per Ton

Bullrock, 3" x 5", Price Per Ton


	Sheet1

