
Delivery Points, Fees,                                                   
and Minimum Quantity

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants                                   

Elm Mott

Cleveland Asphault 
Products      
Shepherd

Martin Asphalt 
Company           
Grapevine

Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid
Rosenberg
Crabb
Fresno
Needville
Richmond
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee 
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge
Plant Location

Delivery Points, Fees,                                                   
and Minimum Quantity

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants                                   

Elm Mott

Cleveland Asphault 
Products      
Shepherd

Martin Asphalt 
Company           
Grapevine

Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid
Rosenberg
Crabb
Fresno
Needville
Richmond
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee 
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge
Plant Location

Fort Bend County Tabulation

AC-20, Asphalt Cement , THD #300  (price per gallon)    

Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Chemical Type Road Materials 

Term:  April 1, 2016 through March 31, 2017

Recommendation:  P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC

Bid 16-053

AC-10, Asphalt Cement, THD #300  (price per gallon)       

Disqualified from 
entire Bid:               

Failed to provide 
Form 1295

Disqualified from 
entire Bid:               

Failed to provide 
Form 1295



Delivery Points, Fees,                                                   
and Minimum Quantity

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants                                   

Elm Mott

Cleveland Asphault 
Products      
Shepherd

Martin Asphalt 
Company           
Grapevine

Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid
Rosenberg
Crabb
Fresno
Needville
Richmond
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee 
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge
Plant Location

Delivery Points, Fees,                                                   
and Minimum Quantity

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants                                   

Elm Mott

Cleveland Asphault 
Products      
Shepherd

Martin Asphalt 
Company           
Grapevine

Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid
Rosenberg
Crabb
Fresno
Needville
Richmond
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee 
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge
Plant Location

CRS-2, Cationic Emulsion, Rapid Setting, THD #300  (price per gallon)

MC-30 Medium Curing Type Cutback Asphalt, THD #300(price per gallon)



Fees and Minimum Quantity P Squared Emulsion 
Plants                                   

Elm Mott

Cleveland Asphault 
Products      
Shepherd

Martin Asphalt 
Company           
Grapevine

Undiluted Delivered   $                         2.00 
Diluted 12:1 Delivered  $                         0.25 
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000
Demurrage Charge  $80.00 per hour after  

2 hours 

Delivery Points, Fees,                                                   
and Minimum Quantity

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants                                   

Elm Mott

Cleveland Asphault 
Products      
Shepherd

Martin Asphalt 
Company           
Grapevine

Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid
Rosenberg
Crabb
Fresno
Needville
Richmond
Plant
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee 
Demurrage Charge
Plant Location

Delivery Points, Fees,                                                   
and Minimum Quantity

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants                                   

Elm Mott

Cleveland Asphault 
Products      
Shepherd

Martin Asphalt 
Company           
Grapevine

Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000
Rosenberg  $                         2.69 
Crabb  $                         2.69 
Fresno  $                         2.69 
Needville  $                         2.69 
Richmond  $                         2.69 
Plant  $                         2.44 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee 
Demurrage Charge  $80.00 per hour after  

2 hours 
Plant Location Elm Mott

Road Stabilizer (price per gallon)                

Prime Seal/Dust Control (price per gallon)           

SS-1 Emulsion used for dust control (price per gallon)                  



Delivery Points, Fees,                                                   
and Minimum Quantity

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants                                   

Elm Mott

Cleveland Asphault 
Products      
Shepherd

Martin Asphalt 
Company           
Grapevine

Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000
Rosenberg  $                         2.99 
Crabb  $                         2.99 
Fresno  $                         2.99 
Needville  $                         2.99 
Richmond  $                         2.99 
Plant  $                         2.74 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee 
Laydown Charge
Demurrage Charge  $80.00 per hour after  

2 hours 
Plant Location Elm Mott

Delivery Points, Fees,                                                   
and Minimum Quantity

P Squared Emulsion 
Plants                                   

Elm Mott

Cleveland Asphault 
Products      
Shepherd

Martin Asphalt 
Company           
Grapevine

Minimum Gallon Quantity 5000
Rosenberg  $                         2.82 
Crabb  $                         2.82 
Fresno  $                         2.82 
Needville  $                         2.82 
Richmond  $                         2.82 
Plant  $                         2.57 
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile
Plant to Jobsite-each add'l mile
 Restocking Fee 
Demurrage Charge  $80.00 per hour after  

2 hours 
Plant Location Elm Mott

Chip Seal Emulsion "CWE-2" (price per gallon)

ROC-P2 Road Over Coat


	Detail Pricing

