Office of County Purchasing Agent
Gilbert D. Jalomo, Jr., CPPB

301 Jackson, Suite 201 Office (281) 341-8640
Richmond TX 77469 Fax  (281) 341-8645
TO: Each Member, Commissioners Court

FROM: Debbie Kaminski, CPPB

Assistant Purchasing Agent
DATE: October 19, 2015
SUBJECT:  Bid 16-024 — Purchasing of Vehicles
Commissioners Court awarded Bid 16-024 on October 6", subsequently Grande Truck Center
sent a request to withdraw their bid for Vehicles 22 and 23 due to their error in reading the

specifications. Purchasing is requesting the Court accept the request from Grande to withdraw
their bid and award Vehicles 22 and 23 to the next low bidder, Classic Chevrolet.



From: Dave Parry

To: Kaminski, Debbie

Subject: RE: Fort Bend County bid

Date: Monday, October 12, 2015 9:42:10 AM
Debbie,

Please allow me to withdraw my bid for the two Transit vehicles in your bid No.16-024. | am very
sorry for any inconveniences this may have caused.
Thank you,

Dave Parry
210-666-7139 - Direct
210-288-4925 - Cell
210-666-7226 - Fax
dparry@grandetruck.com

.“.—. g

From: Kaminski, Debbie [mailto:Debbie.Kaminski@fortbendcountytx.gov]
Sent: Monday, October 12, 2015 8:24 AM

To: Dave Parry

Subject: RE: Fort Bend County bid

Received your voicemail, please send me an email withdrawing your bid for the 2 items.
Thanks

Debibie Haminsti

Debbie Kaminski, CPPB

Assistant County Purchasing Agent
Fort Bend County

301 Jackson, Suite 201

Richmond TX 77469
281-341-8643

281-341-8645 (fax)

Debbie.Kaminski@fortbendcountytx.gov

Let’s Go Astros!

From: Kaminski, Debbie


mailto:dparry@grandetruck.com
mailto:Debbie.Kaminski@fortbendcountytx.gov
mailto:Debbie.Kaminski@fortbendcountytx.gov

Tabulation
Bid 16-024

Purchase of Vehicles

Awarded 10/6/15: Low Bidder Per Item

*Amended 10/27/2015

Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grande Grapevine Helfman Helfman
Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet |Truck Center DCJ Dodge Ford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | San Antonio | Grapevine Houston Stafford
Caldwell
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with| $33,395.00 No Bid $33,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
spotlight and dual battery within 3% from a
local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with| $33,576.00 No Bid $34,309.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
console, spotlight and dual battery within 3% from a
local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 3: Chevrolet PPV Caprice $25,525.00 No Bid $25,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
with spotlight
Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, No Bid $29,604.00 | $26,097.00 | $28,931.00 | $30,314.00 No Bid $26,300.00
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets,
Power (seat, windows, locks,
mirrors), TTP
Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, No Bid $29,804.00 | $26,259.00 | $29,136.00 | $30,914.00 No Bid $26,515.00
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets,
Power (seat, windows, locks,
mirrors), TTP, Plastic Running




Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grande Grapevine Helfman Helfman
Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet |Truck Center DCJ Dodge Ford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | San Antonio | Grapevine Houston Stafford
Caldwell
Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, No Bid $30,904.00 | $26,097.00 | $29,742.00 | $31,814.00 No Bid $27,415.00
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets,
Power (seat, windows, locks,
mirrors), TTP, Lockable Hard Cover
Vehicle 8: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, No Bid $31,104.00 | $27,618.00 | $29,947.00 | $32,414.00 No Bid $27,630.00
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets,
Power (seat, windows, locks,
mirrors), TTP, Lockable Hard Cover,
Plastic Running Boards
Vehicle 9: Truck, 1/2 ton, Extended No Bid $24,279.00 | Disqualified: | $24,508.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $22,000.00
Cab, SWB, Cloth bench, Power Does not meet Does not meet
(windows, locks), TTP specifications specifications
Vehicle 10: Truck, 1/2 ton, Extended No Bid $24,279.00 | Disqualified: | $24,508.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $22,000.00
Cab, SWB, Vinyl Bench, Power Does not meet Does not meet
(windows, locks), TTP specifications specifications
Vehicle 11: Truck, 1/2 ton, Extended No Bid Disqualified: No Bid $23,407.00 No Bid No Bid $24,070.00
Cab, SWB, Vinyl Bench, Power Does not meet within 3% from a
(seats, windows, locks), TTP specifications local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 12: Truck, 1/2 ton, Regular No Bid No Bid $19,538.00 | $26,364.00 | $20,614.00 No Bid $20,990.00
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power
(windows, locks), TTP
Vehicle 13: Truck, 3/4 ton, Regular No Bid Disqualified: | $24,426.00 | $25,436.00 | Disqualified: No Bid No Bid

Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, TTP, 8.78"
min ground clearance, locking rear
differential

Does not meet
specifications

Does not meet
specifications




Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grande Grapevine Helfman Helfman
Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet |Truck Center DCJ Dodge Ford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | San Antonio | Grapevine Houston Stafford
Caldwell
Vehicle 14: Truck, 3/4 ton, Regular | $26,445.00 | $26,625.00 $26,591.00 | $25,703.00 | $26,229.00 No Bid $24,175.00
Cab, LWB, 4WD, Vinyl Bench, TTP,
locking rear differential
Vehicle 15: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended No Bid $26,393.00 $26,187.00 | $26,161.00 No Bid No Bid $22,940.00
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Seats and Flooring,
Power (windows, locks), TTP
Vehicle 16: Truck, 3/4 ton, Regular | $24,929.00 No Bid $25,070.00 | $26,166.00 | Disqualified: No Bid No Bid
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power within 3% from a Does not meet
(windows, locks), TTP, 8.78" min local vendor specifications
ground clearance, locking rear pursuant to
: . §271.905
differential, front tow hooks
Vehicle 17: Truck, 3/4 ton, Regular No Bid No Bid No Bid $25,565.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $24,500.00
Cab, LWB, Cab and Chassis, Vinyl, Does not meet 1ton
Power (windows, locks), TTP specifications
Vehicle 18: Ambulance Cab and No Bid No Bid No Bid $41,878.00 | $37,660.00 $38,313.00 No Bid
Chassis, Regular Cab within 3% from a
local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 19: Truck, Ford, F-150, Crew No Bid $26,467.00 No Bid $27,022.00 No Bid No Bid $24,100.00

Cab, Special Service Truck, Cloth,
Power (windows, locks, mirrors),
TTP




Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grande Grapevine Helfman Helfman

Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet |Truck Center DCJ Dodge Ford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | San Antonio | Grapevine Houston Stafford
Caldwell

Vehicle 20: Truck, Ford, 1/2 Ton, No Bid $27,767.00 No Bid $26,863.00 No Bid No Bid $25,215.00

Crew Cab, Special Service, Cloth,

Power (windows, locks, mirrors),

TTP, Lockable Hard Cover to Match

Vehicle 21: Truck, 1/2 ton, Crew No Bid $26,467.00 No Bid $27,022.00 | $25,501.00 No Bid $24,100.00

Cab, Special Service, Cloth, Power

(windows, locks, mirrors), TTP

Vehicle 22: Van, 15 Passenger, 1 No Bid No Bid *$39,174.00 *Vendor No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ton, Extended Length, Vinyl Seating, withdrew bid,

Power (windows, locks), Rear AC, not to spec

TTP

Vehicle 23: Van, Cargo, 1 Ton, No Bid No Bid *$36,772.00 *Vendor No Bid No Bid No Bid

Extended Length, Vinyl Seating, withdrew bid,

Power (windows, locks), Rear AC, not to spec

TTP

Vehicle 24: Truck, F550, Regular No Bid $40,262.00 No Bid $39,920.00 | $40,857.00 No Bid $37,450.00

Cab, Cab and Chassis, Vinyl, Power
(windows, locks), TTP
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