Tabulation
Bid 16-024
Purchase of Vehicles

Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grande Grapevine Helfman Helfman
Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet |Truck Center DCJ Dodge Ford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | San Antonio | Grapevine Houston Stafford
Caldwell
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with| $33,395.00 No Bid $33,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
spotlight and dual battery within 3% from a
local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with| $33,576.00 No Bid $34,309.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
console, spotlight and dual battery within 3% from a
local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 3: Chevrolet PPV Caprice $25,525.00 No Bid $25,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
with spotlight
Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, No Bid $29,604.00 | $26,097.00 | $28,931.00 | $30,314.00 No Bid $26,300.00
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets,
Power (seat, windows, locks,
mirrors), TTP
Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, No Bid $29,804.00 | $26,259.00 | $29,136.00 | $30,914.00 No Bid $26,515.00
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets,
Power (seat, windows, locks,
mirrors), TTP, Plastic Running




Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grande Grapevine Helfman Helfman
Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet |Truck Center DCJ Dodge Ford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | San Antonio | Grapevine Houston Stafford
Caldwell
Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, No Bid $30,904.00 | $26,097.00 | $29,742.00 | $31,814.00 No Bid $27,415.00
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets,
Power (seat, windows, locks,
mirrors), TTP, Lockable Hard Cover
Vehicle 8: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, No Bid $31,104.00 | $27,618.00 | $29,947.00 | $32,414.00 No Bid $27,630.00
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets,
Power (seat, windows, locks,
mirrors), TTP, Lockable Hard Cover,
Plastic Running Boards
Vehicle 9: Truck, 1/2 ton, Extended No Bid $24,279.00 | Disqualified: | $24,508.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $22,000.00
Cab, SWB, Cloth bench, Power Does not meet Does not meet
(windows, locks), TTP specifications specifications
Vehicle 10: Truck, 1/2 ton, Extended No Bid $24,279.00 | Disqualified: | $24,508.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $22,000.00
Cab, SWB, Vinyl Bench, Power Does not meet Does not meet
(windows, locks), TTP specifications specifications
Vehicle 11: Truck, 1/2 ton, Extended No Bid Disqualified: No Bid $23,407.00 No Bid No Bid $24,070.00
Cab, SWB, Vinyl Bench, Power Does not meet within 3% from a
(seats, windows, locks), TTP specifications local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 12: Truck, 1/2 ton, Regular No Bid No Bid $19,538.00 | $26,364.00 | $20,614.00 No Bid $20,990.00
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power
(windows, locks), TTP
Vehicle 13: Truck, 3/4 ton, Regular No Bid Disqualified: | $24,426.00 | $25,436.00 | Disqualified: No Bid No Bid

Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, TTP, 8.78"
min ground clearance, locking rear
differential

Does not meet
specifications

Does not meet
specifications




Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grande Grapevine Helfman Helfman
Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet |Truck Center DCJ Dodge Ford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | San Antonio | Grapevine Houston Stafford
Caldwell
Vehicle 14: Truck, 3/4 ton, Regular | $26,445.00 | $26,625.00 $26,591.00 | $25,703.00 | $26,229.00 No Bid $24,175.00
Cab, LWB, 4WD, Vinyl Bench, TTP,
locking rear differential
Vehicle 15: Truck, 3/4 ton, Extended No Bid $26,393.00 $26,187.00 | $26,161.00 No Bid No Bid $22,940.00
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Seats and Flooring,
Power (windows, locks), TTP
Vehicle 16: Truck, 3/4 ton, Regular | $24,929.00 No Bid $25,070.00 | $26,166.00 | Disqualified: No Bid No Bid
Cab, LWB, Vinyl Bench, Power within 3% from a Does not meet
(windows, locks), TTP, 8.78" min local vendor specifications
ground clearance, locking rear pursuant to
_ . §271.905
differential, front tow hooks
Vehicle 17: Truck, 3/4 ton, Regular No Bid No Bid No Bid $25,565.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $24,500.00
Cab, LWB, Cab and Chassis, Vinyl, Does not meet 1ton
Power (windows, locks), TTP specifications
Vehicle 18: Ambulance Cab and No Bid No Bid No Bid $41,878.00 | $37,660.00 $38,313.00 No Bid
Chassis, Regular Cab within 3% from a
local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 19: Truck, Ford, F-150, Crew No Bid $26,467.00 No Bid $27,022.00 No Bid No Bid $24,100.00

Cab, Special Service Truck, Cloth,
Power (windows, locks, mirrors),
TTP




Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grande Grapevine Helfman Helfman

Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet |Truck Center DCJ Dodge Ford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | San Antonio | Grapevine Houston Stafford
Caldwell

Vehicle 20: Truck, Ford, 1/2 Ton, No Bid $27,767.00 No Bid $26,863.00 No Bid No Bid $25,215.00

Crew Cab, Special Service, Cloth,

Power (windows, locks, mirrors),

TTP, Lockable Hard Cover to Match

Vehicle 21: Truck, 1/2 ton, Crew No Bid $26,467.00 No Bid $27,022.00 | $25,501.00 No Bid $24,100.00

Cab, Special Service, Cloth, Power

(windows, locks, mirrors), TTP

Vehicle 22: Van, 15 Passenger, 1 No Bid No Bid $39,174.00 | $30,766.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ton, Extended Length, Vinyl Seating,

Power (windows, locks), Rear AC,

TTP

Vehicle 23: Van, Cargo, 1 Ton, No Bid No Bid $36,772.00 | $27,786.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Extended Length, Vinyl Seating,

Power (windows, locks), Rear AC,

TTP

Vehicle 24: Truck, F550, Regular No Bid $40,262.00 No Bid $39,920.00 | $40,857.00 No Bid $37,450.00

Cab, Cab and Chassis, Vinyl, Power
(windows, locks), TTP




2016 Vehicle Order

Bid 16-024

Commissioners Court 10/06/15

Vehicle# [Quantity Department Replacement/ Unit Price Total Funding
Addition
: Tahoe 1 Vehicle Maintenance- Replacement $33,900.00 $33,900.00 Vehicle Maintenance multi-
Replace reserve given to year account
Constable Pct 1 when 2015
truck did not arrive
: Tahoe 1 Vehicle Maintenance- Replacement $33,900.00 $33,900.00 Vehicle Maintenance multi-
Replace reserve given to year account
Constable Pct 3 when 2015
truck did not arrive
: Tahoe 1 Vehicle Maintenance- Replacement $33,900.00 $33,900.00 Risk Management
Replace reserve given to
Sheriff to replace 5 wrecked
vehicles (R-015, R-038, L-
072, P-055, T-047)
: Tahoe 1 Vehicle Maintenance- Replacement $33,900.00 $33,900.00 |Vehicle Maintenance multi-
Replace reserve given to year account
Sheriff to replace vehicle
with blown engine
: Tahoe 1 Vehicle Maintenance- Replacement $33,900.00 $33,900.00 |$13,615.40 Risk Mgnt
Replace reserve given to $20,284.60 EMS-
EMS (wrecked R-037) Contingency
: Tahoe 5 Vehicle Maintenance- Addition $33,900.00 $169,500.00 (2016 Budget
Reserves
: Tahoe 1 Constable Pct 1 Addition $33,900.00 $33,900.00 |2016 Budget
: Tahoe 3 Constable Pct 2 2 Replacement/ $33,900.00 $101,700.00 [2016 Budget
1 Addition
: Tahoe 1 Constable Pct 2 Replacement $33,900.00 $33,900.00 |Contingency




Vehicle# [Quantity Department Replacement/ Unit Price Total Funding
Addition
1: Tahoe 2 Constable Pct 4 1 Replacement/ $33,900.00 $67,800.00 2016 Budget
1 Addition
1: Tahoe 2 Fire Marshal Replacement $33,900.00 $67,800.00 |2016 Budget
1: Tahoe 2 Sheriff Detention Replacement $33,900.00 $67,800.00 2016 Budget
1: Tahoe 26  |Sheriff Enforcement Replacement $33,900.00 $881,400.00 [2016 Budget
1: Tahoe 2 Sheriff Enforcement Addition $33,900.00 $67,800.00 2016 Budget
2: Tahoe 1 Engineering Replacement $34,309.00 $34,309.00 |2016 Budget
2: Tahoe 2 Juvenile Probation Addition $34,309.00 $68,618.00 2016 Budget
7: Truck 1 Constable Pct 3 Replacement $26,097.00 $26,097.00 |2016 Budget
7: Truck 2 Engineering 1 Replacement/ | $26,097.00 $52,194.00 |2016 Budget
1 Addition
11: Truck 1 Facilities Maintenance Addition $24,070.00 $24,070.00 |2016 Budget
12: Truck 3 Animal Services Replacement $19,538.00 $58,749.00  |2016 Budget
13: Truck 4 Drainage District Replacement $24,426.00 $97,704.00 |2016 Budget
14: Truck 1 Drainage District Replacement $24,175.00 $24,175.00  |2016 Budget
15: Truck 1 Interdepartmental Replacement $22,940.00 $22,940.00 |2016 Budget
Construction
17: Truck 1 Interdepartmental Replacement $24,500.00 $24,500.00 |2016 Budget
Construction
18: Truck 4 EMS Replacement $38,313.00 $153,252.00 [2016 Budget
24: Truck 1 Road and Bridge Addition $37,450.00 $37,450.00 |2016 Budget
Patrol Contract Vehicles
1: Tahoe 1 Constable Pct 4 Addition $33,900.00 $33,900.00 |Grand Parkway Tollway
1: Tahoe 2 Constable Pct 4 Addition $33,900.00 $67,800.00 Riverstone (MUDS
115/128/129/149)
1: Tahoe 1 Constable Pct 4 Replacement $33,900.00 $33,900.00  |Sweetwater




Vehicle# [Quantity Department Replacement/ Unit Price Total Funding
Addition
19: Truck 1 Constable Pct 3 Addition $24,100.00 $24,100.00 |Cinco Il
19: Truck 1 Constable Pct 3 Addition $24,100.00 $24,100.00 MUD 185
19: Truck 1 Constable Pct 3 Replacement $24,100.00 $24,100.00 MUD 124
19: Truck 3 Constable Pct 3 Replacement $24,100.00 $72,300.00 16 Cinco
19: Truck 1 Constable Pct 3 Replacement $24,100.00 $24,100.00 16HFBMUD1
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