Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 15-064
Construction of Double Turn Lane at a Private Drive on Fry Road

Recommendation: Jerdon Enterprise, L.P.
Funding: Engineering

Vendor Bid Price Completion Time in
Calendar Days

Jerdon Enterprise, L.P. $199,199.99 60
Stafford
Precise Services, Inc. Disqualified: Failed to provide required
Porter references.
Buyers Barricades, Inc. Disqualified: Failed to submit pricing on all
Houston items.




Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 15-064

Construction of Double Turn Lane at a Private Drive on Fry Road

Item Description Unit Unit Unit Price Extended Price
No. Measure | Quantity
Jerdon Enterprise
City of Houston specs
1|Mobilization LS 1 $29,000.00 $29,000.00
2|Remove reinformed concrete pav SY 457 $0.25 $114.25
3|Clearing and grubbing AC 0.1 $10,000.00 $1,000.00
4|Roadway excavation CY 366 $35.00 $12,810.00
5(8" subgrade preperation SY 549 No Bid No Bid
6{Hydrated lime for subgrade SY 549 No Bid No Bid
7|Fly ash for subgrade SY 549 No Bid No Bid
8[Remove and relocate air release valve EA 1 $1,800.00 $1,800.00
9(Reinforced concrete pav 8" (high early strength) SY 457 $172.00 $78,604.00
10(Blast cleaning of pavement-24" striping LF 232 $0.60 $139.20
11(Blast cleaning of pavement-12" striping LF 667 $0.35 $233.45
12|Blast cleaning of pavement-8" striping LF 174 $0.25 $43.50
13|Blast cleaning of pavement-words and symbols EA 2 $25.00 $50.00
14| Thermoplatic pavement markings-24" striping LF 126 $7.50 $945.00
15{Thermoplatic pavement markings-12" striping LF 362 $3.50 $1,267.00
16| Thermoplatic pavement markings-8" striping LF 174 $2.50 $435.00
17{Thermoplatic pavement markings-words and symbols EA 2 $190.00 $380.00




18|6" reinforced concrete curb LF 412 $13.00 $5,356.00
19|Sodding SY 484 $7.00 $3,388.00
20(Traffic control LS 1 $10,124.95 $10,124.95
21|Relocate ex signs to new location EA 2 $270.00 $540.00
22|Inlet protection barrier EA 2 $140.00 $280.00
23(Filter fabric fence LF 409 $2.50 $1,022.50
24(Removal of trees EA 6 $100.00 $600.00
Alternate Bid Items
25(8" Cement stabilized sand (1.5-2 sack mix) in lieu of SY 549 $35.00 $19,215.00
items 5, 6 and 7
TxDOT Specs
1[Condt (PVC) (Schd 80) (2" LF 65 $15.50 $1,007.50
2|Condt (PVC) (Schd 80) (2") (bore) LF 195 $18.70 $3,646.50
3|Elec condr (no 8) bare LF 250 $3.00 $750.00
4{Ground box EA 4 $900.00 $3,600.00
5|Aluminum signs SF 7.5 $95.00 $712.50
6(upgrade hwy TREF sig (isolated) (ped signal & push EA 1 $9,354.14 $9,354.14
button)
7(Back plate (12 in) (3 sec) EA 1 $180.00 $180.00
8[Veh sig sec (12 in) LED (grn arw) EA 1 $300.00 $300.00
9|veh sig sec (12 in) LED (yel arw) EA 1 $300.00 $300.00
10|veh sig sec (12 in) LED (red arw) EA 1 $300.00 $300.00
11{Trf sig cbl (2 control) LF 535 $1.90 $1,016.50
12|Trf sig cbl (4 control) LF 550 $2.00 $1,100.00
13| Trf sig cbl (7 control) LF 95 $3.00 $285.00
14|Ped pole assembly w/screw-in anchor foundation EA 3 $3,100.00 $9,300.00

Grand Total

$199,199.99
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