2015 Vehicle Order
Bid 15-028

Commissioners Court 11/04/14

Vehicle# |Quantity Department Replacement/ Each Total Funding
Addition
1: Tahoe 1 Constable Pct 1-MUD 162 Addition $28,799.75 $28,799.75 [MUD 162




Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles

Bid 15-028

Awarded 10/14/14: Low bidder per item as highlighted

Description Caldwell Classic Helfman Helfman Meador Randall Tommie
Country Chevrolet Dodge Ford Dodge Reed's Vaughn
Chevrolet | Sugar Land Houston Stafford Fort Worth |Prestige Ford Motors
Caldwell Garland Houston
Vehicle 1: Chevrolet PPV Tahoe with| $29,335.00 | $28,799.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
spotlight and dual battery
Vehicle 2: Chevrolet PPV Caprice $27,165.00 | $26,558.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
with spotlight
Vehicle 3: Ford Police Inceptor No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,199.00 No Bid $23,090.00 No Bid
Vehicle 4: Non-Police Package 4- $18,342.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $16,550.00 No Bid $17,300.00 No Bid
Door Sedan Not as
specified
Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, $24,960.00 | $24,581.00 No Bid $26,799.00 | $29,065.00 | $27,600.00 | Disqualified:
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets, Not as
Power (seat, windows, locks, specified
mirrors), TTP
Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, $25,855.00 | $25,131.00 No Bid $27,010.00 | $29,760.00 | $27,850.00 | Disqualified:
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets, Not as
Power (seat, windows, locks, specified
mirrors), TTP, Plastic Running
Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 ton, 4-Door, $26,355.00 | $25,881.00 No Bid $27,940.00 | $30,565.00 | $28,850.00 | Disqualified:
Crew Cab, SWB, Cloth Buckets, Not as
Power (seat, windows, locks, specified
mirrors), TTP, Lockable Hard Cover
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