Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 15-011
Term Contract fo Medical Supplies

Term: 1 October 2014 through 30 September 2015

Recommended: Low bidder per section

Description Attentus Bound Tree | Henry Schein Midwest Moore Medical Nashville QuadMed Tronex
Medical Sales, Medical Medical LLC Medical & International,
Inc. Supply EMS Products, Inc.
Inc.

Section 1: Disqualified: Did| $  24,049.35| $  24,205.87| Disqualified: Did No Bid Disqualified: Did| $  28,421.96 No Bid
Airways not bid all items not bid all items not bid all items

as required as required as required
Section 2: Disqualified: Did| $  43,683.51| $ 58,490.68| $ 49,941.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
IV, Syringes, not bid all items
Blood as required
Section 3: Disqualified: Did| $ 3,954.78| $ 4,204.04( $ 3,590.63( $ 4,341.13| Disqualified: |$ 3,222.51 No Bid
Bandages, Splints, | not bid all items Bid Substitute.
Tape as required
Section 4: Disqualified: Did| $  41,700.40[ $ 50,991.20] $ 56,159.40 No Bid Disqualified: Did| $  53,139.52 No Bid
EKG not bid all items not bid all items

as required as required
Section 5: No Bid $ 36,05450] $ 44,269.33] $ 51,316.40 No Bid Disqualified: Did| $  39,654.27 No Bid
EKG Cables not bid all items

as required

Section 6: No Bid $ 6,435.00] $ 6,342.60| $ 7,649.40] $ 7,015.80 No Bid $ 7,966.20 No Bid
Microflex
Synetron Latex
Exam Gloves
Section 7: Disqualified: $ 5,865.20 $ 5,805.00| $ 6,811.20( $ 6,260.80 No Bid $ 7,257.00 Disqualified:
Microflex Ultra- Bid Substitute Minimum Order
Sense Non-Latex Required.
Exam Gloves
Section 8: Disqualified: Did| $ 938.00| $ 839.00| $ 1,012.00| $ 933.00 No Bid $ 1,025.00 No Bid

NeoPro EC 12"
Non Latex Exam
Gloves

not bid all items
as required




Description Attentus Bound Tree | Henry Schein Midwest Moore Medical Nashville QuadMed Tronex
Medical Sales, Medical Medical LLC Medical & International,
Inc. Supply EMS Products, Inc.
Inc.

Section 9: $ 39375 | $ 435.00( $ 370.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sterile Gloves
Section 10: No Bid $ 6,287.90] $ 7,014.30] $ 8,989.20| $ 7,627.20] $ 7,241.30 $8,626.00 No Bid
AMBU Perfit
Cervical Collars
Section 11: No Bid $ 8,400.00] $ 8,664.00 $ 12,864.00] $ 7,944.00 No Bid $ 8,976.00 No Bid
AMBU Head
Wedge
Immobilizer
Section 12: Disqualified: Did| $ 2,291.44| $ 2,632.51] $ 1,853.86 No Bid $ 2,431.97| $ 1,871.24 No Bid
Misc Supplies not bid all items

as required
Sectin 13: Disqualified: Did | $ 1,129.87 | $ 990.85 | $ 1,136.56 | $ 1,053.54 No Bid $ 1,129.02 No Bid
Infection Control | not bid all items

as required
Section 14: Disqualified: Did| $  25,160.42 | Disqualified: Did| Disqualified: Did No Bid Disqualified: Did| $ 29,468.24 No Bid
Capitals not bid all items not bid all items | not bid all items not bid all items

as required as required as required as required
Section 15: Disqualified: Did[ $  33,469.54 | $ 126,725.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Medication not bid all items

as required




Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 15-011

Term Contract for Medical Supplies
Term: 1 October 2014 through 30 September 2015
Recommended: Low Bidder per section

Section 1: Airways

Vendor: Bound Tree

Unit Price
40mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway $ 0.14
60mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway $ 0.14
80mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway $ 0.14
90mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway $ 0.14
100 mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway $ 0.14
Thomas E.T. Tube Holder Adult size $ 247
Thomas E.T. Tube Holder Pediatric size $ 247
Tube Check Endotracheal tube placement verification $ 1.93
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 2.5 Uncuffed $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 3.0 Uncuffed $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 3.5 Uncuffed $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 4.0 Uncuffed $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 4.5 Uncuffed $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 5.0 Uncuffed $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 5.5 Cuffed $ 4.05
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 6.0 Cuffed $ 4.05
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 6.5 Cuffed $ 4.05
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 7.0 Cuffed $ 4.00
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 7.5 Cuffed $ 4.00
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 8.0 Cuffed $ 4.05
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 8.5 Cuffed $ 4.05
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 9.0 Cuffed $ 4.05
30F Nasopharyngeal Airways $ 1.35
36F Nasopharyngeal Airways $ 1.35
6F Endotracheal Tube Slick Stylet $ 2.25
8F Endotracheal Tube Slick Stylet $ 2.25
10F Endotracheal Tube Slick Stylet $ 2.25
1200cc Replacement/Disposable Suction Canister, for S-Scort "Ten" suction unit $ 2.56
8F whistle tip Suction Catheter $ 0.17
10F whistle tip Suction Catheter $ 0.17
18F whistle tip Suction Catheter $ 0.17
Yankaur Suction Tip w/Control $ 0.46
Suction Tubing Non Conducting Vinyl 72" x 1/4" ID $ 0.74
Infant Medium Concentration Oxygen Mask $ 1.31
02 Mask Pediatric Partial Non-Rebreather w/ safety vent (Hudson #1058) 50/cs $ 66.50
02 Mask Adult Non-Rebreather w/o safety vent (Hudson #1060) 50/cs $ 63.50
02 Nasal Cannula Adult 50/cs $ 13.00
02 Supply Tubing 7' 50/cs $ 16.50
Bougie-to-go ET Tube Introducer, Adult 15F x 60cm with Coude Tip $ 4.05
Bougie ET Tube Introducer, Pediatric 10F x 70cm with Coude Tip $ 4.05
Sscort Quickdraw Cannister w/short barbed tip $ 12.45
02 Nebulizer w/ Tubing and Mouthpiece 50/cs $ 32.50




Section 1: Airways (cont'd)

Vendor: Bound Tree

Unit Price
Disposable Humidifier $ 1.66
AMBU Spur 11 Bag Valve Mask Adult (with mask) $ 8.38
AMBU Spur Bag Valve Mask Infant/Child (with Infant and Child masks) $ 11.28
Oxygen Nut & Stem (Plastic) $ 0.64
Magill Forceps Adult sizes $ 3.28
Magill Forceps Child sizes $ 2.97
Gastric Sump Tube, 48", 18F, Sterile $ 1.85
V-VAC Replacement Cartridge $ 18.18
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Macintosh 2 $ 3.69
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Macintosh 3 $ 3.69
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Macintosh 4 $ 3.69
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Miller 1 $ 3.69
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Miller 2 $ 3.69
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Miller 3 $ 3.69
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Miller 4 $ 3.69
Greenline/D Fiber Optic, 10/32" Halogen/Xenon Reflector Lamp for Medium Laryngoscope | $ 9.20
eHrﬁg(rjg;Znt respiratory products PORTO2VENT CPAP Soft-Seal Masks, size Small Adult $ 8.99
emergent respiratory products PORTO2VENT CPAP Soft-Seal Masks, size Medium Adult | $ 8.12
emergent respiratory products PORTO2VENT CPAP Soft-Seal Masks, size Large Adult $ 11.38
emergent respiratory products PORTO2VENT CPAP Breathing Circuit & Mask to include $ 37.75
Pressure Balanced Inhalation/Exhalation Valve (Single patient use), Soft-seal Mask size
medium adult (single patient use) (color of seal : Yellow), Integral Proximal Airway Pressure
Line w/Bacterial/Viral Filter, Six foot corrugated tube with locking bayonet connector, Soft-
Seal Mask - Black Neoprene Head Harness
9" x 3" IV Arm Board $ 0.70
12" x 3" IV Arm Board $ 1.02
18" x 3" IV Arm Board $ 0.67
149 x 5 1/4" Needle, Becton Dickinson # 382269 $ 16.15
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for automatic | $ 1.47
safety activation, Color-coded packaging, 14gauge x 2"
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for automatic | $ 1.47
safety activation, color-coded packaging, 16 gauge x 1 1/4"
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for automatic | $ 1.44
safety activation, Color-coded packaging, 18gauge x 1 1/4"
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for automatic | $ 1.44
safety activation, Color-coded packaging, 20gauge x 1 1/4"
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for automatic | $ 1.47
safety activation, Color-coded packaging, 22gauge x 1"
18g x 1 1/2" Needle Only 100/bx $ 4.37
20g x 1 1/2" Needle Only 100/bx $ 4.37
22g x 1 1/2" Needle Only 100/bx $ 4.37
23g x 1" Needle Only 100/bx $ 5.92
1cc 25g x 5/8" Syringe & Needle 100/bx $ 10.00
3cc Syringe, Luer lock $ 5.00
5cc 229 x 1" Syringe & Needle 100/bx $ 22.50
10cc Syringe Luer Lock 100/bx $ 18.00
30cc Syringe Luer Lock 30/bx $ 17.10
60cc Syringe Luer Lock 30/bx $ 19.20
60cc Catheter Tip Syringe, 20z $ 25.88




Section 2: 1V/Syringes/Blood

Vendor: Bound Tree

Unit Price
Vacutainer Holder $ 0.08
Vacutainer Luer Adapter 100/bx $ 11.55
Vacutainer Tubes Red top, Plastic, 6.0mL, 100/bx $ 18.49
Vacutainer Tubes Lavender, Plasticm 3,9mL, 100/bx $ 9.37
Latex Free Tourniquet, 1" x 18", 25 per roll, color = Blue $ 4.88
Glucometer Test Strips for Abbott OptimumEZ glucose meter, capillary, 100 strip/bx $ 40.00
Control solution, tri-level, 1 row 1 mid 1 high per box for Optiu or Precision XTRA $ 11.19
Maxi Drip Set, 82" 10GTTW/Bravo 24, Pre-slit Port, Removable 7" Extension, 50/bx $ 96.50
Mini Drop Basic Administration Set with One Injection Site, (60 Drops/mL) Control Clamp, | $ 70.00
injection site 28" above distal end, two-piece male luer lock. Priming Volume: 12mL,
Length: 66 in.
5% Dextrose Injection USP-500ml, 24/cs $ 1.20
9% Sodium Chloride Injection USP-1000ml, 12/cs $ 1.08
9% Sodium Chloride Injection USP-500ml, 24/cs $ 1.05
Sterile Water for Irrigation, 500mL $ 1.58
Safeline Injection Site: split septum access with two-piece male luer lock. Priming Volume: | $ 1.01
Smallbore Extension Set with bonded Ultrasite Injection site, Length: 7 in, Priming Volume: | $ 1.65
0.6mL (approx)
Section 3: Bandage/Splints/Tape Vendor: QuadMed

Unit Price
2" x 5yd Elastic Bandage $ 0.22
2" x 5yd Bandage, Self-Adherent, , individually packaged $ 0.22
4" x 5yd Elastic Bandage $ 0.55
4" x 5yd Bandage, Self-Adherent, , individually packaged $ 0.55
Occlusive, non-adhering dressing, impregnated with white Petrolatum, 3"x 9" 50/bx $ 30.16
Small Oval Eye Pad 50/bx $ 4.04
4x4 Non Sterile, non-woven, 4ply, 200/pkg $ 2.29
4x4 Sterile 12 ply - 10/tray $ 0.52
4 1/2" x 4.1yd 6 ply Non Sterile Gauze Roll $ 0.10
4 1/2" x 4.1yd 6 ply Sterile Gauze Roll $ 0.13
36" x 51" Triangular Bandage $ 0.19
8" x 10" Abdominal Pad, 20/tray $ 4.75
1" x 3" Adhesive Strip Bandage 50/bx $ 1.32
Burn Sheet Sterile 60" x 96" $ 2.14
Trauma Dressing Sterile 10" x 30" $ 214
Rapid Heat Instant Heat Pack, Pull Apart Style, 6/bx $ 1.01
Rapid Cold Instant Cold Pack, Pull Apart Style, 24/cs $ 0.92
Ferno KED forehead/Chin Strap Replacement set of 2 $ 7.47
54" Padded Board Splint $ 4.65
3M Transpore Tape 1" x 10yd 12/bx $ 9.65
2" x 10yd Waterproof Tape Kendall #3267 6/bx $ 16.11
Flex-All splint, orange, bendable foam and aluminum splint, 4" x 36" rolled $ 2.59
One piece foil bunting with hood. Latex Free 17.5”x30” 18 micron/.70 gauge, Sterile $ 2.60




Section 4: EKG

Vendor: Bound Tree

Unit Price

Recording Paper for Physio Control Life Pak 12, 4" wide. 5/pk $ 1.78
Medicotest Blue Sensor Disposable Electrodes # R-00-S-10 10/pk $ 2.76
Self adhesive pregelled low impedance electrodes with direct connect to Physio Control $ 14.90
Quick combo cables Kimberly Clark #3112-1730 (pediatrics)

Self adhesive pregelled low impedance electrodes with direct connect to Physio Control $ 14.90
Quick combo cables Kimberly Clark #3112-1731 (adult)

FilterLine H Set Adult/Pediatric Medtronic Ref# XS04660 $ 7.90
Nasal FilterLine Adult Medtronic Ref# XS04664 $ 8.87
Highly Conductive Multi Purpose Electrode Gel, 20z tube $ 1.34

Section 5: EKG Cables

Vendor: Bound Tree

Unit Price
LifePack12 Power Adapter Extension Cable Physio Control #11110-000051 $ 103.21
LifePack12 12-Lead ECG trunk cable with 4-wire limb leads, 5' Physio Control #11110- $ 255.90
LifePack12 12-Lead ECG Patient Cable, 6-Wire Precordial Lead Attachment, Physio Control | $ 99.52
#11110-000022
LifePack12 QUIK-COMBO Therapy Cable for use with LifePack12 defibrillator/monitor, $ 271.00
Physio Control #11110-000040
Masimo SET LNC-4 LNCS Patient Cable, 4-foot reusable connector cable, Physio Control $ 155.00
#11171-000024
Masimo SET LNCS DCIP Reusable Sensor, Multiuse sensor for patients 10-50kg, Physio $ 180.50
Control #11171-000018
Masimo SET LNCS DCI Adult Reusable Sensor, Multiuse sensor for patients >30kg, Physio | $ 169.00
Control #11171-000017
MNC-1 Adapter Cable (4 foot), allows LifePack 12 defibrillator/monitor with Masimo SpO2 | $ 200.00
to connect to Nellcor sensors, Physio Control #11996-000198
NELLCOR SpO2 Sensor, DS100A, Adult reusable, Physio Control #11996-000060 $ 120.00
NELLCOR SpO2 Cable Extension, DEC-4, Reusable, Physio Control #11110-000042 $ 42.62
NELLCOR Oxisensor Il Disposable Pediatric SpO2 Sensor, Physio Control #11996-000116 | $ 12.98
NELLCOR Oxisensor Il Disposable Infant SpO2 Sensor, Physio Control #11996-000115 $ 17.00
NIBP Adult Cuff for LifePack 12, 14x37.5cm, reusable, Physio Control #11996-000024 $ 22.50
NIBP Small Child Cuff for LifePack 12, 7x21cm, reusable, Physio Control #11996-000021 | $ 18.69
NIBP Hose, 9 feet, reusable, Physio Control #11996-000033 $ 42.15
Lifepack 12 defibrillator/monitor to PC Serial Port cable, Physio Control #11996-000369 $ 110.02
Lifepack 12 standard hard paddles, Physio Control #11130-000001 $ 488.00
Lifepack 15 Quik-Combo Therapy Cable, Physio Control #11113-000004 $ 267.89
Lifepack 15 Masimo Set Red LNCS Patient Cable 4ft, Physio Control #11996-000323 $ 245.98
Lifepack 15 NIBP Tubing 9ft, Physio Control #21300-007299 $ 44.50
Lifepack 15 Pedi SPO2 Sensor Disposable, Physio Control #11171-000020 $ 13.85
Lifepack 15 Infant SPO2 Sensor Disposable, Physio Control #11171-000031 $ 16.98
Reusable Thigh single tube BP Cuff with ML Fitting for use with LP15 $ 13.25




Section 6: Microflex Synetron Latex Exam Gloves

Vendor: Henry Schein

Microflex Synetron Latex Exam Gloves, powerderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 7.1 mil
Cuff Thickness 9.1 mil Palm Thickness, 10.6 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile Strength = 28
before aging (25 After aging), Elasticity = 783% Before Aging (701% after aging), Protein
Ratina = 60 microarams or less. Small

Microflex Synetron Latex Exam Gloves, powerderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 7.1 mil
Cuff Thickness 9.1 mil Palm Thickness, 10.6 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile Strength = 28
before aging (25 After aging), Elasticity = 783% Before Aging (701% after aging), Protein
Ratina = 60 microarams or less, Medium

Microflex Synetron Latex Exam Gloves, powerderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 7.1 mil
Cuff Thickness 9.1 mil Palm Thickness, 10.6 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile Strength = 28
before aging (25 After aging), Elasticity = 783% Before Aging (701% after aging), Protein
Ratina = 60 microarams or less, Large

Microflex Synetron Latex Exam Gloves, powerderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 7.1 mil
Cuff Thickness 9.1 mil Palm Thickness, 10.6 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile Strength = 28
before aging (25 After aging), Elasticity = 783% Before Aging (701% after aging), Protein
Ratina = 60 microarams or less, Extra L arge

Unit Price
$ 9.61
$ 9.61
$ 9.61
$ 9.61

Section 7: Microflex Ultrasence Non Latex Exam Gloves

Vendor: Henry Schein

Unit Price

Microflex Ultrasense Non Latex Exam Gloves Nitrile Powderfree Exam Gloves(not
manufactured from natural rubber latex)100/bx, 10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 9"
Cuff Length, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 4.7 mil Finger Thickness, Extra Small

$ 6.75

Microflex Ultrasense Non Latex Exam Gloves Nitrile Powderfree Exam Gloves(not
manufactured from natural rubber latex)100/bx, 10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 9"
Cuff Length, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 4.7 mil Finger Thickness, Small

$ 6.75

Microflex Ultrasense Non Latex Exam Gloves Nitrile Powderfree Exam Gloves(not
manufactured from natural rubber latex)100/bx, 10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 9"
Cuff Length, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 4.7 mil Finger Thickness, Medium

$ 6.75

Microflex Ultrasense Non Latex Exam Gloves Nitrile Powderfree Exam Gloves(not
manufactured from natural rubber latex)100/bx, 10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 9"
Cuff Length, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 4.7 mil Finger Thickness, Large

$ 6.75

Microflex Ultrasense Non Latex Exam Gloves Nitrile Powderfree Exam Gloves(not
manufactured from natural rubber latex)100/bx, 10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 9"
Cuff Length, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 4.7 mil Finger Thickness, Extra Large

$ 6.75

Section 8: NeoPro EC 12" Non Latex Exam Gloves

Vendor: Henry Schein

Unit Price
PolyChloroprene Powderfree Exam Gloves (not manufactured from natural rubber latex), $ 8.39
50/bx, 10bx/cs, 5.3 mil Cuff Thickness, 11" Cuff Length, 6.1 mil Palm Thickness, 8.0 mil
Finger Thickness, Small
PolyChloroprene Powderfree Exam Gloves (not manufactured from natural rubber latex), $ 8.39
50/bx, 10bx/cs, 5.3 mil Cuff Thickness, 11" Cuff Length, 6.1 mil Palm Thickness, 8.0 mil
Finger Thickness, Medium
PolyChloroprene Powderfree Exam Gloves (not manufactured from natural rubber latex), $ 8.39
50/bx, 10bx/cs, 5.3 mil Cuff Thickness, 11" Cuff Length, 6.1 mil Palm Thickness, 8.0 mil
Finger Thickness, Large
PolyChloroprene Powderfree Exam Gloves (not manufactured from natural rubber latex), $ 8.39
50/bx, 10bx/cs, 5.3 mil Cuff Thickness, 11" Cuff Length, 6.1 mil Palm Thickness, 8.0 mil
Finger Thickness, Extra Large
PolyChloroprene Powderfree Exam Gloves (not manufactured from natural rubber latex), $ 8.39

50/bx, 10bx/cs, 5.3 mil Cuff Thickness, 11" Cuff Length, 6.1 mil Palm Thickness, 8.0 mil
Finger Thickness, Extra Extra Large




Section 9: Sterile Gloves

Vendor: Henry Schein

Unit Price
Sterile Gloves, Individually packed, ASTM D6319 Standard Specification for Nitrile Exam | $ 123.53
Gloves for Medical Application, size: 6-1/2, 4 bx/cs, per case
Sterile Gloves, Individually packed, ATM D6319 Standard Specification for Nitrile Exam $ 123.93
Gloves for Medical Application, size: 8, 4 bx/cs, per case
Sterile Gloves, Individually packed, ASTM D6319 Standard Specification for Nitrile Exam | $ 123.53

Gloves for Medical Application, size: 9, 4 bx/cs, per case

Section 10: AMBU PERFIT Cervical Collars

Vendor: Bound Tree

Unit Price
Infant $ 2.77
Pediatric $ 2.77
Regular $ 2.77
Neckless $ 2.77
Short $ 2.77
Tall $ 2.77

Section 11: AMBU Head Wedge Disposable Head Immobilizer

Vendor: Moore Medical

Unit Price
Must be able to be applied to any size backboard, must be made of 100% plastic components,| $ 3.31
single slide mechanism that pulls up both side-panels at the same time, re-adjustable side-
panel slide mechanism, symmetrical side panels that always stay the same height, be 100%
water-resistant, have graphic directions for use printed directly on product, able to be stored
"completely" flat, be radiolucent, CT and MRI compatible, include 2 head straps, No
substitutions.
Section 12: Miscellaneous Supplies Vendor: Midwest

Unit Price
Disposable OB Kit, Soft Packaging $ 4.89
Alcohol Prep Pads, Medium Size TRIAD 200/bx $ 1.36
Bite Stick made of high density polyethylene $ 0.30
Bulb Syringe, 20z size $ 0.34
Emesis Bags, single use, Clear, Graduate, 1000cc, latex free, rigid collar, automatic seal $ 0.41
Hydrogen Peroxide 160z Plastic bottle $ 0.57
Sterile Lubricating Jelly, 5g, 72/bx $ 5.79
Oxygen Cylinder Handwheel, Metal $ 13.29
Large Oxygen Cylinder Wrench (aluminum) $ 4.82
Encono Paramedic Shears Drk Blue 7 1/2" $ 0.65
Disposable Penlight $ 0.59
Single use push button activated, spring loaded, retractable Lancet, 100/bx $ 9.41
PVP Surgical Scrub Brush-Sponge 30/bx $ 21.31
METTAG Triage Tags, with Bar code, single part 50/pk $ 42.61
Safety control seals, Pull Tite (numbered), 100/pkg $ 18.95
Razor, Medline Fixed Head, 100/bx $ 40.00
100% Acrylic Cot Blanket, 60" x 84", Blue $ 4.93
Oxygen "D" Cylinder Gasket, Brass w/Rubber Center $ 0.49
Disposable Probe Cover for SureTemp Plus Thermometer, 25/bx $ 1.03
Heavy Duty Ring Cutter $ 12.04
Paper drape sheet, 40" x 84" $ 0.52
Tongue Depressor, Adult, Sterile $ 0.025
Cotton Tip Applicator, 6", Sterile, 2/pkg $ 0.05




Section 13: Infection Control

Vendor: Henry Schein

Unit Price
Sharps shuttle 6" long, 1.1" diameter, 24/bx $ 36.97
Bemis bio hazard box wall safe type Bemis #150-020 $ 3.60
Wrap around goggles with indirect shield-vent 24/cs $ 2.32
Clear lens safety glasses, anti-fog, contemporary styling, ANSI Z87.1 compliant $ 2.64
Fluid shield mask with clear visor, anti-fog, 2" wrap around, ear loops 25/bx $ 6.72
Inovel medical N95 respirator, all sizes, must meet CDC guidelines for tuberculosis exposure | $ 20.64

control in addition to NIOSH and CDC standards for N95 protection against airbourne
pathogens 24/pk

Section 14: Capitals

Vendor: Bound Tree

Unit Price
Lifepack 12 basic carry case, to include Shoulder strip, right pouch, left pouch, and front $ 226.00
cover, Physio Control #11260-00030
Lifepack 12 back pouch for carry case, Phylsio Control #11260-000029 $ 58.00
Lifepack 12 top pouch for carry case, Physio Control #11220-000028 $ 40.65
Liftpack 12 replacement should strap, Physio Control #11260-000037 $ 23.92
Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, infant, Nylon cuff, minimum 10 year calibration Warranty, $ 5.59
with zippered carry case
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, pedi, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration $ 5.59
warranty, with zippered carry case
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, adult, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration $ 5.59
warranty, with zippered
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, large adult, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration | $ 5.59
warranty, with zippered carry case
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, thigh, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration $ 5.59
warranty, with zippered carry case
Adult full arm splint Fracture-Pak $ 20.91
Adult full leg splint Fracture-Pak $ 39.64
Ankle/Elbow splint Fracture-Pak $ 20.54
Pedi full arm splint Fracture-Pak $ 19.37
Pedi full leg splint Fracture-Pak $ 30.55
Greenline/D disposable fiber optic Laryngoscope handle, medium $ 44.75
V Vac manual suction starter kit, Laerdal #985000, includes handle, 2 Replacement $ 79.00
cartridges, short suction Catheter with adapter tip, double male connector and directions
Oxygen flow meter with Ohmeda QC Adapter 1-15LPM $ 31.98
Sprague Rappaport stethoscope, blue, 22”7, Adult and pediatric diaphragm, 3 bells, latex free | $ 85.80
CPAP starter kit promo w/CPAP unit, 1 breathing circuit with harness, back pack, Medium | $ 1,215.07
Oxygen/Ventillator bag, yellow, D size, ProPak, #SA:06 $ 170.00
Ohmeda Male and Ohmeda Female quick connect w/6” hose $ 65.00
Thermometer, electronic, SureTemp Plus Model 690 $ 235.75
Probe and well kit, rectal 4°, for SureTempPlus 690 thermometer $ 68.00
Probe and well kit, oral, 4’, for SureTempcPlus 690 themometer $ 68.00
Restraint strap seat belt buckle loop end, Black, 2 piece, 5’ $ 6.38
Restraint straps chest system, black, nylon, Metal push button, loop ends $ 28.00
Oxygen cylinder with toggle, aluminum, D size $ 44.05
Oxygen regulator/pressure reducer, brass, CGA 540 2800-R-2 $ 63.75
Oxygen regulator, 1 DISS 1BARB 0-25 LPM $ 59.25
Stretcher, wheeled, easy-fold $ 260.00
Megamover plus transport unit, 40x80 Nonwoven ply gret w/backboard pockets, 1500 Ib $ 23.62
Break-apart stretcher, aluminum, w/3 Patient restraint straps, minimum load Capacity 400 1b | $ 275.25
LP15 Standard Carry Case with Right & Left Pouches, Physio Control #11577-000002 $ 230.15




Section 14: Capitals (cont'd)

Vendor: Bound Tree

Unit Price
LP15 Rear Pouch for carry case, Physio Control #11260-000039 $ 56.80
LUCAS 2 Disposable Suction Cup, 3/pk, Physio Control #11576-000046 $ 103.43
LUCAS Patient Strap, Physio Control #11576-000050 $ 80.60
LUCAS Stabilization Strap, Physio Control #21996-000064 $ 75.11
LUCAS Standard Back Plate, Physio Control #21996-000044 $ 27.88
Replacement Ankle Hitch for QD3 & QD4 Traction $ 13.98
Oxygen cylinder with toggle, aluminum, C size $ 42.66
S-Scort “ten” replacement battery, SN 3000 and below $ 37.49
S-Scort Quickdraw replacement 12V rechargeable battery, Sealed Lead Acid $ 478.98
Traction splint w/aluminum ratchet, Adult QD-4 $ 197.00
Traction splint w/aluminum ratchet, child QD-3 $ 197.00
Traction splint w/aluminum ratchet, Combination QD-3 and QD-4 $ 378.90
Kendrick KODE 1 vest, green $ 52.50
S-Scort “ten” port suction unit w/charging shelf and power cord $ 1,185.00
S-Scort “ten” replacement battery, SN >3001 and above $ 37.33
S-Scort Quickdraw w/spare battery, rechargeable 12V sealed lead acid $ 61.00
Clipboard, 8.5” x 14” 6/cs Style-A holder $ 23.02
LA Rescue cervical collar bag, 24”L x 11"H x 5”"W $ 15.70
Trama/Air management bag 111, 26” x 18.5” x 12.5”, blue, Ferno #5111 $ 241.39




Section 15: Medication

Vendor: Bound Tree

Unit Price
Adenosine 6mg/2mL (3mg/mL) 2mL Single dose $ 3.79
Adenosine 12mg/4mL (3mg/mL) 4mL Single dose $ 10.70
Acetaminophen 15mL Infant Drops (80mg per 0.8mL) $ 2.40
Aspirin 81mg Tablets 36/bottle $ 1.36
Atropine Sulfate 18g x 1 1/2", 0.1mg/mL, 10mL Prefilled Syringe with protected needle $ 3.45
Atrovent Solution 0.5mg, 2.5mL $ 0.12
Diphenhydramine 50mg/mL, 1mL Vial $ 0.96
Activated Charcoal 50g, 240mL $ 9.00
Dextrose USP 50%, 18g protected needle, 25grams (0.5g/mL) $ 5.75
Diazepam Injection 10mg (5mg/mL) 2mL Single Dose $ 13.96
Dopamine HCL in 5% Dextrose, 500mL 1V Bag-800mg $ 16.85
Epinephrine 1:1000, 1mg/mL, 1mL Single dose $ 2.60
Epinephrine 1:10,000, 18g, 1/2" (0.1mg/mL) 10mL Prefill Syringe with protected needle $ 3.40
Amidate (Etomidate Injection), 20mg (2mg/mL), 10mL Single Dose Ampule $ 0.759
Fentanyl Citrate Injection USP, 250mcg (0.05mg per mL) in 5mL luer lock syringe $ 1.642
Glucagon 1mg Lilly Kit Red Box 2050A $ 229.00
Glutose 37.5g Unit dose tube $ 3.26
C3 Ketamine 5mg/ml 10ml 10/bx / controlled $ 4.209
Lasix 40mg, 10mg/mL in 4mL Prefill Needleless Syringe $ 4.79
Lidocaine 2% with male luer lock prefilled syringe, 100mg/5mL $ 3.33
Lidocaine 2g in 500mL D5W $ 7.00
Magnesium Sulfate 50%, 1g/2mL Vial $ 1.34
Midazolam 2mg, 2mL single dose $ 0.654
Morphine Sulfate Injection, USP 1mg/mL, 10mL single dose $ 2.225
Naloxone 2mg/2mL - 2mL Pre-filled Syringe $ 15.450
Nitroglycerin Ointment, 2%, 30g Tube $ 37.700
Nitrolingual Spray, 4.1g, 400mcg per Spray, 90 sprays per can $ 136.690
Norcuron with diluent (Vecuronium bromide) for Injection, 10mg (1mg/mL in 10mL) $ 8.200
Pepsid 20mg Tablet, Unit Dose $ 0.048
Albuterol Sulfate, USP Inhalation Solution, 0.083%, 2.5mg/3mL (0.83mg/mL), 25/bx $ 3.420
Sodium Bicarb 8.4%, 50mEq, 50mL Prefilled luer lock syringe $ 5.450
0.9% Sodium Chloride, 5mL in 5mL luer lock syringe $ 0.35
Solumedrol 125mg, 2mL Acto-vial $ 6.89
Tetracaine Hydrochloride Ophthalmic Solution, 1/2%, 1mL Single Dose Units, 12/bx $ 107.88
Thiamine 100mg/mL in 2mL Single dose vial $ 12.33
Carpuject Injector $ 0.02
Ondansetron 4mg 2ml VIAL 25EA/BX 4BX/CS $ 0.50
Mucosal Automation Device, Nasal/Oral, Latex free, 3mL Syringe $ 3.55
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