
 Section  American 
Tire 

 Goodyear 
Commercial 

 Jee 
Wholesale 

 Southern 
Tire 

 Strouhal 
Tire 

 Section 1:                                                 
Tubes 

$3,794.86 No Bid $3,371.25 No Bid No Bid

 Section 2:                                         
Michelin 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $14,300.00 $10,603.50 

 Section 3:                                         
Continental                           
General 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Section 4:                                        
Goodyear  

$219,565.50 $230,781.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Section 5:                                         
Michelin  

No Bid No Bid No Bid $109,988.00 $97,546.00 

 Section 6:                                       
BF Goodrich  

No Bid No Bid No Bid $39,960.00 $38,460.00 

 Section 7:                                             
Uniroyal 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $35,880.00 $35,560.00 

 Section 8:                              
Bridgestone Firestone 

$202,922.60 No Bid No Bid $207,376.00 $213,782.00 

 Section 9:                                                     
Goodyear  

$117,374.50 $122,221.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Section 10:                                        
Generic 

$42,657.42 No Bid No Bid $44,486.00 No Bid

 Section 11:                                            
Michelin 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,272.00 

 Section 12:                                         
BF Goodrich 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $872.00 

 Section 13: 
Bridgestone Firestone 

$4,691.44 No Bid No Bid $4,808.00 No Bid

 Section 14:                                               
Continental General  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Section 15:                                  
Michelin  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $114,234.00 

 Section 16:                                      
BF Goodrich 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,330.00 

 Recommendation: Low bidder per section  

 Fort Bend County Tabulation 
 BID 15-015 

 Term Contract for Tires and Tubes 

 Term:  1 October 2014 through 30 September 2015 



 Section  American 
Tire 

 Goodyear 
Commercial 

 Jee 
Wholesale 

 Southern 
Tire 

 Strouhal 
Tire 

 Section 17: 
Bridgestone Firestone 

$30,756.44 No Bid No Bid $32,116.00 No Bid

 Section 18:                        
Continental General  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Section 19:                      
Goodyear  

$132,073.80 $124,118.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Section 20:                                    
Generic 

$34,955.85 No Bid No Bid $51,084.00 No Bid

 Section 21:                                         
Michelin  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $91,689.00 

 Section 22: 
Bridgestone Firestone 

$106,530.87 No Bid No Bid $88,463.00 No Bid

 Section 23:                                                      
Goodyear 

No Bid $68,319.57 No Bid $66,427.00 No Bid

 Section 24:                                               
Titan 

No Bid $23,330.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Section 25:                                       
Generic 

$42,357.50 No Bid No Bid $41,639.00 No Bid

 Section 26:                                  
Michelin 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $183,256.00 

 Section 27: 
Bridgestone Firestone 

Disqualified: 
Did not bid all

No Bid No Bid $22,127.00 No Bid

 Section 28: 
Bridgestone Firestone 

Disqualified: 
Did not bid all

No Bid No Bid $64,616.00 No Bid

 Section 29:                                     
Generic 

Disqualified: 
Did not bid all

No Bid No Bid $88,583.00 No Bid

 Section 30:                                               
Galazy 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Section 31:                      
Continental General 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Section 32:                                        
Kelly 

$3,485.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Section 33:                        
Toyo 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $  14,000.00  No Bid 

 Section 34:                      
Toyo 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 



Section 1: Tubes                                              Vendor:  
Jee Wholesale Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

7.50R16 Tube with TR15 stem 9047 9.53$                                 
7.50R16 Tube with TR150 stem 9048 9.27$                                 
9.00R20 Tubes with TR443 stem 9050 15.52$                               
10.00R20 Tubes with TR444 stem 9051 15.36$                               
18.4-30 Tubes with TR218A stem 9054 45.09$                               
12.4-24 Tubes with TR218A stem 9055 19.32$                               
18.4R38 Tubes with TR218A stem 9056 49.79$                               
KR 14/15 Tubes with TR13 stem 9057 6.09$                                 
20.5R25 Tubes with SP1000 stem 9058 58.96$                               
13.6X24 Tubes cupples TR218A 9060 25.88$                               
14.9R24 Tubes with TR218A stem 9061 25.88$                               
10.00X16 Tubes with TR15CW stem 9062 12.57$                               
11.00X16 Tubes with TR15CW stem 9063 13.59$                               
12X16.5 Tubes with TR15CW stem 9064 13.07$                               
7.50R15 Brass stem roller rubes TR440 9065  $                                9.47 
23.1X26 Tubes cupples TR218A 9066 76.44$                               
16.9/18.4X34 Tubes cupples TR218A 9067 47.67$                               
480/400X8 Tubes cupples TR87 9068 5.00$                                 
480/400X8 Tubes cupples TR13 10092 3.79$                                 
600/690X9 Brass stem tubes cupples TR440 9069 7.29$                                 
8.25R15 Brass stem tubes cupples TR444 9070 11.57$                               
7.00X12 Brass stem tubes cupples TR440 9071 8.03$                                 
FR 13/14 tube 9072 4.66$                                 
16 tubes TR13 9074 7.43$                                 
13 x 500-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire 9075 4.28$                                 
23 x 1050-12 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire 9076 7.15$                                 
18 x 750-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire 9077 5.60$                                 
16 x 750-8 tubes with stem for lawnmower tire 9078 4.61$                                 
410x350-4 tubes cupples TR13 10093 3.16$                                 
410x350-4 tubes cupples TR87 10094 2.57$                                 

Recommendation: Low bidder per section  

Fort Bend County Tabulation
BID 15-015

Term Contract for Tires and Tubes

Term:  1 October 2014 through 30 September 2015



Section 2:  Michelin Brand Only                                                  
Vendor: Strouhal Tire 

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

P225/60R16 Pursuit V-rated MXV4/Pilot Sport A/S+ 9079 98.03$                               
P235/55/R17 Pursuit V-rated Primary MP Pilot Sport 
A/S+ 9080 114.04$                             

Section 3: Continental/General Brand Only                        
No bids received

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

Section 4:  Goodyear Brand Only                                                   
Vendor: American Tire Distributors

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

P225/60R16 Pursuit v-rated 9084 88.98$                               
P235/55R17 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 9085 106.77$                             
P265/60R17 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 9608 123.00$                             
P235/50R18 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 9609 124.00$                             
P225/60R18 Eagle RS-A Pursuit v-rated 9610 123.85$                             

Section 5:  Michelin Brand Only                                                     
Vendor: Strouhal Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

P225/75R15 LTX M/S ORWL 9086 111.00$                             
LT235/75R15 LTX M/S  2 10427 112.00$                             
P235/75R15 XL LTX A/T2 9088 108.00$                             
LT235/85R16 LTX A/T2 10 ply 9089 155.00$                             
LT235/85R16 LTX M/S 2 9090 155.00$                             
LT235/85R16 XPS Rib 10 ply 9091 222.00$                             
LT235/85R16 XPS Traction 10 ply 9092 235.00$                             
P245/75R16 LTX M/S 2 9093 123.00$                             
LT245/75R16 LTX A/S 10 ply 9094 147.00$                             
LT245/75R16 LTX A/T2 10 ply 9095 147.00$                             
LT245/75R16 LTX M/S 2 9096 158.00$                             
P255/70R16 LTX M/S 9097 130.00$                             
LT265/75R16 LTX M/S 2 10 ply        9098 159.00$                             
LT265/75R16 LTX A/S 10 ply 9099 159.00$                             
P235/75R16 LTX M/S 2 9100 134.00$                             
P235/75R16 LTX M/S 2 XL 9101 110.00$                             
LT245/75R17 LTX M/S 2 10ply 9102 160.00$                             
LT245/75R17 LTX LTX A/T 9103 170.00$                             
P245/75R16 LTX A/T2 ORWL 9104  $                            123.00 
P205/75R14 Defender 9105 81.00$                               
LT275/65R18 LTX A/T2 10 ply 9106 182.00$                             
LT275/65R18 LTX M/S 2 10 ply 9107 183.00$                             
LT225/75R16 LTX M/S 10 ply 9108 140.00$                             
LT225/75R16 LTX A/T 2 10 ply 9109 139.00$                             



Section 5:  Michelin Brand Only (cont'd)                                                 
Vendor: Strouhal Tire+A59

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

P255/65R17 A/S Highway 9614 165.00$                             
P265/60R18 LTX A/S Highway 10095 155.00$                             
P265/70R17 LTX A/S Light Truck 10428 155.00$                             
P265/60R17 LTX A/S Light Truck 10096 154.00$                             
LT265/70R17 10429 163.00$                             
ST205/75R15 10430 60.00$                               
ST225/75R15 10431 60.00$                               
P205/75R15 82.00$                               

Section 6:  B F Goodrich Brand Only                                        
Vendor: Srouhal Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

LT245/75R17 Rugged Trail T/A 10 ply 9111 149.00$                             
LT245/75R16 Commercial T/A 10 ply 9112 136.00$                             
LT245/75R17 Commercial T/A 10 ply 9113 146.00$                             
P235/75R16 XL Long Trail T/A Tour 9114 93.00$                               
P245/75R16 Long Trail T/A tour 9115 106.00$                             
LT275/65R18 T/A 10 ply 9116 172.00$                             
LT265/70R17 Commercial T/A 10 ply 10432 170.00$                             
P235/75R17 Long Trail 10433 126.00$                             

Section 7:  Uniroyal Brand Only                                              
Vendor: Strouhal Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

LT235/75R15 HD 6 ply    9118 137.00$                             
LT235/75R15 AWT II 6 ply 9119 137.00$                             
LT235/85R16 HD/H 10 ply 9120 129.00$                             
LT235/85R16 HD 10 ply 9121 129.00$                             
LT245/75R16 HD/H 10 ply 9122 131.00$                             
LT245/75R16 HD 10 ply 9123 151.00$                             
LT245/75R16 ADT 10 ply 9124 151.00$                             
P255/70R16 Laredo Cross Country 9125 100.00$                             
LT265/75R16 HD/D10 ply 9126 140.00$                             

Section 8:  Bridgestone/Firestone Brand Only                       
Vendor: American Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

LT235/75R15 Transforce HT 6 ply 9128 97.41$                               
LT235/75R15 Destination MT 6 ply 9129 119.74$                             
LT225/75R16 Transforce HT           9130 105.27$                             
LT225/75R16 Destination MT 9131 129.33$                             
LT245/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 9132 103.85$                             
LT245/75R16 Destination MT 10 ply 9133 127.54$                             
LT245/75R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 9134 117.40$                             
LT235/85R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 9135 108.54$                             



Section 8:  Bridgestone/Firestone Brand (cont'd)                      
Vendor: American Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

LT215/85R16 Transforce HT 9136 97.26$                               
LT215/85R16 Destination MT 9137 114.96$                             
LT235/80/17 Transforce HT 9138 112.58$                             
LT235/85R16 Destination MT 10 ply 9139 127.80$                             
P205/60R16 Firestone Precision Touring 9140 70.32$                               
LT235/85R16 Transforce AT 10 ply 9141 113.70$                             
P225/60R16 Firestone Precision Touring 10434 77.00$                               
P255/70R16 A/T Destination AT 9143 108.78$                             
9.50R16.5 Transforce HT 10 ply 9144 109.76$                             
LT235/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 9145 99.56$                               
LT275/70R18 Transforce AT 10 ply 9146 144.08$                             
LT275/70R18 Transforce HT 9147 138.60$                             
LT265/70R17 Transforce AT 10 ply 9148 131.13$                             
LT265/70R17 Destination MT 10 ply 9149 147.05$                             
LT245/75R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 9150 117.40$                             
P255/65R17 Destination LE 9151 99.36$                               
P265/75R16 Destination AT 9152 116.53$                             
P215/60R16 Precision Touring 10435 74.49$                               
P235/70R16 Dueler HT 9154 98.42$                               
P235/70R16 Destination LE 9615 97.08$                               
P255/65R16 Destination LE 9616 95.65$                               
P265/70R16 Destination LE 9155 108.29$                             
P205/75R15 FR380 9617 88.26$                               
LT245/70R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 10097 113.98$                             
LT265/70R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 127.92$                             
LT265/75R16 Transforce AT 10437 122.96$                             
P235/55R17 Precision Touring 10438 89.83$                               
P245/65R17 Destination LE 10439 92.01$                               
P205/75R15 85.01$                               

Section 9:  Goodyear Brand Only                                                    
Vendor: American Tire 

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

P215/65R16 Eagle LS 9156 84.21$                               
P255/65R16 Eagle LS 9157 153.38$                             
LT235/75R15 Wrangler MT/R 6 ply 9158 118.01$                             
P235/75R15 Wrangler RT/S XL      9159 89.77$                               
P235/75R16 Wrangler ST BW 9161 108.26$                             
LT235/85R16 Wrangler HT 10 ply 9162 125.98$                             
LT235/85R16 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply 9163 152.66$                             
LT245/75R16 Wrangler HT load range E 9164 130.66$                             
P205/60R16 Eagle GT 9165 79.92$                               
LT245/75R16 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply 9166 167.19$                             



Section 9:  Goodyear Brand Only (cont'd)                                                    
Vendor: American Tire 

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

P225/60R16 Eagle GT 9167 83.04$                               
LT245/75R16 Wrangler AT/S 10 ply 9168 146.84$                             
P245/75R16 Wrangler RT/S 9169 100.50$                             
LT245/75R16 Wrangler RT/S 10 ply 9170 135.86$                             
LT265/75R16 Wrangler RT/S 10 ply 9171 148.79$                             
LT265/75R16 Wrangler MT/R 8 ply 9172 170.27$                             
P255/70r16 Wrangler RT/S 9173 116.03$                             
LT245/70R17 Wrangler MT/R 10 ply 9174 172.39$                             
P265/70R17 Wrangler RT/S 9175 156.10$                             
P265/70R17 Wrangler AT/S 9176 156.89$                             
LT265/70R17 Wrangler AT/S 6 ply 9177 110.67$                             
LT265/70R17 Wrangler MT/R 6 ply 9178 185.26$                             
LT275/65R18 Wrangler AT/S VSB 10 ply 9181 168.68$                             
LT275/65R18 Wrangler AT/S OWL 10 ply 9182 168.68$                             
P275/65R18 Wrangler SR-A OWL SL 9183 144.57$                             
P245/65R17 Highway Tire 10098 124.77$                             
P235/75R17 Wrangler SRA 10440 116.75$                             

Section 10:  Generic                                                                                   
Vendor: American Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

LT235/75R15 Transforce HT 6 ply 9184 91.41$                               
LT235/75R15 Destination MT 6 ply 9185 119.74$                             
LT215/85R16 Destination MT 10 ply          9611 114.96$                             
LT225/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply          9186 105.27$                             
LT225/75R16 Destination MT 10 ply          9187 129.33$                             
LT245/75R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 9188 103.85$                             
LT245/75R16 Destination MT 10 ply 9189 121.88$                             
LT245/75R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 9190 111.40$                             
LT235/85R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 9191 108.54$                             
LT215/85R16 Transforce HT 10 ply 9192 97.26$                               
LT235/85R16 Destination MT 10 ply 9193 127.80$                             
LT235/85R16 Transforce AT 10 ply 9194 113.70$                             
P255/70R16  Destination AT 10 ply 9195 108.79$                             
9.50R16.5 Transforce HT 10 ply 9196 109.76$                             
LT265/70R17 Destination MT 10 ply 9197 147.05$                             
LT265/70R17 Transforce HT 10 ply 127.92$                             
ST175/80R13 9612 44.47$                               

Section 11:  Michelin Brand Only                                             
Vendor: Strouhal Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

225/70R19.5 XZE 14 ply 9198 318.00$                             



Section 12:  B F Goodrich Brand Only                                   
Vendor:  Strouhal Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

225/70R19.5 ST230 14 Ply 9199 218.00$                             

Section 13:  Bridgeston/Firestone Brand Only                              
Vendor: American Tire 

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

225/70R19.5 M724F 12 ply 9200 299.00$                             
225/70R19.5 M729F 12 ply 9201 287.43$                             

Section 14:  Continental/General Brand Only                        
No bids received

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

Section 15:  Michelin Brand Only                                                           
Vendor:  Strouhal Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

10.00R20 XZE2 hi-way 9207 383.00$                             
11R22.5 XZE 14 ply 9208 434.00$                             
11R22.5 MI XZY 16 ply 9209 445.00$                             
11R22.5 MI XZE 2 16 ply 9210 453.00$                             
11R22.5 XDE MS 16 ply 9211 460.00$                             
12R22.5 XZE 9212 589.00$                             
255/70R22.5 XZE 9213 417.00$                             
385/65R22.5 x 24 18 ply XZY 3 9214 670.00$                             
315/80 R22.5 XZA 9215 620.00$                             
225/70 R19.5 10 ply XZE 9216 274.00$                             
11R22.5 XZY3 9217 511.00$                             
12R22.5 XZY3 9218 606.00$                             

Section 16:  B F Goodrich Brand Only                                           
Vendor: Strouhal Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

11R22.5 DR675 16 ply 9219 356.00$                             
11R24.5 DR675 16 ply 10441 377.00$                             

Section 17:  Bridgestone/Firestone Brand Only                    
Vendor: American Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

10R22.5 T559 12 ply 10442 218.19$                             
10R22.5 FD663 12 ply 9230 291.35$                             
11R22.5 T559 16 ply FS 507+ 9231 294.86$                             
11R22.5 T831 16 ply 9232 355.07$                             
11R22.5 T819 16 ply 9233 332.64$                             
12R22.5 T831  16 ply 9234 397.14$                             
11R24.5 T831 16 ply 10443 386.39$                             
11R24.5 FS 507+ 16 ply 10444 328.42$                             
12R22.5 FS 560+ 10445 364.86$                             



Section 18:  Continental/General Brand Only                             
No bids received

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

Section 19:  Goodyear Brand Only                                                     
Vendor: Goodyear Commercial Tire & Service

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

11R22.5 G287 MSA 16 ply 9245 459.42$                             
11R22.5 G288 MSA 16 ply 9246 513.10$                             
11R22.5 G177 16 ply         9247 534.12$                             
11R22.5 G395 LHS 14 ply 9248 448.79$                             
11R22.5 G395 LHS 16 ply 9249 457.77$                             
11R22.5 G314 12 ply          10449 372.58$                             
12R22.5 G149 MSA 16 ply 10450 496.89$                             
315/80R22.5 G291 18 ply 9252 752.03$                             
385/65R22.5 G178SS 18 ply 9253 776.72$                             

Section 20:  Generic                                                                                
Vendor: American Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

10.00-20 Transport 1  14 ply 9258 265.99$                             
10.00-20 S A Traction ND 14 ply 9259 232.81$                             
10.00R20 T559 14 ply 9260 265.99$                             
10.00R20 T819 16 ply 9261 295.41$                             
10.00R20 T831 16 ply 9262 252.20$                             
10.00R20 T546 16 ply 9263 252.20$                             
10R22.5 T559 12 ply 9264 265.89$                             
10R22.5 FD663 12 ply 9265 218.61$                             
11R22.5 T559 16 ply FS 507+ 10451 226.74$                             
11R22.5 T831  16 ply 9267 226.99$                             
11R22.5 T819  16 ply 9268 226.89$                             
12R22.5 T831  16 ply 9269 266.80$                             
11R24.5 T831 16 ply 10452 241.99$                             
11R24.5 16 ply FS 507+ 10453 271.32$                             
12R22.5 FS 560 10454 266.80$                             
Section 21:  Michelin Brand Only                                               
Vendor: Strouhal Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

12.4-24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 9270 965.00$                             
13.6R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 9271 1,113.00$                          
14.9R24 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 9272 1,285.00$                          
18.4R30 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 9273 1,906.00$                          
16.9R34 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 9274 1,853.00$                          
18.4R38 R-1W Radial Agribib 8 ply 9275 1,638.00$                          
380/85R24 Power Radial 80 9276 1,285.00$                          
18.4R34 R-1W Radial 8 ply 9277 1,682.00$                          
23.1-26 10 ply tubeless 9278 1,648.00$                          
28L-26 10 ply tubeless 10099 1,848.00$                          



Section 22:  Bridgestone/Firestone Brand Only                        
Vendor: Southern Tire Mart

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

7.50-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 9279 173.00$                             
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 9280 155.00$                             
11.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 9281 206.00$                             
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 9282 122.00$                             
12.4-24 Super All Traction 23° 8 ply 9283 263.00$                             
340/85R24 Radial 6000-R-1W 8 ply 9284 448.00$                             
380/85R24 Radial 6000-R-1W 8 ply 9285 534.00$                             
14.9-24 Champ Spade Grip-R-2 12 ply 1,480.00$                          
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip - R-2 6 ply 9286 869.00$                             
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip - R-2 10 ply 9287 1,898.00$                          
16.9-34 Traction Field & Road - R-1 8 ply 9288 575.00$                             
18.4-34 Traction Field & Road - R-1 8 ply 9289 618.00$                             
18.4R38 Radial All Traction 23° 8 ply 9290 1,186.00$                          
18.4-30 Super All Traction 23° R-1 8 ply 10455 746.00$                             
12.4R24 Radial All Traction DT R-1W 825.00$                             
13.6R24 Radial All Traction DT R-1W 900.00$                             
14.9R24 Radial All Traction DT R-1W 999.00$                             
18.4R30 Radio All Traction DT R-1W 825.00$                             

Section 23:  Goodyear  Brand Only                                                           
Vendor: Southern Tire Mart

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

7.50-16 Triple Rib HD TT 6 ply 9291 144.00$                             
11L-15 Triple Rib HD TT 8 ply 9292 198.00$                             
10.00-16 Triple Rib HD TT 8 ply 9293 228.00$                             
11.00-16 Triple Rib HD 8 ply TT 9294 275.00$                             
12.4-24 R1 Dura Torque TL 8 ply 9295 375.00$                             
13.6-24 R1 Dyna Torque II TT 8 ply 9296 595.00$                             
18.4-30 R1 Dura Torque  TT 8 ply 9298 699.00$                             
18.4-30 R-2 Special Sure Grip TD8 10 ply TL 9299 1,149.00$                          
16.9-34 R1 Dyna Torque II TT 8 ply 9300 661.00$                             
18.4-34 R1 Dura Torque TT 8 ply 9301 745.00$                             
18.4R38 R-1 Dyna Torque TL 9302 1,125.00$                          
23.1-26 10 ply tubeless 9303 1,231.00$                          
Section 24:  Titan  Brand Only                                                    
Vendor: Goodyear Commercial Tire & Service

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

11L-15SL Tru Trac Triple Rib TT F-2 8 ply 9304 174.04$                             
10.00-16SL Tru Trac Triple Rib F-2 TL 8 ply 9305 193.23$                             
11.00-16SL Tru Trac Triple Rib F-2 TL 8 ply 9306 240.05$                             
12.4-24 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 8 ply 9307 384.07$                             
18.4-30 Hi Trac Lug R-1 TL 6 ply    9308 694.93$                             
13.6R24-128A8 Hi Trac Lug Radial R-1 9309 625.10$                             
14.9R24-120A8 Hi Trac Lug Radial R-1 9310 687.07$                             



Section 25: Generic                                                                       
Vendor: Southern Tire Mart

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

7.50-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 9311 115.00$                             
10.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 9312 157.00$                             
11.00-16 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 9313 214.00$                             
11L-15 Champ Guide Grip 3 Rib F-2 8 ply 9314 240.00$                             
12.4-24 Super All Traction 23° 8 ply 9315 228.00$                             
18.4-30 Traction F & R 8 ply 9316 580.00$                             
340/85R24 Radial 6000 R-1W 8 ply 9317 492.00$                             
380/85R24 Radial 6000 R-1W 8 ply 9318 999.00$                             
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip 6 ply 9319 580.00$                             
18.4-30 Champ Spade Grip 10 ply 9320 580.00$                             
16.9-34 Traction Field & Road 8 ply 9321 575.00$                             
18.4-34 Traction Field & Road 8 ply 9322 618.00$                             
18.4R38 Radial All Traction 23° 8 ply 9323 1,113.00$                          
ST205/75R15C Tow Master Trailer 10100 65.00$                               

Section 26:  Michelin Brand Only                                                    
Vendor: Strouhal Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

29.5R25 MI XHA 2 star 9324 4,666.00$                          
1400R24 XGL 9325 1,001.00$                          
17.5R25 XTLA 9326 1,150.00$                          
20.5R25 XTLA 9327 1,534.00$                          
1300R24 XGLA 9328 900.00$                             
29.5R25 MI XHA 1 Star 9329 4,666.00$                          
750R15 MI XLC 9330 317.00$                             
23.5R25 XHA 2 STXL 9331 2,200.00$                          
1800-25 16 ply tubeless 9618 750.00$                             
12x16.5 Super Traction 10456 160.00$                             
12x16.5 Tweel 10457 850.00$                             
23.1-26 10 ply 1,300.00$                          
23.1-26 12 ply 1,020.00$                          
28L-R26 10 ply 1,500.00$                          
28L-R26 12 ply 1,600.00$                          

Section 27:  Bridgestone/Firestone Brand Only                                 
Vendor: Southern Tire Mart

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply 9332 256.00$                             
6.00X9 Industrial 10 ply 9333 71.00$                               
8.25X15 Industrial 12 ply 9334 217.00$                             
7.00X12 Industrial 10 ply 9335 140.00$                             
4.80X8 Wheel barrow  2 ply 9336 25.00$                               
4.10/3.50-4 9337 20.00$                               
8-14.5 Towmaster Super Hwy 9338 69.00$                               



Section 27:  Bridgestone/Firestone (cont'd)                              
Vendor: Southern Tire Mart

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

12X16.5 Super traction 9339 155.00$                             
14/70-20 20 ply roller tire 9340 1,603.00$                          
15.5X25 SGGLO 9341 598.00$                             
17.5X25 GGG E2/L-2 9342 683.00$                             

Section 28:  Bridgestone/Firestone Brand Only                                   
Vendor: Southern Tire Mart

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

14.00X24 G-2 9345 524.00$                             
14.00R24 Bridgestone VUT 9346 952.00$                             
20.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 9347 1,063.00$                          
23.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 9348 1,587.00$                          
29.5R25 E-3 22 ply 9349 5,501.00$                          
7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply 9350 256.00$                             
6.00X9 industrial 10 ply 9351 71.00$                               
8.25X15 industrial 12 ply 9352 271.00$                             
7.00X12 industrial 14 ply 9353 140.00$                             
4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply 9354 25.00$                               
13 x 500-8 NHS Turf 9355 25.00$                               
23 x 1050-12 NHS Turf 9356 75.00$                               
18 x 750-8 Turf 9357 50.00$                               
7.50R16 Westlake CR859 LR G 9358 100.00$                             
13x650 6 turf 9359 25.00$                               
13x500 6 turf 9360 20.00$                               
11x4.00-5 15.00$                               
20x8.00-10 65.00$                               

Section 29:  Generic                                                                           
Vendor: Southern Tire Mart

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply 9361 256.00$                             
6.00X9 industrial 10 ply 9362 71.00$                               
8.25X15 Industrial 12 ply 9363 217.00$                             
7.00X12 Industrial 10 ply 9364 140.00$                             
4.80X8 Wheel barrow  2 ply 9365 25.00$                               
410/350-4 9366 20.00$                               
8-14.5 Towmaster Super Hwy 9367 69.00$                               
12X16.5 Super traction 9368 155.00$                             
14/70-20 20 ply roller tire 9369 1,603.00$                          
15.5X25 SGGLO 9370 598.00$                             
17.5X25 GGG E2/L-2 9371 683.00$                             
14.00X24 G-2 9374 524.00$                             
14.00R24 Bridgestone VUT 9375 952.00$                             
20.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 9376 1,063.00$                          



Section 29:  Generic  (cont'd)                                                                         
Vendor: Southern Tire Mart

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

23.5X25 SGG E-2/L-2 9377 1,587.00$                          
29.5R25 E-3 22 ply 9378 5,501.00$                          
7.50X15 Industrial 12 ply 9379 256.00$                             
6.00X9 industrial 10 ply 9380 71.00$                               
8.25X15 industrial 12 ply 9381 217.00$                             
7.00X12 industrial 10 ply 9382 140.00$                             
4.80X8 Wheel barrow 2 ply 9383 25.00$                               
13 x 500-8 NHS Turf 9384 25.00$                               
23 x 1050-12 NHS Turf 9385 75.00$                               
18 x 750-8 Turf 9386 50.00$                               
7.50R16 LRG Trailer tire 9387 93.00$                               
ST235/85R16 LRG Trailer tire 10458 149.00$                             
11.4.00-5 15.00$                               
20x8.00-10 65.00$                               
ST205/75R15 63.00$                               
ST225/75R15 70.00$                               

Section 30:  Galaxy Brand Only                                                  
No bids received

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

Section 31:  Continental/General Brand Only                                        
No Bids Received

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

Section 32:  Kelly Brand                                         
Vendor: American Tire

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

P225/60R16 Explorer Plus 10102 69.71$                               

Section 33:  Toyo Brand                                             
Vendor: Southern Tire Mart

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 

LT245/75R16 Open Country MT 10 ply 255.00$                             
LT235/85R16 Open Country MT 10 ply 250.00$                             
LT265/70R17 open Country MT 10 ply 295.00$                             

Section 34:  Toyo Brand                                                     
No bids received

Lawson 
Number

 Per Each 
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