
Vehicle # Quantity Department Replacement/   
Addition

PO # Each Total

1: Tahoe 1 Constable Pct 1 Contract Deputy = 1                     
( 1-Greatwood  )

1-Addition   $    27,949.00  $    27,949.00 

2014 Vehicle Order
Bid 14-016

Commissioners Court 11/26/13



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Dallas Dodge            
Dallas

Grapevine 
Dodge             

Grapevine

 Helfman 
Dodge           

Houston 

Helfman 
Ford             

Stafford

Meador 
Dodge                

Fort Worth

Randall 
Reed's 

Prestige Ford          
Garland

Vehicle 1: Chevrolet 
PPV Tahoe with 
spotlight and dual 
battery

$27,949.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 2: Chevrolet 
PPV Caprice with 
spotlight

$27,040.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vehicle 3: Ford 
Police Inceptor

No Bid $23,244.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,429.00 No Bid $24,436.00 

Vehicle 4: Non-Police 
Package 4-Door 
Sedan

$17,946.00 $16,296.00 No Bid Does not meet 
specifications 
for wheelbase

No Bid $16,399.00   
within 3% from 
a local vendor

pursuant to 
§271.905

No Bid $16,775.00 

Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 
ton, 4-Door, Crew 
Cab, SWB, Cloth 
Buckets, Power (seat, 
windows, locks, 
mirrors), TTP

$28,858.00 $22,919.00 No Bid $27,146.00 No Bid $24,475.00 $26,246.00 $24,860.00 

Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles
Bid 14-016

Awarded Commissioners Court 10/22/13:  Low bidder per item as highlighted



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Dallas Dodge            
Dallas

Grapevine 
Dodge             

Grapevine

 Helfman 
Dodge           

Houston 

Helfman 
Ford             

Stafford

Meador 
Dodge                

Fort Worth

Randall 
Reed's 

Prestige Ford          
Garland

Vehicle 6: Truck, 1/2 
ton, 4-Door, Crew 
Cab, SWB, Cloth 
Buckets, Power (seat, 
windows, locks, 
mirrors), TTP, Plastic 
Running Boards

$29,273.00 $23,119.00 No Bid $27,746.00 No Bid $24,690.00 $26,746.00 $24,996.00 

Vehicle 7: Truck, 1/2 
ton, 4-Door, Crew 
Cab, SWB, Cloth 
Buckets, Power (seat, 
windows, locks, 
mirrors), TTP, 
Lockable Hard Cover

$29,840.00 $24,419.00 No Bid $28,746.00 No Bid $25,575.00 $27,546.00 $25,997.00 

Vehicle 8: Truck, 1/2 
ton, 4-Door, Crew 
Cab, SWB, Cloth 
Buckets, Power (seat, 
windows, locks, 
mirrors), TTP, 
Lockable Hard Cover, 
Plastic Running 
Boards

$30,414.00 $24,619.00 No Bid $29,346.00 No Bid $25,790.00 $27,046.00 $26,250.00 



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Dallas Dodge            
Dallas

Grapevine 
Dodge             

Grapevine

 Helfman 
Dodge           

Houston 

Helfman 
Ford             

Stafford

Meador 
Dodge                

Fort Worth

Randall 
Reed's 

Prestige Ford          
Garland

Vehicle 9: Truck, 1/2 
ton, Extended Cab, 
SWB, 4x4, Vinyl 
Split Bench, Power 
(windows, locks), 
TTP

$25,788.00 $23,442.00 No Bid Does not meet 
specifications 
for wheelbase

No Bid $22,800.00 Does not meet 
specifications: 

Bid 4x2 not 
4x4

$23,550.00 

Vehicle 10: Truck, 
1/2 ton, Regular Cab, 
LWB, Vinyl Bench & 
Flooring, Power 
(windows, locks), 
TTP

$19,979.00 $18,522.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17,980.00 $20,374.00 $18,585.00

Vehicle 11: Truck, 
3/4 ton, Extended 
Cab, SWB, Vinyl 
Split Bench, Power 
(windows, locks), 
TTP

$25,114.00 $21,583.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,425.00 No Bid $21,880.00 

Vehicle 12: Truck, 
3/4 ton, Regular Cab, 
LWB, Vinyl Bench,  
No Power, TTP

$22,934.00 $18,958.00 $21,735.00 No Bid No Bid $18,669.00    
within 3% from 
a local vendor

pursuant to 
§271.905

$22,382.00 $18,400.00



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Dallas Dodge            
Dallas

Grapevine 
Dodge             

Grapevine

 Helfman 
Dodge           

Houston 

Helfman 
Ford             

Stafford

Meador 
Dodge                

Fort Worth

Randall 
Reed's 

Prestige Ford          
Garland

Vehicle 13: Truck, 
3/4 ton, Extended 
Cab, LWB, Vinyl 
Split Bench, No 
Power, TTP, 9.6" 
Ground Clearance

$25,724.00 Does not meet 
specificiations 

for ground 
clearance

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Does not meet 
specificiations 

for ground 
clearance

Vehicle 14: Truck, 1 
ton, 4-Door Crew 
Cab, LWB, Vinyl 
Bench & Flooring, 
Power 
(windows,lock), TTP

$27,749.00 $24,416.00 $28,371.00 $27,821.00 No Bid $24,250.00 $28,121.00 $24,900.00

Vehicle 15: 
Ambulance Cab and 
Chassis, Regular Cab

No Bid No Bid $37,901.00 Does not Meet 
Specifications 
for axle ratio

$38,690.00   
within 3% from 
a local vendor

pursuant to 
§271.905

No Bid $38,887.00 Does not meet 
specificiations 

for engine

Vehicle 16: Ford, F-
150, Crew Cab, 
Special Service 
Truck, Cloth, Power 
(windows, locks, 
mirrors), TTP

No Bid $22,919.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,290.00 No Bid $22,900.00



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Dallas Dodge            
Dallas

Grapevine 
Dodge             

Grapevine

 Helfman 
Dodge           

Houston 

Helfman 
Ford             

Stafford

Meador 
Dodge                

Fort Worth

Randall 
Reed's 

Prestige Ford          
Garland

Vehicle 17: Ford, 
Explorer Police 
Inceptor Utility, 
Cloth, Power (seat, 
windows, locks, 
mirrors), No 
Spotlight, No Backup 
Camera

No Bid $26,112.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,900.00 No Bid $25,750.00

Vehicle 18: Truck, 
1/2 Ton, Crew Cab, 
Special Service, 
Cloth, Power 
(windows, locks, 
mirrors), TTP

No Bid $22,919.00 No Bid $22,267.00 $23,280.00 $22,290.00 $22,567.00 $22,900.00

Vehicle 19: Truck, 1 
Ton, Regular Cab, 
Vinyl Bench, No 
Power, TTP

No Bid $20,435.00 $26,146.00 No Bid No Bid $19,749.00 $27,195.00 $20,550.00

Delivery Options:

Willing to store 
vehicles and deliver 3 
per week?

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Additional Cost to 
store?

Yes Yes No No No No No No

If Yes, Cost $375.00 $375.00 N/A



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

Caldwell 
Country Ford    

Caldwell

Dallas Dodge            
Dallas

Grapevine 
Dodge             

Grapevine

 Helfman 
Dodge           

Houston 

Helfman 
Ford             

Stafford

Meador 
Dodge                

Fort Worth

Randall 
Reed's 

Prestige Ford          
Garland

Invoice Upon 
Delivery?

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Warranty Start at 
Time of Delivery?

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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