
Company Section 1         

Brother

Section 2          

Canon

Section 3           

Dell   

Section 4           

Epson

Section 5        

Hewlett 

Packard

Section 6      

Konica

Section 7      

Lexmark      

Section 8              

Panasonic

Section 9      

Ricoh

Section 10      

Sharp

ASE Direct, Inc.                         

Brentwood TN

Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

$409.27 $4,876.99 Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

$261.00 $657.89 $30.16 $267.97 $78.24

Academic Supplier                           

Chula Vista CA

$942.15 $384.92 $4,732.63 $254.89 $21,933.51 $295.00 $603.91 $29.00 $253.00 $84.00

Americana Business 

Consultants                               

Houston

Disq: Did 

not total 

section

$651.15 $5,562.20 $479.30 Disq: Did 

not total 

section

$379.80 $749.90 $49.95 $309.75 $139.95

Double M Laser 

Products                                      

Houston

$1,137.00 $415.50 $5,106.00 $302.50 $25,939.00 $305.00 $665.00 $50.00 $268.00 $108.50

CVR Computer 

Supplies                                                            

Cherry Hill NJ

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19,124.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

City Toner, LLC                                                

Miami FL

$986.14 $415.80 $4,403.32 $285.38 Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

$260.89 $608.80 $25.12 $250.32 $123.66

Computer Networking                    

East Brunswick NJ

$867.26 $393.74 $4,663.91 Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

$277.13 $615.49 $26.04 $255.46 $77.77

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 14-011

Toner and Ink Cartridges

Term: 1 October 2013 through 30 September 2014

Recommendation: Low bidder per section                                                                                                        



Company Section 1         

Brother

Section 2          

Canon

Section 3           

Dell   

Section 4           

Epson

Section 5        

Hewlett 

Packard

Section 6      

Konica

Section 7      

Lexmark      

Section 8              

Panasonic

Section 9      

Ricoh

Section 10      

Sharp

Laserlink 

International               

Emeryvill CA

$821.00 $357.90 $4,032.00 $288.00 $21,764.25 $125.00 $488.00 $24.00 $260.00 $79.00

Office Depot                                

Houston

$1,177.56 $483.26 Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

$297.03 $27,749.46 $394.48 $693.56 $31.70 $295.27 $120.99

Southern Computer 

Warehouse, Inc.                              

Marietta GA

Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

$400.48 Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

$252.08 $610.54 No Bid $228.46 $95.66

The Tree House, Inc.             

Newton Center MA                         

$896.33 $385.80 $4,005.25 $263.10 Disq: Did 

not bid all 

items

$285.20 $508.00 $28.70 $172.00 $124.00

WM Corp.                                            

Centennial CO

$898.45 $382.99 $4,767.57 $270.42 $22,396.88 $250.58 $607.27 $27.32 $247.24 $134.06



Lawson 

Number

Item Description Price per 

Cartridge

10659 BRTDR250 Drum, DR250 $59.00

10660 DR350 Drum, DR-350,  BLK $80.00

10661 DR400 Drum, MFC8300, DR400 $93.00

10662 LC61CS Ink, LC61, Cyan $8.00

10663 LC61MS Ink.LC61, Magenta $8.00

10664 LC61YS Ink, LC61, Yellow $8.00

10665 LC65HYBKS Ink, LC65, High Yield, BK $23.00

10666 TN210BK Toner, TN210, Black $49.00

10667 TN210C Toner, TN210C, Cyan $49.00

10668 TN210M Toner, TN210M, Magenta $49.00

10669 TN210Y Toner, TN210Y, Yellow $49.00

10670 TN250 Toner, TN250 $25.00

10671 TN350 Toner, Laser, TN350BLK $47.00

10672 TN350-2PK Toner, 2/PK, Black $92.00

10673 TN450 Toner, TN450, High Yield, Black $50.00

10674 TN460 Toner, MFC8300, TN460, High Yield $52.00

10675 OD350D Drum, OD, DR-350, Black $80.00

10676 0615B009 PG-40/CLI-41 Ink/Paper Combo $39.00

10677 0628B009 PGI-5BK, 2 PK, Black $26.95

10678 1509B002 PGI-35, Black $14.00

10679 1511B002 CLI-36, CLR $17.00

10680 1557A002BA FX3, Fax $30.00

10681 2945B004 PGI-220, 3 PK, Black $35.00

10682 2946B001 CLI-221, Black $13.00

Vendor: Laserlink International

Section 1:  Brother

Section 2:  Canon

Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 14-011

Toner and Ink Cartridges

Term: 1 October through 30 September 2014

Recommended:  Low bidder per section                                                                                                        

Vendor: Laserlink International



Lawson 

Number

Item Description Price per 

Cartridge

10683 2947B001 CLI-221, Cyan $13.00

10684 2948B001 CLI-221, Magenta $13.00

10685 2949B001 CLI-221, Yellow $13.00

10686 4479A003 Tank, Ink, BCI-3EBK, Black $15.00

10687 4530B007 PGI-225, Twin Pack, Black $27.00

10688 4546B001 CLI-226, Black $13.00

10689 4547B001 CLI-226, Cyan $13.00

10690 4548B001 CLI-226, Magenta $13.00

10691 4549B001 CLI-226, Yellow $13.00

10692 7621A001AA Toner, FX-7, Black $49.95

10693 DV16F Toner, 1250/135X, HY, Yellow $69.20

10694 769T5 Toner, 215X, HY, Cyan $95.90

10695 8WNV5 Toner, 215X, HY, Magenta $95.90

10696 DV16F Toner, 1250/135X, HY, Black $69.20

10697 FM064 Toner, 2130CN/35CN, HY, Black $78.80

10698 G7D0Y Toner, G7D0Y, HY, U & R, Black $212.80

10699 H516C Toner, 3130CN, HY, 9K, Black $188.00

10700 J9833 Toner, 1110/1100, 2k, Black $72.40

10701 K4971 Toner, 3100CN/3000CN, 4K, Black $56.00

10702 M6599 Drum, M6599, 35K $158.80

10703 M797K Toner, 2223D, Black $109.80

10704 N51XP Toner, 215X, HY, Black $98.00

10705 N848N Toner, N848N, HY, Black $135.00

10706 NF556 Toner, 3110/3115CN, Yellow $132.40

10707 NPDXG Toner, 215X, HY, Yellow $95.90

10708 P623N Drum, P623N, 50K, Black $89.00

10709 PDVTW Toner, 1250/135X, HY, Cyan $69.20

10710 PF029 Toner, 3110/3115CN, 8K, Cyan $132.40

10711 PF030 Toner, 3110CN/3115CN, 8K, Black $128.40

10712 PK496 Drum, Imaging, PK496, 30K $39.40

10713 RF013 Toner, 3110/3115CN, Magenta $132.40

10714 T229N Drum, T229N, 50K, Magenta $89.40

10715 U163N Drum, 163N, 50K, Cyan $89.40

10716 X951N Drum, X951N, 50K, Yellow $89.40

10717 DT615 Toner, 1320, Black $53.40

Section 3:  Dell

Vendor:  The Tree House, Inc.

Section 2:  Canon (cont'd)

Vendor: Laserlink International



Lawson 

Number

Item Description Price per 

Cartridge

10718 FM064 Toner, 2130, Black $77.25

10719 FM065 Toner, 2130, Cyan $107.00

10720 FM066 Toner, 2130, Yellow $107.00

10721 FM067 Toner, 2130, Magenta $107.00

10722 GD898 Toner, 5110, Black $66.40

10723 GD900 Toner, 5110, Cyan $204.50

10724 JD750 Toner, 5110, Yellow $204.50

10725 KD557 Toner, 5110, Magenta $204.50

10726 KU051 Toner, 1320, Cyan $71.40

10727 NF556 Toner, 3115, Yellow $132.40

10728 PN124 Toner, 1320, Yellow $71.40

10729 WM138 Toner, 1320, Magenta $71.40

10730 T033120 Ink, 960, Black $29.95

10731 T069120-D2 Ink, Dual Pack, Black $60.00

10732 T069120-S Ink, 69, Black $29.95

10733 T069220-S Ink, 69, Cyan $29.95

10734 T069320-S Ink, 69, Magenta $29.95

10735 T069420-S Ink, 69, Yellow $29.95

10736 T078120 Ink, Black $29.95

10737 T078120-S Ink, 78, Black $29.95

10738 T078220-S Ink, 78, Cyan $29.95

10739 T078320-S Ink, 78, Magenta $29.95

10740 T078420-S Ink, 78, Yellow $29.95

10741 T078520-S Ink, 78, Lt Cyan $29.95

10742 T078620-S Ink, 78, Lt Magenta $29.95

10743 T098120-S Ink, T098, High Capacity, Black $29.95

10744 T098920-S Ink, High Capacity, 5PK, Multicolor $29.95

Vendor: American Business Consultants, LLC

Section 4:  Epson 

Section 3:  Dell (cont'd)

Vendor:  The Tree House, Inc.



Lawson 

Number

Item Description Price per 

Cartridge

10745 51645A#140   Ink, Black $37.00

10746 92298A Toner, CRG, LJ, 98A $30.00

10747 B3B30FN#140 Ink, 920, Photo PK, CYN/MGNTA/YLW $22.00

10748 B3B30FN#140 Ink, 920, 3PK, TRICOLOR $22.00

10749 B3B32FN#140 Ink, 933, Photo PK, CYN/MGNTA/YLW $36.00

10750 B3B33FN#140 Ink,  564, 3/PK, Combo $60.00

10751 B3B33FN#140 Ink, 564, Photo PK, CYN/MGNTA/YLW $60.00

10752 C1823D Ink, CLR $20.00

10753 C233R Toner, 3330DN, U/R, HY, 14K, BLK $60.00

10754 C2P51FN#140 Ink, 564, Twin PK, HP, BLK $80.00

10755 C3903A Toner, CRG, F/5P, 5MP, 03A $40.00

10756 C3906A   Toner, CRG, LJ 5L, 06A $48.00

10757 C4092A Toner, 1100SE/1100ASE, 92A $80.00

10758 C4096A Toner, LJ 2100 SERIES, 96A $117.00

10759 C4127X Toner, Ultra Precise, 27X $129.00

10760 C4129X Toner, LJ5000 $100.00

10761 C4810A Printhead, #11, Black $38.00

10762 C4811A Printhead, #11, Cyan $38.00

10763 C4812A Printhead, #11, Magenta $38.00

10764 C4836A Cartridge, #11, Cyan $38.00

10765 C4836AN Printhead, #11, Yellow $38.00

10766 C4837A Cartridge, #11, Magenta $36.00

10767 C4838A Cartridge, #11, Yellow $39.00

10768 C4842A HP10 Yellow Ink $20.00

10769 C4843A HP10 Magenta Ink $20.00

10770 C4844A Cartridge, Ink, BLK $40.00

10771 C4900A Ink, HP 940, 2/PK,BLK AND YLW $40.00

10772 C4901A Ink, HP 940, Dual, MGNTA/CYAN $40.00

10773 C4902AN#140 Ink, HP 940, Black $28.00

10774 C4903AN#140 Ink HP 940, Cyan $28.00

10775 C4904AN#140 Ink, HP 940, Magenta $32.00

10776 C4905AN#140 Ink, HP 940, Yellow $33.00

10777 C4906AN#140 Ink,  HP 940XL, Black $33.00

10778 C4907AN#140 Ink, HP 940XL, Cyan $40.00

10779 C4908AN#140 Ink, HP 940XL, Magenta $34.00

10780 C4909AN#140 Ink, HP 940XL, Yellow $37.00

10781 C4920A Printhead, #14, Black $26.00

10782 C4921A, Cartridge, Printhead, #14, Cyan $34.00

Vendor:  CVR Computer Supplies

Section 5: Hewlett Packard



Lawson 

Number

Item Description Price per 

Cartridge

10783 C4922A Cartridge, Printhead, #14, Magenta $36.00

10784 C4923A, Cartridge, Printhead, #14, Yellow $36.00

10785 C5010D Cartridge, Ink, HP,#14, Tri-Color $26.00

10786 C6578DN#140   Cartridge, Inkjet, HP #78, Tri-Color $38.00

10787 C6614D Cartridge, Ink, #20,  610C $29.00

10788 C6615DN#140 Cartridge, Ink, #15, 810C/812C $36.00

10789 C6650FN Ink, HP 45A, Twin Pack, Black $59.00

10790 C6656AN#140 Cartridge, Ink, HP #56, Black $21.00

10791 C6657AN#140  Cartridge, Ink, HP#57, Tri-Color $34.00

10792 C7115A Cartridge, Print, C7115A $40.00

10793 C8061X Cartridge, Print SMRT $49.00

10794 C8543X Cartaridge, Print, LSRJT $280.00

10795 C8550A Caratridge, Black $120.00

10796 C8551A Cartridge, HP, Cyan $200.00

10797 C8552A Cartridge, HP, Yellow $200.00

10798 C8721WN#140 Cartridge, HP02, Black $30.00

10799 C8765WN#140 Ink Cartridge, Black, 94 $26.00

10800 C8766WN#140 Ink Cartridge, Tri-Color, 95 $29.00

10801 C8767WN#140 Ink Cartridge, 96, Black $36.00

10802 C8771WN#140 Cartridge, HP02, Cyan $14.00

10803 C8772WN#140 Cartridge, HP02, Magenta $14.00

10804 C8773WN#140 Cartridge, HP02, Yellow $14.00

10805 C8788FN#140 Ink, HP45A/78D, Combo, Black, Color $50.00

10806 C8789FN#140 Ink, HP 15/78, Combo, Black/Color $52.00

10807 C9337FN#140   Ink, HP 14D, Combo, Black/Color $50.00

10808 C9348FN#140   Ink, HP 96, Twin Pack, Black $60.00

10809 C9349FN#140 Ink, HP 97, Twin Pack, Tri-Color $64.00

10810 C9350FN#140   Ink, HP 94, Twin Pack, 2PK, Black $30.00

10811 C9352AN#140 Cartridge, Inkjet, HP22, Tri-Color $39.00

10812 C9353FN#140 Ink, HP 96/97, Combo, Black/Color $60.00

10813 C9354FN#140 Ink, HP 94/95, Combo, 2PK, BLK/CLR $29.00

10814 C9363WN#140 Ink Cartridge, Tri-Color, 97 $29.00

10815 C9364WN#140 Cartridge, Inkjet, Black $26.00

10816 C9369WN#140 Ink, Cartridge, Foto $20.00

10817 C9385AN#140 Cartridge, Ink, HP88, Black $24.00

10818 C9388AN#140 Cartridge, Ink, HP 88, Yellow $16.00

10819 C9391AN#140 Cartridge, Inkject, HP 88 XL, Cyan $24.00

10820 C9392AN#140 Cartridge, Ink, HP88 XL, Magenta $24.00

Section 5: Hewlett Packard (cont'd)

Vendor:  CVR Computer Supplies



Lawson 

Number

Item Description Price per 

Cartridge

10821 C9393AN#140 Cartridge, Inkjet, HP88 XL, Yellow $29.00

10822 C9396AN#140 Cartridge, Inkject, HP 88 XL, Black $48.00

10823 C9513FN#140 Ink, HP 92/93, Combo, Black/Color $59.00

10824 C9514FN#140 Ink, HP 98,Twin Pack, Black $40.00

10825 C9701A Cartridge, Lasejer, 2500, Cyan $40.00

10826 C9703A Cartridge, Laserjet, 2500, Magenta $40.00

10827 C9720A Cartridge, Laserjet 4600, Black $100.00

10828 C9721A Cartridge, Laserjet 4600, Cyan $140.00

10829 C9722A Cartrdige, Laserjet 4600, Yellow $140.00

10830 C9723A Cartaridge, Laserjet 4600, Magenta $140.00

10831 C9730A Cartridge, Laserject, Black $180.00

10832 C9731A Cartridge, Laserjet, Cyan $190.00

10833 C9732A Cartridge, Laserjet, Yellow $260.00

10834 C9733A Cartridge, Laserjet, Magenta $260.00

10835 CB304AN#140   Cartridge, Ink, Tri-Color $26.00

10836 CB316WN#140 Ink, HP 564, Black $18.00

10837 CB317WN#140 Ink, Photo, HP 564, Black $12.00

10838 CB318WN#140   Ink, HP 564, Cyan $12.00

10839 CB319WN#140   Ink, HP 564, Magenta $12.00

10840 CB320WN#140 Ink, HP 564, Yellow $12.00

10841 CB322WN#140 Ink, Photo, HP 564XL, Black $12.00

10842 CB323WN#140 Ink, HP 564XL, Cyan $12.00

10843 CB324WN#140 Ink, HP 564XL, Magenta $20.00

10844 CB325WN Ink, HP 564XL, Yellow $20.00

10845 CB334AN#140 Ink, #54, High Yield, Black $20.00

10846 CB335WN#140 Ink, HP 74, Black $14.00

10847 CB336WN#140 Ink, HP 74XL, High Yield, Black $22.00

10848 CB337WN#140 Ink, HP 75, Tri-Color $20.00

10849 CB338WN#140 Ink, HP 75XL, High Yield, Color $26.00

10850 CB435A Toner, Black $70.00

10851 CB436A Toner, Black $69.00

10852 CB436D Toner, Dual Pack, Black $136.00

10853 CC364A Toner, Black $149.00

10854 CC364X Toner, Black $200.00

10855 CC530A Toner, LJ, Black $70.00

10856 CC530AD Toner, CLJ, 2PK, Black $160.00

10857 CC531A Toner, LJ,Cyan $70.00

10858 CC532A Toner, LJ,Yellow $70.00

Section 5: Hewlett Packard (cont'd)

Vendor:  CVR Computer Supplies



Lawson 

Number

Item Description Price per 

Cartridge

10859 CC533A Toner, LJ, Magenta $70.00

10860 CC635A Ink, HP 701, Black $36.00

10861 CC640WN#140 Ink, Black $14.00

10862 CC641WN#140 Ink, Black $36.00

10863 CC643WN#140 Ink, Tri-Color $40.00

10864 CC644WN#140 Ink, Tri-Color $40.00

10865 CC653AN#140 Ink, Black $40.00

10866 CC654AN#140 Ink, Black $29.00

10867 CC656AN#140 Ink, Tri-Color $26.00

10868 CD886FN#140 Ink, 2/PK, Color $40.00

10869 CD942FN#140 Ink, 3PK, Black/Color $50.00

10870 CD943FN#140 Ink, HP 94/94/95, 3PK, Black/Color $60.00

10871 CD947FN#140 Ink, HP 60, Combo, Black/Color $30.00

10872 CD971AN#140   Ink, HP 920, Black $19.00

10873 CD972AN#140 Ink, HP 920XL, Cyan $14.00

10874 CD973AN#140 Ink, HP 920XL, Magenta $14.00

10875 CD974AN#140 Ink, HP 920XL, Yellow $14.00

10876 CD975AN#140 Ink, HP 920XL, Black $36.00

10877 CE250X Toner, Black $120.00

10878 CE255A Toner, LJ, Black $100.00

10879 CE260A Toner, Black $111.00

10880 CE261A Toner, Cyan $200.00

10881 CE262A Toner, Yellow $220.00

10882 CE263A Toner, Magenta $219.00

10883 CE270A Toner, LJ, Black $160.00

10884 CE271A Toner, LJ, Cyan $200.00

10885 CE272A Toner, LJ, Yellow $200.00

10886 CE273A Toner, LJ, Magenta $200.00

10887 CE278A Toner, LJ, Black $60.00

10888 CE278D Toner, HP 78A, Dual Pack, Black $136.00

10889 CE285A Toner, LJ, Black $52.00

10890 CE390A Toner, HP 90A, Black $140.00

10891 CE390X Toner, Laserjet, HP90X, Black $240.00

10892 CE390XD Toner, HP 90X, Dual Pack, LJ, Black $360.00

10893 CE400A   Toner, HP 507A Black LJ $120.00

10894 CE401A Toner, HP 507A Cyan $150.00

10895 CE402A Toner, HP 507A Yellow $150.00

10896 CE403A Toner, HP 507A Magenta $150.00

Section 5: Hewlett Packard (cont'd)

Vendor:  CVR Computer Supplies



Lawson 

Number

Item Description Price per 

Cartridge

10897 CE410A Toner, HP 305A, Laserjet, Black $60.00

10898 CE410X Toner, HP 305X, Laserjet, Black $80.00

10899 CE411A Toner, HP 305A, Laserjet, Cyan $88.00

10900 CE412A Toner, HP 305A, Laserjet, Yellow $88.00

10901 CE413A Toner, HP 305A, Laserjet, Magenta $88.00

10902 CE505A Toner, Black $89.00

10903 CE505D Toner, Laser, 2PK, Black $162.00

10904 CE505X Toner, High Yield, Black $129.00

10905 CF280A   Toner, HP 80A, Black $84.00

10906 CG845AN#140 HP 60 Series Photo Value Pack $36.00

10907 CH563WN#140 Ink, HP 61XL, Black $26.00

10908 CH564WN#140 Ink, HP 61XL, Tri-Color $29.00

10909 CH634AN#140 Ink, HP 920, Cyan $20.00

10910 CH635AN#140 Ink, HP 920, Magenta $20.00

10911 CH636AN#140 Ink, HP 920, Yellow $20.00

10912 CN045AN#140   Ink, HP,950, XL, Black $36.00

10913 CN046AN#140 Ink, HP,951, XL, Cyan $26.00

10914 CN047AN#140 Ink, HP,951, XL, Magenta $24.00

10915 CN048AN#140 Ink, HP,951, XL, Yellow $24.00

10916 CN049AN#140 Ink, HP,950, Black $22.00

10917 CN050AN#140 Ink, HP,951S, Cyan $17.00

10918 CN051AN#140 Ink, HP,951, Magenta $17.00

10919 CN052AN#140 Ink, HP,951, Yellow $17.00

10920 CN053AN#140 Ink, HP 932XL, Officejet, Black $28.00

10921 CN054AN#140 Ink, Officejet,HP 933XL, Cyan $34.00

10922 CN055AN#140 Ink, Officejet,HP 933XL, Magenta $34.00

10923 CN056AN#140 Ink, HP 933XL, Officejet, Yellow $20.00

10924 CN057AN#140 Ink, HP 932, Officejet, Black $26.00

10925 CN058AN#140 Ink, Officejet, HP 933, Cyan $10.00

10926 CN059AN#140 Ink, HP 933, Officejet, Magenta $10.00

10927 CN060AN#140 Ink, HP 933, Officejet, Yellow $10.00

10928 CN065FN#140 Ink, HP 940, 3PK, Tri-Color $30.00

10929 CN069FN#140 Ink, HP 901, 2/PK, Combo $40.00

10930 CN684WN#140 Ink, HP 564XL, Black $26.00

10931 CR314FN#140 Ink, HP,951,Combo, all colors $60.00

10932 CZ071FN#140 Ink, HP 60, Twin Cartridge, Black $46.00

10933 CZ141FN#140 Ink, HP 564, CMY, BLKXL, Combo $60.00

10934 CZ143FN#140 Ink, HP 940, CMY, BLKXL, Combo $40.00

Section 5: Hewlett Packard (cont'd)

Vendor:  CVR Computer Supplies



Lawson 

Number

Item Description Price per 

Cartridge

10935 HEWC3909A Toner, MCRFN, HP, 5SISIMX, BK $80.00

10936 HEWC3909A Toner, 8100 Series, HP $80.00

10937 HEWC4911A Cartridge, Ink, HP #82, Cyan $35.00

10938 HEWC4912A   Ink ,#82, Magenta $35.00

10939 HEWC4913A Ink ,#82 Yellow $35.00

10940 HEWC4933A Dye, NO.81, DNJT5000, YW $20.00

10941 HEWC4951A Printhead, #81 Cyan Dye $20.00

10942 HEWC6602A Cartridge, Inkjet, Black $14.00

10943 HEWC8091A Caratrdige, LJ9000, Staple $14.00

10944 HEWC8554A Kit, LJ9500 Image Cleaning $30.00

10945 HEWC8555A Kit, LJ9500 Image Transfer $100.00

10946 HEWC8556A Kit, LJ9500 Image Fuser $60.00

10947 HEWC8560A Drum, LJ 9500, Black $40.00

10948 HEWC8561A   Drum, LJ 9500, Cyan $200.00

10949 HEWC8562A Drum, LJ 9500, Yellow $200.00

10950 HEWC8563A Drum, LJ 9500, Magenta $200.00

10951 HEWC9370A DNJ, HP 72, 130ML, PB $50.00

10952 HEWC9371A DNJ, HP 72, 130ML, CY $50.00

10953 HEWC9372A DNJ, HP 72, 130ML, MA $50.00

10954 HEWC9373A DNJ, HP 72, 130ML, YW $50.00

10955 HEWC9374A DNJ, HP 72, 130ML, GY $50.00

10956 HEWC9381A Printhead, HP 88, Black/Yellow $60.00

10957 HEWC9382A Printhead, HP 88, Magenta/Cyan $60.00

10958 HEWC9403A DNJ, HP 72, 130ML, MTT B $60.00

10959 HEWC9725A Kit, Fuser for HPLJ4600, 110VOLT $80.00

10960 HEWCE265A Toner, Collection $30.00

10961 HEWQ2682A Cartridge, CLJ3700, Yellow $40.00

10962 HEWQ2683A Cartridge, CLJ3700, Magenta $40.00

10963 HEWQ3964A Drum, Imaging, LJ2550 $60.00

10964 HP Q3675A Transfer Kit, Replace HP 4600 $70.00

10965 Q1338A Cartridge, HP Laserjet 4200 $90.00

10966 Q1339A Cartridge, HP Laserjet 4300 $120.00

10967 Q2610A Toner, 10A, Smart Print $111.00

10968 Q2612A Cartridge, Laser $72.00

10969 Q2670A   Toner, F/CLJ3500, Black $40.00

10970 Q5942A Cartrdige, LJ, 4250/4350 $130.00

10971 Q5942X   Cartridge, Laser $240.00

10972 Q5945A Toner, LJ, Black $100.00
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10973 Q5945AC Toner, LJ, Black $290.00

10974 Q5949A Toner, Black $60.00

10975 Q6000A Toner, Color Laserjet, 00A, Black $30.00

10976 Q6001A Toner, Color Laserjet, 01A, Cyan $30.00

10977 Q6002A Toner, Color Laserjet, 02A, Yellow $30.00

10978 Q6003A Toner, Coloer Laserjet, PRN, Magenta $30.00

10979 Q6470A Toner, LJ, 2/PK, Black $60.00

10980 Q6511A Toner, Black $139.00

10981 Q7516A Cartridge, Laserjet, Black $160.00

10982 Q7551A   Toner, Laserjet, Black $146.00

10983 Q7551X   Toner, Laserjet, Black $200.00

10984 Q7551XD Toner, 2PK, Black $400.00

10985 Q7553A Cartridge, LJ, Black $80.00

10986 Q7581A Cartridge, Laserjet, Cyan $100.00

10987 Q7582A Cartrdige, Toner, Yellow $100.00

10988 HP 88XL (C9393AN Ink, Yellow $36.00

10989 HP 305A / CE411A IPW Preservce 545-11A-ODP $60.00

10990 HP C9720A  Toner, Laser, 4600, Black $158.00

10991 HP C9721A Toner, Laser, 4600, Cyan $140.00

10992 HP C9722A Toner, Laser, 4600, Yellow $140.00

10993 HP C9723A Toner, Laser, Magenta, 4600 $140.00

10994 HP C9730A Toner, Color, LJ, 5500/5550, Black $180.00

10995 HP C9731A  Toner, LJ 5500/5500, Cyan $190.00

10996 HP C9732A Toner, Color, LJ, 5500/5550, Yellow $260.00

10997 HP C9733A  Toner, 5500/5550, Color LJ, Magenta $260.00

10998 HP CE261A Toner, CP4025/4525, Cyan $100.00

10999 HP CE262A Toner, CP4025/4525, Yellow $100.00

11000 HP CE263A Toner, CP4025/4525, Magenta $100.00

11001 HP CE505A Toner, LJ P2035/P2055, Black $89.00

11002 HP CE505X Tkoner, MICR, LJ P2055 Series, BK $129.00

11003 HP Q1339A  Cartridge, Toner, HP LJ4300 $80.00

11004 HP Q7551A  Toner, LJ 3005/M3035/3027, BK $146.00
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11005 KNM1710517002 Toner, Magicolor 2300, STD Yellow $30.00

11006 KNM1710517003 Toner, Magicolor 2300, STD Magenta $30.00

11007 KNM1710517004 Cartridge, CLJ3700, Cyan $30.00

11008 KNM1710517005 Toner, Magicolor, 2300 Black $35.00

11009 64015HA Toner, High Yield $289.00

11010 12A7462 Toner, T630, Black $199.00

11011 KX-FA83A Toner, Fax, KX-FA83A $24.00

11012 RIC405533 Toner, Cyan $34.80

11013 RIC405534 Toner, Magenta $34.80

11014 RIC405536 Toner, High Yield,  Black $34.80

11015 RIC405538 Toner, Magenta $34.80

11016 RIC405539 Toner, Yellow $34.80

11017 AL110TD Toner, AL110TD $77.77

Section 6: Konica

Vendor: Laserlink International Inc.

Section 10: Sharp

Vendor: Computer Networking Inc.

Section 7: Lexmark

Vendor: Laserlink International Inc.

Section 8: Panasonic

Vendor: Laserlink International Inc.

Section 9: Ricoh

Vendor: The Tree House Inc.


