
Description Allied Tube                      

Harey IL

Custom 

Products                

Jackson MS

Lighte  

Enterprises of 

Ohio                                                      

Frankfort OH                        

Lowen Sign 

Company                  

Hutchinson 

KS

MD Solutions                                   

Plain City OH

Osburn 

Associates                  

Logan OH

Pathmark 

Traffic 

Products of 

Texas                                             

San Marcus 

TX

Trantex 

Trans. 

Products of 

Texas                                                  

Houston TX

US Standard 

Sign                        

Franklin Park 

IL

Vulcan Signs                                     

Foley AL

Section 1:                                        

Complete Signs

No Bid $12,518.00 $15,433.00 No Bid No Bid $13,418.00 $15,346.00 No Bid No Bid $12,063.00

Section 2:                                           

Blanks

No Bid $137,664.70 No Bid $154,814.95 No Bid $133,152.45 $146,116.00 No Bid $123,227.40 $116,154.70

Section 3:                                            

Telespar Sign Support 

System

$366,004.00 $348,269.00 Disqualified: 

Did not bid all 

items

No Bid $359,046.00 No Bid $354,388.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section 4:                                            

Construction Supplies

No Bid No Bid Disqualified: 

Did not bid all 

items

No Bid No Bid No Bid $190,100.00 $196,975.00 No Bid No Bid

Section 5:                                              

Carsonite Products

No Bid $25,500.00 $21,345.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,450.00 $31,125.00 No Bid $17,250.00

Section 6:                                             

3M Products

No Bid $298,646.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid $310,287.05 Disqualified: 

Did not bid all 

items

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section 7:                                    

Avery Dennison Products

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Disqualified: 

Did not bid all 

Avery 

Dennison-

mixed with 3M

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section 8:                                          

Cutting Knives

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section 9:                                       

Tape/Sheeting

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,282.20 $15,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section 10:                                                      

Banding Materials

No Bid $438.56 $292.00 No Bid $283.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,228.67

Recommendation:  Low bidder per section

Fort Bend County Tabulation

BID 14-008

Term Contract for Traffic Signs Posts and Supplies

Term:  1 October 2013 through 30 September 2014



Description Allied Tube                      

Harey IL

Custom 

Products                

Jackson MS

Lighte  

Enterprises of 

Ohio                                                      

Frankfort OH                        

Lowen Sign 

Company                  

Hutchinson 

KS

MD Solutions                                   

Plain City OH

Osburn 

Associates                  

Logan OH

Pathmark 

Traffic 

Products of 

Texas                                             

San Marcus 

TX

Trantex 

Trans. 

Products of 

Texas                                                  

Houston TX

US Standard 

Sign                        

Franklin Park 

IL

Vulcan Signs                                     

Foley AL

Section 11:                                     

Safety Vests

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,275.00 No Bid No Bid

Section 12:                                        

Stop/Slow Paddles

No Bid No Bid $1,047.00 No Bid No Bid $747.80 No Bid $1,147.50 No Bid $681.30

Section 13:                                   

Miscellaneous

No Bid No Bid Disqualified: 

Did not bid all 

items

No Bid No Bid No Bid $106,030.00 $81,415.00 No Bid No Bid


