Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 13-008
Golfview Drive and Regional Drainage Facilities-Phase 1-Paving and Drainage
Improvements

Recommendation: Hassell Construction
Funding: Mobility Project 709

Company Total Bid Completion Time in
Calendar Days

Hassell Construction $4,751,060.00 300
Houston
Allgood Construction $4,878,041.02 300
Stafford
Conrad Construction $4,943,854.30 300
Houston
SER Construction $5,066,843.20 300
Pasadena
Hurtado Construction $5,128,046.93 275
Richmond
Triple B Services $5,223,191.15 300
Huffman
Lazer Construction $5,368,401.10 300
Houston
Durwood Greene Construction $5,699,956.40 280
Stafford
Harris Construction Disqualified: Failed to provide proof of general liability an
Houston automobile insurance as required.




KELLY R. KALUZA & ASSOCIATES, INC.
Consulting Engineers & Surveyors
Engineering Firm No. F-1339
3014 Avenue I, Rosenberyg, Texas 77471
(281) 341-0808 ® FAX (281) 341-6333

March 25, 2013

Honorable Judge Robert E. Hebert
Fort Bend County

301 Jackson Street

Richmond, Texas 77469

RE: Engineer's Recommendation of Award of Construction Contract for Golfview Drive
(Mobility Project No. 709) and Regional Drainage Facilities Phase 1 - Paving and
Drainage Improvements, Bid #13-008, Fort Bend County, Texas

Dear Judge Hebert:

Construction bids were received and formally opened at 1:30 p.m. on Thursday, March 21, 2013 for
the above-referenced project. A total of nine (9) construction bids were received and opened.

A summary of the bids with the Base Bid amount and number of working days are as follows:

Base Bid Total Number of
Contractor Amount Working Days
Hassell Construction Company, Inc. $4,751,060.00 300
Allgood Construction Company, Inc. $4,878,041.02 300
Conrad Construction Co., Ltd. $4,943,854.30 300
SER Construction Partners, LLC $5,066,843.20 300
Hurtado Construction, Inc. $5,128,046.93 275
Triple B Services, L.L.P. $5,223,191.15 300
Lazer Construction Company, Inc. $5,368,401.10 300
Durwood Greene Construction Co. $5,699,956.40 280

The bids were checked for completeness by the County. Harris Construction Company was
disqualified for not providing proof of insurance. The bids were checked for mathematical errors by
our firm. Hassell Construction Company, Inc. made a minor multiplication error lowering their bid
by $900.00, Allgood Construction Company, Inc. made two minor numerical written errors but it
did not change their total, Conrad Construction Co., Ltd. wrote an incorrect total on the summary
page for Drainage, SER Construction Partners, LLC. made multiplication errors, Triple B Services,
L.L.P. had differences between written and numerical amounts resulting in multiplication errors, and
Lazer Construction Company, Inc. did not write in any written amounts, but none of the errors
changed the bid status of any bidder. Hassell Construction Company, Inc. submitted the low bid for
the project. We have worked with Hassell Construction Company, Inc. on similar projects in the
past and find them to be competent. We are recommending that Fort Bend County accept the
construction bids received on the project and enter into a construction contract with the low bidder,
Hassell Construction Company, Inc. for the Base Bid amount of $4,751,060.00.



Honorable Judge Robert E. Hebert
Fort Bend County

March 25, 2013

Page Two (2)

If you have any questions, please contact me.

Sincerely,

KELLY R. KALUZA & ASSOCIATES, INC.

Duane H, Whitehead, P.E.
Project Engineer

DHW/lao
Enclosures

cc: Hassell Construction Co., Inc.
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ENGINEER:
KELLY R. KALUZA & ASSOCIATES, INC.
3014 AVENUE |

ROSENBERG, TEXAS 77471

(281) 341-0808

GOLFVIEW DRIVE (MOBILITY PROJECT NO. 709)
AND REGIONAL DRAINAGE FACILITIES PHASE | - PAVING AND DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS
FORT BEND COUNTY, TEXAS
BID OPENING DATE - THURSDAY, MARCH 21, 2013 - 1:30 P.M.

OWNER:
FORT BEND COUNTY PURCHASING DEPT.
301 JACKSON STREET SUITE 201
RICHMOND, TEXAS 77469

(281) 341-8643

BID TABULATION Page 1 of 3
||BIDDERS: HASSELL CONSTRUCTION | ALLGOOD CONSTRUCTION | CONRAD CONSTRUCTION SER CONSTRUCTION HURTADO CONSTRUCTION TRIPLE B SERVICES LAZER CONSTRUCTION DURWOOD GREENE
1. BASE BID - DRAINAGE EST. UNIT| UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTALPRICE | UNITPRICE | TOTAL PRICE
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANT

1 8 X4'PRECAST CONCRETE BOX STORM SEW CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL 30|LF | 365.00 [ $  10,950.00 | $ 43749 | $  13,12470 | $ 400.00 | $  12,000.00 | $ 382.00 | $ 11,460.00 | $ 453.00 | $  13,590.00 | $ 385.00 [ $  11,550.00 | $ 38491 (¢  11,547.30 | $ 500.00 [ $  15,000.00
2 8'X5'PRECAST CONCRETE BOX STORM SEW., CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL 1,980(LF  |$ 350.00 [ $  693,000.00 | $ 42753 | $  846,509.40 | $ 370.00 | $  732,600.00 | $ 462.00 | $  914,760.00 | $ 418.00 | $ 827,640.00 | $ 416.00 | $ 823,680.00 | $ 39401 ($ 780,139.80 | $ 440.00 | $  871,200.00
3 8'X5'PRECAST CONCRETE BOX STORM SEW., STAND. BEDDING & BACKFILL 180|LF | $ 380.00 [ $  68,400.00 | $ 391.06 [ $  70,390.80 | $ 360.00 | $  64,800.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 72,000.00 | $ 380.00 [ $  68,400.00 | $ 416.00 | $  74,880.00 | $ 39212 ($  70,581.60 | $ 400.00 | $  72,000.00
4 8'X 6' PRECAST CONCRETE BOX STORM SEW., CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL solLF | s 465.00 | $  23,250.00 | $ 477.86 | $  23,893.00 | $ 44500 | $  22,250.00 | $ 422.00 | $ 21,100.00 | $ 542.00 [ $  27,200.00 | $ 44300 | $  22,150.00 | $ 47467 | $  23,733.50 | $ 600.00 [ $  30,000.00
5 8'X6'PRECAST CONCRETE BOX STORM SEW., STAND. BEDDING & BACKFILL 80|LF |3 410.00 | $  32,800.00 | $ 41155 | $  32,924.00 | $ 38500 | $  30,800.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 418.00 | $  33,440.00 | $ 443.00 | $  35,440.00 | $ 42460 | $  33,968.00 | $ 440.00 | $  35,200.00
6 7'X5'PRECAST CONCRETE BOX STORM SEW., CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL 2,730[LF | 343.00 [ $  936,390.00 | $ 368.55 | $ 1,006,141.50 | $ 355.00 | $  969,150.00 | $ 421.00 | $ 1,149,330.00 | $ 408.00 | $ 1,113,840.00 | $ 388.00 | $ 1,059,240.00 | $ 374.84 | $ 1,023,313.20 | $ 430.00 | $ 1,173,900.00
7 6'X5'PRECAST CONCRETE BOX STORM SEW., CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL 450|LF S 311.00 [ $ 139,950.00 S 355.85 [ $ 160,132.50 S 315.00 | $ 141,750.00 | $ 363.00 | $ 163,350.00 | $ 358.00 [ $ 161,100.00 | $ 341.00 [ $ 153,450.00 S 336.25 ($  151,312.50 S 390.00 [ $ 175,500.00
8  5'X5' PRECAST CONCRETE BOX STORM SEW., CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL 370[LF [ s 271.00 [ $  100,270.00 | $ 31939 [ $ 11817430 | $ 275.00 [ $  101,750.00 | $ 30000 | $  111,000.00 | $ 328.00 [ $ 121,360.00 | $ 300.00 [ $  111,000.00 | $ 29411 ($ 10882070 | $ 350.00 [ $  129,500.00
9  5'X4' PRECAST CONCRETE BOX STORM SEW., CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL Q|LF |3 250.00 [ $  22,500.00 | $ 28423 ($  25580.70 | $ 245.00 [ $  22,050.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 24,750.00 | $ 288.00 [ $  25920.00 | $ 265.00 [ $  23,850.00 | $ 27642 (¢ 24877.80 | $ 305.00 [ $  27,450.00
10 48" REINFORC. CONCRETE PIPE, CLASS IIl STAND. BEDDING & BACKFILL 10|LF |$ 130.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 12483 | $ 1,248.30 | $ 144.00 | $ 1,440.00 | $ 156.00 | $ 1,560.00 | $ 138.00 | $ 1,380.00 | $ 137.00 | $ 1,370.00 | $ 167.50 | $ 1,675.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 1,600.00
11 42" REINFORC. CONCRETE PIPE,CLASS IIl STAND. BEDDING & BACKFILL 10|LF |$ 105.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 104.95 | $ 1,049.50 | $ 126.00 | $ 1,260.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 1,350.00 | $ 128.00 | $ 1,280.00 | $ 117.00 | $ 1,170.00 | $ 12427 | $ 1,242.70 | $ 140.00 | $ 1,400.00
12 42" REINFORC. CONCRETE PIPE, CLASS IIl CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL 10|LF |$ 120.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 129.20 | $ 1,292.00 | $ 161.00 | $ 1,610.00 | $ 136.00 | $ 1,360.00 | $ 158.00 | $ 1,580.00 | $ 121.00 | $ 1,210.00 | $ 12427 | $ 1,242.70 | $ 170.00 | $ 1,700.00
13 30" REINFORC. CONCRETE PIPE, CLASS IIl CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL 60|LF | $ 83.00 | $ 4,980.00 | $ 82.05[$  4923.00|% 113.00 | $ 6,780.00 | $ 89.00 [ $ 5,340.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 6,480.00 | $ 76.00 | $ 4,560.00 | $ 64.16 | $ 3,849.60 | $ 130.00 | $ 7,800.00
14 30" REINFORC. CONCRETE PIPE, CLASS IIl STAND. BEDDING & BACKFILL 30|LF | 69.00 | $ 2,070.00 | $ 64.44 | $ 1,933.20 | $ 80.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 93.00 | $ 2,790.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 3,240.00 | $ 76.00 | $ 2,280.00 | $ 64.91 | $ 1,947.30 | $ 120.00 | $ 3,600.00
15 24" REINFORC. CONCRETE PIPE, CLASS IIl STAND. BEDDING & BACKFILL aF | 51.00 | $ 2,040.00 | $ 4496 | $ 1,798.40 | $ 56.00 | $ 2,240.00 | $ 71.00 | $ 2,840.00 | $ 68.00 | $ 2,720.00 | $ 59.00 | $ 2,360.00 | $ 39.81 [ $ 1,592.40 | $ 75.00 | $ 3,000.00
16 24" REINFORC. CONCRETE PIPE, CLASS Ill CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL 300[LF [ 63.00 [ $  18,900.00 | $ 6091 [$  18,273.00 | $ 74.00 [ $  22,200.00 | $ 71.00 | $ 21,300.00 | $ 108.00 [ $  32,400.00 | $ 59.00 [ $  17,700.00 | $ 4397 ($  13,191.00 | $ 120.00 [ $  36,000.00
17 24" HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE PIPE, CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL 60|LF | $ 48.00 | $ 2,880.00 | $ 5111 | $ 3,066.60 | $ 66.00 | $ 3,960.00 | $ 68.00 | $ 4,080.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 6,480.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 3541 $ 2,124.60 | $ 120.00 | $ 7,200.00
18 18" REINFORC. CONCRETE PIPE, CLASS IlI, STAND. BEDDING & BACKFILL 60|LF | 46.00 | $ 2,760.00 | $ 4268 |$ 2,560.80 | $ 48.00 | $ 2,880.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 58.00 | $ 3,480.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 3,240.00 | $ 35.49 | $ 2,129.40 | $ 67.00 | $ 4,020.00
19 18" REINFORC. CONCRETE PIPE, CLASS IIl, CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL 20|F |3 55.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 58.64 | $ 1,172.80 | $ 60.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 64.00 | $ 1,280.00 | $ 188.00 | $ 3,760.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $ 4125 | $ 825.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 4,000.00
20 4" PVC ASTM D-2241, SDR-26 PIPE (YARD DRAIN) W/CLEANOUT altF | 15.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 2581 $ 1,032.40 | $ 25.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 520.00 | $ 1454 | $ 581.60 | $ 70.00 | $ 2,800.00
21 3" PVC ASTM D-2241, SDR-26 PIPE (YARD DRAIN) W/CLEANOUT aF | 14.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 2375 | $ 950.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 62.00 | $ 2,480.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 480.00 | $ 1202 | $ 480.80 | $ 69.00 | $ 2,760.00
22 TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORM SEW. EXCAV. IN ACCORD. W/OSHA STAND. AT ALL REQ. LOC. 6,640[LF | 1.00 | $ 6,640.00 | $ 026 1,726.40 | $ 1.00|$ 6,640.00 | $ 0.10 | $ 664.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 6,640.00 | $ 025 1,660.00 | $ 216 |$ 1434240 | $ 1.00 | $ 6,640.00
23 STORM SEW. MANHOLE 48" TO 72" 1{EA |$  4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 5678.75 | $ 5678.75 | $  2,810.00 | $ 2,810.00 | $  6,300.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $  3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $  3,600.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $  2,232.35|$ 2,23235($  3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
24 STORM SEW. MANHOLE ON REINFORC. CONCRETE BOX 13[EA |$ 200000 |$ 2600000 |$ 1,548.75|$ 20,133.75|$ 1,580.00 | $  20,540.00 | $  1,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $  1,100.00 | $  14,300.00 | $  1,500.00 | $  19,500.00 | $  1,000.89 | $  13,011.57 | $  1,400.00 | $  18,200.00
25 STORM SEW. JUNCTION BOX 10{EA |$ 7,400.00 | $  74,000.00 | $ 10,325.00 | $ 103,250.00 | $ 6,750.00 | $  67,500.00 | $  8,000.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 15,500.00 | $ 155,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 150,000.00 | $ 7,058.39|$  70,583.90 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 170,000.00
26 STORM SEW. JUNCTION BOX FOR 18" & 24" STORM 1{ea |$ 860.00 | $ 860.00 [ $  1,961.75 | $ 1,961.75 [ $  2,400.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $  1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $  2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $  4,700.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $  3,248.32|$ 324832 |$ 220000 | $ 2,200.00
27 8'X6'PRECAST 51° BEND 1{EA |$  3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,923.50 | $ 3,923.50 | $  2,750.00 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 [ $  3,168.00 | $ 3,168.00 | $ 13,420.00 | $  13,420.00 | $  2,961.90 | $ 2,961.90 | $  4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
28 8'X5' PRECAST 45° BEND 2(1EA |$ 260000 ]S 5200.00 | $ 3,474.36 | $ 6,948.72 | $  2,350.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $  3,028.00 | $ 6,056.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $  12,800.00 | $ 2,805.30 | $ 5610.60 | $  3,500.00 | $ 7,000.00
29 7'X5'PRECAST 16° BEND 2(EA |$  2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 3,391.76 | $ 6,783.52 | $  2,250.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $  2,828.00 | $ 5656.00 | $ 5900.00 |$ 11,800.00 | $ 2,587.14 | $ 517428 | $  3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
30 7'X5'PRECAST 17° BEND 2(1EA |$ 250000 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 3,391.76 | $ 6,783.52 | $  2,250.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $  2,828.00 | $ 5656.00 | $ 590000 |$ 11,800.00 | $ 2,587.14|$ 517428 | $  3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
31 7'X5'PRECAST 8° BEND 2(EA |$  2,5500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 3,391.76 | $ 6,783.52 | $  2,250.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $  2,828.00 | $ 5656.00 | $ 5900.00 |$ 11,800.00 | $ 2,587.14 | $ 517428 | $  3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
32 7'X5' PRECAST 6° BEND 2(EA |$  2,5500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 3,391.76 | $ 6,783.52 | $  2,250.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $  2,828.00 | $ 5656.00 | $ 590000 |$ 11,800.00 | $ 2,587.14 | $ 5174.28 | $  3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
33 6'X5' PRECAST 8° BEND 2(1EA |$ 210000 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 3,009.74 | $ 6,019.48 | $  2,250.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $  2,828.00 | $ 5656.00 | $ 5900.00 |$ 11,800.00 | $ 2,587.14 | $ 517428 | $  3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
34 TYPE "E" INLET 1{EA |$  4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 5317.38 | $ 5317.38 | $  2,560.00 | $ 2,560.00 | $  5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $  6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $  5,5500.00 | $ 5500.00 | $ 3,843.82|$ 3,843.82 | $  6,500.00 | $ 6,500.00
35 TYPE "H-2" INLET 15(EA |$ 220000 |$ 33,000.00 | $ 2,039.19|$ 30587.85|$ 2,390.00|$  35850.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $  34,500.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $  39,000.00 | $ 2,017.24|$  30,258.60 | $ 2,500.00 | $  37,500.00
36 TYPE"C" INLET 2(1EA |$ 210000 $ 4,200.00 | $ 2,891.00 | $ 5782.00 | $  2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $  3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $  3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $  2,800.00 | $ 5600.00 | $ 1,854.46 | $ 3,708.92 | $  3,300.00 | $ 6,600.00
37 TYPE "C-1" INLET 9EA |$ 220000|$ 19,800.00 | $ 2,736.13 | $ 2462517 [$ 2,860.00 [ $  25740.00 [ $  3,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 3,400.00 | $  30,600.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $  28,800.00 | $ 2,501.68 | $  22,515.12 |$ 3,700.00 | $  33,300.00
38 TYPE "A" INLET 2(EA |$  1,000.00|$ 2,00000 | $  1,910.13 | $ 3,82026 | $  1,430.00 | $ 2,860.00 | $  1,400.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $  1,800.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $  1,800.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 1,153.98 | $ 2,307.96 | $  2,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
39 BRICK PLUG FOR 24" REINFORC. CONCRETE PIPE 2(eA | 280.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 258.13 | $ 516.26 | $ 350.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 2,003 370.00 | $ 740.00 | $ 218.70 | $ 43740 | $ 100.00 | $ 200.00
40 BRICK PLUG FOR 5' X 4' REINFORC. CONCRETE BOX 1{EA |$  1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 516.25 | $ 516.25 | $  1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 [ $  1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 655.00 | $ 655.00 | $ 40113 | $ 40113 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00
41 BRICK PLUG FOR 8' X 4' REINFORC. CONCRETE BOX 1{EA |$  2,400.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 826.00 | $ 826.00 | $  1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 [ $  1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 594.54 | $ 594.54 [ $  1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
42 5" THICK CONCRETE SLOPE PAVEMENT 2,700[sy |$ 75.00 [ $  202,500.00 | $ 47.50 [ $  128,250.00 | $ 66.00 [ $ 178,200.00 | $ 4300 |$  116,100.00 | $ 55.00 [ $  148,500.00 | $ 48.00 [ $  129,600.00 | $ 2860 |$  77,220.00 | $ 60.00 [ $  162,000.00
43 CONNECT EXISTING 1-1/2" PVC DRAIN TO INLET 1{ea |$ 350.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 516.25 | $ 516.25 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 161.00 | $ 161.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 268.89 | $ 268.89 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
44 CONNECT EXISTING 3" PVC DRAIN TO INLET 1{ea |$ 380.00 | $ 380.00 | $ 77438 | $ 77438 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 284.01 | $ 284.01 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
45 CONNECT 5' X 4' REINFORC. CONCRETE BOX STORM SEW. TO EXISTING 27" STORM SEW. 1{EA |$  2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $  1,858.50 | $ 1,858.50 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 | $  1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $  3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $  4,700.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $  2,191.20 | $ 2,191.20 | $  4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
46 REMV & DSPSE OF EXIST. CONCRETE INLET STRUCT. TO SUIT. LNDFLL OR APRVD EQUAL aleA | s 290.00 | $ 1,160.00 | $ 877.63 | $ 3,510.52 | $ 300.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 765.00 | $ 3,060.00 | $ 296.57 | $ 1,186.28 | $ 400.00 | $ 1,600.00
47 REMV & DSPSE OF EXIST. STORM SEW. MANHOLE TO SUIT. LNDFLL OR APRVD EQUAL 1{ea |$ 540.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 980.88 | $ 980.88 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 25000 [ $  2,275.00 | $ 2,275.00 | $ 750.04 | $ 750.04 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00
48 REMV & DSPSE OF EXIST. CONCRETE SLOPE PAVEMENT TO SUIT. LNDFLL OR APRVD EQUAL 250|sy | $ 24.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 878 |$ 2,195.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 2,250.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 9.25 | $ 2,312.50 | $ 12623 3,155.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 3,750.00
49 REMV & DSPSE OF EXIST. STORM SEW. PIPE TO SUIT. LNDFLL OR APRVD EQUAL 1,300(LF  |$ 39.00 [ $  50,700.00 | $ 1033 | $  13,429.00 | $ 950 [$  12,350.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 19,500.00 | $ 3.80 | $ 4,940.00 | $ 21.00 | $  27,300.00 | $ 2856 [ $  37,128.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 6,500.00
50 REMV & DSPSE OF EXIST. PIPE CULVERT HEADWALL TO SUIT. LNDFLL OR APRVD EQUAL 6/EA |$ 230000|$ 13,800.00 | $ 567.88 | $ 3,407.28 | $ 150.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 765.00 | $ 4,590.00 | $ 29833 | $ 1,789.98 | $ 600.00 | $ 3,600.00
51 REMV & SALVAGE EXIST. LANDSCAPE 1f{ts |$  1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $  1,548.75 | $ 1,548.75 [ $  1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 [ $  1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 800.00 [ $  6,300.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 3,109.54 | $ 3,109.54 | $  1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
52 REMV, SALVAGE, & REPLACE EXIST. SIGN 1f{ts |$  1,20000]$ 1,20000 | $  1,174.99 | $ 1,174.99 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 560.00 [ $  2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $  2,900.00 | $ 2,900.00 | $ 21717 | $ 217.17 [ $  2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
53 REMV, SALVAGE, & REPLACE EXIST. MAILBOX s | 230.00 | $ 23000 [ $  1,239.00 | $ 1,239.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 | $  1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $  1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $  2,900.00 | $ 2,900.00 | $ 325.17 | $ 325.17 [ $  2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
I. TOTAL AMOUNT OF BASE BID - DRAINAGE = $ 2,558,570.00 | $ 2,743,823.05 | $ 2,548,670.00 | $ 2,884,025.00 | $ 2,927,606.00 | $ 2,890,647.50 | $ 2,588,731.71 | $ 3,124,220.00
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ENGINEER: GOLFVIEW DRIVE (MOBILITY PROJECT NO. 709) OWNER:

KELLY R. KALUZA & ASSOCIATES, INC. AND REGIONAL DRAINAGE FACILITIES PHASE | - PAVING AND DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS FORT BEND COUNTY PURCHASING DEPT
3014 AVENUE | FORT BEND COUNTY , TEXAS 301 JACKSON STREET SUITE 201
ROSENBERG, TEXAS 77471 BID OPENING DATE - THURSDAY, MARCH 21, 2013 - 1:30 P.M. RICHMOND, TX 77469
(281) 341-0808 (281) 341-8643
BID TABULATION Page 2 of 3

B1DDERS: HASSELL CONSTRUCTION | ALLGOOD CONSTRUCTION | CONRAD CONSTRUCTION |  SERCONSTRUCTION | HURTADO CONSTRUCTION |  TRIPLEBSERVICES | LAZERCONSTRUCTION |  DURWOOD GREENE
I1. BASE BID - SANITARY SEWER
1 12" PVCSAN. SEW. PIPE, CEMENT STAB. SAND BEDDING & BACKFILL (12'-14' DEPTH) 340|LF S 40.00 | $ 13,600.00 | $ 55.65 | $ 18,921.00 | $ 79.50 | $ 27,030.00 | $ 51.00 | $ 17,340.00 | $ 77.00 | $ 26,180.00 | $ 82.00 | S 27,880.00 | $ 105.30 | $ 35,802.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 28,900.00
2 8" PVC SAN. SEW. PIPE, STAND. BEDDING & BACKFILL (10'-12' DEPTH) 20|LF S 37.00 (S 740.00 | S 46.46 | S 929.20 | $ 58.00 | $ 1,160.00 | $ 4500 | $ 900.00 | $ 124.00 | $ 2,480.00 | S 76.00 | S 1,520.00 | S 6631 (S 1,326.20 | S 140.00 | $ 2,800.00
3 8" DUCT. IRON SAN. SEW. PIPE, STAND. BEDDING & CEMENT STAB. SAND BACKFILL (12'-14' DEPTH) 28|LF S 83.00 | S 2,324.00 | $ 84.67 | S 2,370.76 | $ 160.00 | $ 4,480.00 | $ 94.00 | $ 2,632.00 | $ 198.00 | $ 5,544.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 174.16 | $ 4,876.48 | S 220.00 | $ 6,160.00
4  TRENCH SAFETY FOR SAN. SEW. EXCAV. IN ACCORD. W/OSHA STAND. AT ALL REQ. LOC. 388|LF S 1.00$ 388.00 | S 026 S 100.88 | $ 1.05($ 407.40 | $ 1.00 | $ 388.00 | $ 1.00[$ 388.00 | $ 0.25]$ 97.00 | S 3.24 (S 1,257.12 | S 3.00($ 1,164.00
5 STAND. SAN. SEW. MANHOLE 1(EA S 2,600.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 2,271.50 | $ 2,271.50 | $ 4,450.00 | $ 4,450.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $ 2,825.00 | $ 2,825.00 | $ 3,338.77 | $ 3,338.77 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
6 STAND. SAN. SEW. MANHOLE W/ECCENTRIC TOP 1(EA S 2,600.00 | S 2,600.00 | S 2,271.50 | S 2,27150 | $ 4,930.00 | $ 4,930.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 2,600.00 | S 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 2,825.00 | S 2,825.00 | S 3,327.97 | $ 3,327.97 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00
7 DROP SAN. SEW. MANHOLE 1(EA S 3,600.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 3,045.88 | $ 3,045.88 | $ 4,505.00 | $ 4,505.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 3,450.00 | $ 3,450.00 | $ 3,284.77 | $ 3,284.77 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 11,000.00
8 DROP SAN. SEW. MANHOLE W/ ECCENTRIC TOP 2(EA S 3,600.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 3,045.88 | $ 6,091.76 | $ 4,770.00 | $ 9,540.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 6,200.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 3,450.00 | $ 6,900.00 | $ 3,398.17 | $ 6,796.34 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 13,000.00
9 EXTRA DEPTH FOR SAN. SEW. MANHOLE OVER 8' DEPTH 40(VF S 115.00 | $ 4,600.00 | $ 129.06 | $ 5,162.40 | $ 215.00 | $ 8,600.00 | $ 360.00 | $ 14,400.00 | $ 155.00 | $ 6,200.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 37351 (S 14,940.40 | $ 170.00 | $ 6,800.00
10 MANHOLE INFLOW PREVENTION INSERT 10|EA S 77.00 | S 770.00 | S 258.13 | S 2,581.30 | $ 475.00 | $ 4,750.00 | $ 114.00 | $ 1,140.00 | S 225.00 | $ 2,250.00 | S 80.00 | S 800.00 | $ 34859 | S 3,485.90 | $ 250.00 | $ 2,500.00
11 REMV & DSPS OF EXIST SAN. SEW. MANHOLE TO SUIT. LNDFLL OR APRVD EQUAL 1(EA S 475.00 | $ 475.00 | $ 877.63 | S 877.63 | $ 750.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 765.00 | $ 765.00 | $ 1,11593 | S 1,11593 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
12 REMV EXIST. SAN. SEW. MANHOLE TOP & RPLCE W/ECC. TOP & ADJ. TOP TO MATCH FINAL GRADES 6|EA S 720.00 | S 4,320.00 | $ 1,135.75 | S 6,814.50 | $ 3,075.00 | $ 18,450.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 1,888.00 | S 11,328.00 | $ 765.00 | S 4,590.00 | $ 2,792.21 | S 16,753.26 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 12,000.00
13 REHAB. OF EXIST. BRICK OR PRECAST SAN. SEW. MANHOLES, ETC. 70|VF S 345.00 | $ 24,150.00 | $ 309.75 | $ 21,682.50 | $ 350.00 | $ 24,500.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 39,200.00 | $ 128.00 | $ 8,960.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 12,250.00 | $ 168.76 | $ 11,813.20  $ 140.00 | $ 9,800.00
14 8" SAN.SEW. PLUG & CLAMP 1(EA S 220.00 | S 220.00 | S 258.13 [ S 258.13 | $ 805.00 | $ 805.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 31.00 (S 31.00 S 198.22 | $ 198.22 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00
15 12" SAN.SEW. PLUG & CLAMP 1(EA S 340.00 | $ 340.00 | $ 258.13 [ $ 258.13 | $ 805.00 | $ 805.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 83.65 (S 83.65 (S 241.42 | S 241.42 | S 300.00 | $ 300.00
16 CONNECT EXIST. 12" SAN. SEW. TO NEW DROP SAN. SEW. MANHOLE 2(EA S 1,100.00 | S 2,200.00 | S 1,032.50 | S 2,065.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 1,080.00 | S 600.00 | $ 1,200.00 | S 1,630.00 | S 3,260.00 | $ 399.10 | $ 798.20 | $ 700.00 | $ 1,400.00
17 CONNECT NEW 12" SAN. SEW. TO EXIST. SAN. SEW. MANHOLE 3|EA S 1,100.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 1,290.63 | $ 3,871.89 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 570.00 | $ 1,710.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 1,630.00 | $ 4,890.00 | $ 399.10 | $ 1,197.30 | $ 800.00 | $ 2,400.00
18 CONNECT EXIST. 15" SAN. SEW. TO NEW SAN. SEW. MANHOLE 2(EA S 1,300.00 | S 2,600.00 | S 1,548.75 | S 3,097.50 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 570.00 | $ 1,140.00 | S 600.00 | $ 1,200.00 | S 1,630.00 | S 3,260.00 | $ 420.70 | $ 841.40 | S 700.00 | $ 1,400.00
19 CONNECT NEW 8" DUCTILE IRON PIPE SAN. SEW. TO EXIST. SAN. SEW. MANHOLE 1(EA S 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,032.50 | $ 1,032.50 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 430.00 | $ 430.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,630.00 | $ 1,630.00 | $ 349.92 S 349.92 S 700.00 | $ 700.00
20 CONNECT NEW 10" SAN. SEW. TO NEW SAN. SEW. MANHOLE 1(EA S 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,290.63 | $ 1,290.63 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 470.00 | $ 470.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,630.00 | S 1,630.00 | $ 34992 S 34992 S 700.00 | $ 700.00
Il. TOTAL AMOUNT OF BASE BID - SANITARY SEWER = $ 78,327.00 | ¢ 84,994.59 | ¢ 127,762.40 | $ 102,390.00 | $ 101,758.00 | $ 88,186.65 | $ 112,094.72 | $ 112,724.00
IIl. BASE BID - WATER
1 16" PVC AWWA, CLASS 150 WATER LINE STAND. BEDDING & BACKFILL 2,710|LF S 52,50 | $ 142,275.00 | $ 3454 | S 93,603.40 | $ 67.00 [ $ 181,570.00 | $ 58.00 | $ 157,180.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 130,080.00 | $ 53.45 | $ 144,849.50 | $ 57.79 | $ 156,610.90 | $ 51.00 | $ 138,210.00
2 16" PVC AWWA, CLASS 150 WATER LINE STAND. BEDDING & CEMENT STAB. SAND BACKFILL 250|LF S 75.00 | S 18,750.00 | $ 55.52 | S 13,880.00 | $ 73.00 [ $ 18,250.00 | $ 58.00 | $ 14,500.00 | $ 58.00 | S 14,500.00 | $ 54.65 | S 13,662.50 | $ 56.60 | S 14,150.00 | $ 62.00 | S 15,500.00
3 12" PVC AWWA, CLASS 150 WATER LINE STAND. BEDDING BACKFILL 80|LF S 38.00 | S 3,040.00 | $ 2282 (S 1,825.60 | $ 62.00 | $ 4,960.00 | $ 43.00 | $ 3,440.00 | $ 58.00 | $ 4,640.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 3,840.00 | $ 3931 (S 3,144.80 | $ 62.00 | $ 4,960.00
4 8" PVC AWWA, CLASS 150 WATER LINE STAND. BEDDING BACKFILL 40(LF S 29.00 | $ 1,160.00 | S 2065 (S 826.00 | $ 57.00 | $ 2,280.00 | $ 4300 S 1,720.00 | S 38.00 (S 1,520.00 | S 35.00 (S 1,400.00 | S 2951 (S 1,180.40 | S 42.00 (S 1,680.00
5 8" PVCAWWA, CLASS 150 WATER LINE STAND. BEDDING W/CEMENT STAB. BACKFILL 120|LF S 31.00 | $ 3,720.00 | $ 4163 | S 4,995.60 | $ 62.50 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 4,440.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 10,560.00 | $ 35.00 (S 4,200.00 | $ 3335($ 4,002.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 11,400.00
6 6" PVC AWWA, CLASS 150 WATER LINE STAND. BEDDING W/ CEMENT STAB. BACKFILL 130|LF S 29.00 | $ 3,770.00 | $ 3872 (S 5,033.60 | $ 57.00 | $ 7,410.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 3,900.00 | $ 38.00 (S 4,940.00 | $ 33.00($S 4,290.00 | $ 3030 (S 3,939.00 | $ 40.00 | S 5,200.00
7 6" PVC AWWA, CLASS 150 WATER LINE STAND. BEDDING & BACKFILL 50|LF S 27.00 | $ 1,350.00 | $ 1755 | $ 877.50 | $ 52.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 42,00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 4,900.00 | $ 33.00($ 1,650.00 | $ 2399 | $ 1,199.50 | $ 110.00 | $ 5,500.00
8 16" WELDED STEEL SECTION WATER LINE 120|LF S 240.00 | S 28,800.00 | $ 23290 | S 27,948.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 32,400.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 28,800.00 | $ 288.00 | S 34,560.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 25557 S 30,668.40 | $ 310.00 | $ 37,200.00
9 TRENCH SAFETY FOR WATER LINE EXCAV.IN ACCORD. W/OSHA STAND. AT ALL REQ. LOC. 3,500|LF S 1.00|$ 3,500.00 | $ 0.10 | $ 350.00 | $ 1.05($ 3,675.00 | $ 010 $ 350.00 | $ 1.00[$ 3,500.00 | $ 0.25]$ 875.00 | $ 0.54 ]S 1,890.00 | $ 1.00|$ 3,500.00
10 16" GATE VALVE & BOX W/CONCRETE PAD 7|EA S 6,500.00 | $ 45,500.00 | $ 6,096.91 | $ 42,678.37 | $ 7,490.00 | $ 52,430.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 66,500.00 | $ 5,888.00 | $ 41,216.00 | $ 6,135.00 | $ 42,945.00 | $ 8,184.79 | $ 57,293.53 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 42,000.00
11 12" GATE VALVE & BOX W/CONCRETE PAD 3|EA S 2,600.00 | $ 7,800.00 | $ 2,085.65 | $ 6,256.95 | $ 3,210.00 | $ 9,630.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 2,008.00 | $ 6,024.00 | $ 2,240.00 | $ 6,720.00 | $ 2,21059 | S 6,631.77 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 6,600.00
12 8" GATE VALVE & BOX W/CONCRETE PAD 2(EA S 1,600.00 | S 3,200.00 | $ 1,107.87 | S 2,215.74 | $ 1,820.00 | $ 3,640.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 2,400.00 | S 1,078.00 | S 2,156.00 | S 1,200.00 | S 2,400.00 | S 1,259.11 | S 2,518.22 | S 1,200.00 | S 2,400.00
13 6" GATE VALVE & BOX W/CONCRETE PAD 16|EA S 1,200.00 | $ 19,200.00 | $ 761.99 | $ 12,191.84 | $ 1,285.00 | $ 20,560.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 858.00 | $ 13,728.00 | $ 837.00 | $ 13,392.00 | $ 929.78 | $ 14,876.48 | $ 900.00 | $ 14,400.00
14 FLUSHING VALVE (5' BURY) 10|EA S 2,500.00 | S 25,000.00 | $ 2,355.13 | S 23,551.30 | $ 3,425.00 | $ 34,250.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 2,800.00 | S 28,000.00 | $ 2,835.00 | S 28,350.00 | $ 2,750.29 | S 27,502.90 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
15 FLUSHING VALVE (4' BURY) 1(EA S 2,600.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 2,312.80 | $ 2,312.80 | $ 3,210.00 | $ 3,210.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 2,668.91 | S 2,66891 | S 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
16 16" X 16" TEE 1(EA S 1,400.00 | S 1,400.00 | S 1,355.67 | S 1,355.67 | $ 2,140.00 | $ 2,140.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | S 1,228.00 | S 1,228.00 | S 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | S 878.62 | S 878.62 | S 1,500.00 | S 1,500.00
17 16" X 12" TEE 41EA S 1,100.00 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 1,132.65 | $ 4,530.60 | $ 1,925.00 | $ 7,700.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 5,200.00 | $ 968.00 | $ 3,872.00 | $ 1,225.00 | $ 4,900.00 | $ 718.78 | $ 2,875.12 | S 1,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
18 16" X 6" TEE 15|EA S 700.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 969.52 | S 14,542.80 | $ 1,605.00 | $ 24,075.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 15,750.00 | $ 808.00 | S 12,120.00 | $ 1,000.00 | S 15,000.00 | $ 581.62 | S 8,724.30 | $ 900.00 | $ 13,500.00
19 16" X 8" TEE 2(EA S 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 1,012.88 | S 2,025.76 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 3,400.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 619.42 | $ 1,238.84 | S 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
20 12" X 6" TEE 2(EA S 500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | S 502.83 | S 1,005.66 | $ 1,070.00 | $ 2,140.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,200.00 | S 450.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 515.00 | $ 1,030.00 | S 358.06 | $ 716.12 | S 600.00 | $ 1,200.00
21 16" PLUG & CLAMP 2(EA S 1,200.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 43159 | $ 863.18 | $ 2,140.00 | $ 4,280.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 268.00 | $ 536.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 298.66 | $ 597.32 | $ 300.00 | $ 600.00
22 16" X 45° BEND 2(EA S 875.00 | S 1,750.00 | S 875.56 | $ 1,751.12 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 930.00 | $ 1,860.00 | S 700.00 | $ 1,400.00 | S 880.00 | S 1,760.00 | S 49522 | $ 990.44 | S 800.00 | $ 1,600.00
23 8" PLUG & CLAMP 1(EA S 295.00 | $ 295.00 | $ 196.18 | $ 196.18 | $ 428.00 | $ 428.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 198.00 | $ 198.00 | $ 104.00 | $ 104.00 | $ 147.46 | $ 147.46 | $ 210.00 | $ 210.00
24 12" PLUG & CLAMP 1(EA S 830.00 | S 830.00 | S 296.33 | S 296.33 | S 535.00 | $ 535.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00 | S 148.00 | $ 148.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 197.14 | $ 197.14 | $ 160.00 | $ 160.00
25 CONNECT 16" WATER LINE TO EXISTING 16" WATER LINE (WET CONNECTION) 1(EA S 3,800.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 1,652.00 | $ 1,652.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 2,278.00 | $ 2,278.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 559.53 [ $ 559.53 [ $ 2,400.00 | $ 2,400.00
26 CONNECT 16" WATER LINE TO EXISTING 12" WATER LINE (WET CONNECTION) 3|EA S 3,700.00 | $ 11,100.00 | $ 1,264.81 | S 3,794.43 | $ 2,675.00 | $ 8,025.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | S 4,500.00 | $ 1,685.00 | S 5,055.00 | $ 460.17 | $ 1,380.51 | S 1,700.00 | S 5,100.00
27 CONNECT 16" WATER LINE TO EXISTING 6" WATER LINE (WET CONNECTION) 1(EA S 3,100.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 1,032.50 | $ 1,032.50 | $ 320.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 930.00 | $ 930.00 | $ 472.05 | $ 472.05 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
28 CONNECT 12" WATER LINE TO EXISTING 6" WATER LINE (WET CONNECTION) 1(EA S 2,400.00 | S 2,400.00 | S 877.63 | S 877.63 | $ 320.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | S 1,800.00 | S 1,800.00 | S 700.00 | S 700.00 | S 332.73 (S 332.73 (S 2,000.00 | S 2,000.00
29 CONNECT 12" WATER LINE TO EXISTING 12" WATER LINE (WET CONNECTION) 1(EA S 2,600.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 980.88 | $ 980.88 | $ 750.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 945.00 | $ 945.00 | $ 37053 | $ 37053 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
30 CONNECT 8" WATER LINE TO EXISTING 8" WATER LINE (WET CONNECTION) 1(EA S 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00 | S 877.63 | S 877.63 | $ 535.00 | $ 535.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | S 1,800.00 | S 1,800.00 | S 650.00 | S 650.00 | S 239.26 | S 239.26 | S 2,000.00 | S 2,000.00
31 CONNECT 6" WATER LINE TO EXISTING 6" WATER LINE (WET CONNECTION) 2(EA S 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 826.00 | $ 1,652.00 | $ 430.00 | $ 860.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 194.98 | $ 389.96 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
32 MISC. WATER LINE FITTINGS 3|TN S 3,400.00 | $ 10,200.00 | $ 2,581.25 | S 7,743.75 | $ 4,280.00 | $ 12,840.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 1.00|$ 3.00($S 2,700.00 | S 8,100.00 | $ 3,046.68 | $ 9,140.04 | $ 1,000.00 | S 3,000.00
33 1" SINGLE LONG WATER SERVICE 5|EA S 1,400.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 1,295.79 | $ 6,478.95 | $ 1,070.00 | $ 5,350.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 1,868.00 | S 9,340.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 1,047.77 | $ 5,238.85 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 12,500.00
34 1" SINGLE SHORT WATER SERVICE 1(EA S 880.00 | S 880.00 | S 877.63 | S 877.63 | $ 5,350.00 | $ 5,350.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,868.00 | S 1,868.00 | S 500.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 686.47 | S 686.47 | S 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
IIl. TOTAL AMOUNT OF BASE BID - WATER = $ 380,220.00 | $ 291,081.40 | $ 469,813.00 | $ 397,020.00 | $ 354,115.00 | $ 348,718.00 | $ 363,452.10 | $ 383,320.00
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ENGINEER: GOLFVIEW DRIVE (MOBILITY PROJECT NO. 709) OWNER:
KELLY R. KALUZA & ASSOCIATES, INC. AND REGIONAL DRAINAGE FACILITIES PHASE | - PAVING AND DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS FORT BEND COUNTY PURCHASING DEPT
3014 AVENUE | FORT BEND COUNTY , TEXAS 301 JACKSON STREET SUITE 201
ROSENBERG, TEXAS 77471 BID OPENING DATE - THURSDAY, MARCH 21, 2013 - 1:30 P.M. RICHMOND, TX 77469
(281) 341-0808 (281) 341-8643
BID TABULATION Page 30t 3
(BIDDERS: HASSELL CONSTRUCTION | ALLGOOD CONSTRUCTION | CONRAD CONSTRUCTION SER CONSTRUCTION HURTADO CONSTRUCTION TRIPLE B SERVICES LAZER CONSTRUCTION |  DURWOOD GREENE
IV. BASE BID - BRIDGE WORK ITEMS
1 ITEM 104-REMOV. CONCRETE RIP RAP, WINGWALL, SLAB, & RAIL 1|LS $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 [ $ 10,325.00 | $ 10,325.00 | $ 27,250.00 | $ 27,250.00 | $ 9,300.00 | $ 9,300.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 7,703.21 | $ 7,703.21 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
2 ITEM 110 - EXCAVATION (CHANNEL) 20(cY S 15.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 1239 $ 247.80 | $ 16.35 | $ 327.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 780.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 11.50 | $ 230.00 | $ 4369 | $ 873.80 | $ 20.00 | $ 400.00
3 ITEM 400 SAND BACKFILL 20|CY S 70.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 46.46 | $ 929.20 | $ 76.25 | S 1,525.00 | $ 52.00 | $ 1,040.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 52,70 | $ 1,054.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 1,500.00
4  ITEM 409 - PRESTRESSED CONCRETE PILINGS 400|LF S 130.00 | $ 52,000.00 | $ 149.71 | $ 59,884.00 | $ 141.00 | $ 56,400.00 | $ 118.00 | $ 47,200.00 | $ 81.00 | $ 32,400.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 39,200.00 | $ 128.20 | 51,280.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 54,000.00
5 ITEM 420 - CLASS S CONCRETE APPROACH SLAB 38|CY [ $ 500.00 [ $  19,000.00 | $ 33040 [ $  12,555.20 | $ 545.00 | $  20,710.00 | $ 362.00 | $ 13,756.00 | $ 551.00 | $  20,938.00 | $ 695.00 | $  26,410.00 | $ 864.00 | $  32,832.00 (S 520.00 | $  19,760.00
6 ITEM 425 - PRESTRESSED CONCRETE SLAB BEAM (4SB15) 89|LF S 400.00 | $ 35,600.00 | $ 356.21 | $ 31,702.69 | $ 436.00 | $ 38,804.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 26,700.00 | $ 332.33 ( $ 29,577.37 | $ 385.00 | $ 34,265.00 | $ 298.81 | $ 26,594.09 | $ 420.00 | $ 37,380.00
7 ITEM 425 - PRESTRESSED CONCRETE SLAB BEAM (5SB15) 133.5|LF S 400.00 | $ 53,400.00 | $ 356.21 | $ 47,554.04 | $ 436.00 | $ 58,206.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 40,050.00 | $ 33233 S 44,366.06 | $ 385.00 | $ 51,397.50 | $ 298.81 | S 39,891.14 | $ 420.00 | $ 56,070.00
8 ITEM 428 - CONCRETE SURFACE TREATMENT (CLASS I1) 1,152|SF S 2001(S$ 2,304.00 | $ 723 (S 8,328.96 | S 220 (s 2,534.40 | $ 380 (S 4,377.60 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,152.00 | $ 1.25 ]S 1,440.00 | $ 216 | $ 2,48832 | $ 2201($ 2,534.40
9 ITEM 430 - CLASS C EXTENDING CONCRETE ABUTEMENT STRUCTURE 15.2|CY S 1,500.00 | $ 22,800.00 | $ 826.00 | $ 12,555.20 | $ 1,635.00 | $ 24,852.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 11,400.00 | $ 1,130.00 | $ 17,176.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 45,600.00 | $ 2,160.00 | $ 32,832.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 25,840.00
10 ITEM 430 - CLASS S EXTENDING CONCRETE SLAB STRUCTURE 19|CY S 1,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 46463 | $ 8,827.97 | $ 1,090.00 | $ 20,710.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 11,400.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 23,750.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 28,500.00 | $ 1,115.78 | $ 21,199.82 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 22,800.00
11 ITEM 442 - STRUCTURE STEEL - CONDUIT HANGARS 498|LB S 12.00 | $ 5,976.00 | $ 2581 (S 12,853.38 | $ 13.00 | $ 6,474.00 | $ 7.20 S 3,585.60 | $ 1350 | $ 6,723.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 7,968.00 | $ 402 |S 2,001.96 | $ 16.00 | $ 7,968.00
12 ITEM 450 - RAIL (TY T223) 85|LF S 140.00 | $ 11,900.00 | $ 77.44 | S 6,582.40 | $§ 153.00 | $ 13,005.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 11,475.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 7,225.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 8,330.00 | $ 248.40 | $ 21,114.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 12,750.00
13 ITEM 450 - RAIL (TY T202 RETROFIT) 61|LF S 120.00 | $ 7,320.00 | $ 108.41 | $ 6,613.01 | $ 130.00 | $ 7,930.00 | $ 228.00 | $ 13,908.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 6,405.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 7,625.00 | $ 55.75 | $ 3,400.75 | $ 130.00 | $ 7,930.00
14 ITEM 529 - 6' CURB (DOWELLED) 40|LF S 25.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 6.20 | S 248.00 | S 2725 | S 1,090.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 440.00 | $ 47.20 | $ 1,888.00 | $ 58.00 | $ 2,320.00 | $ 38.73 | $ 1,549.20 | $ 2500 | $ 1,000.00
15 ITEM 540 - METAL BEAM GUARDRAIL FENCE - THRIE-BEAM 1|EA S 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 6,195.00 | $ 6,195.00 | $ 1,635.00 | $ 1,635.00 | $ 4,100.00 | $ 4,100.00 | $ 1,850.00 | $ 1,850.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 3,881.89 | $ 3,881.89 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 1,700.00
16 ITEM 544 - GUARDRAIL END TREATMENT 1|EA S 2,400.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 4,367.48 | S 4,367.48 | S 2,620.00 | $ 2,620.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 1,797.47 | $ 1,797.47 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 2,700.00
IV. TOTAL AMOUNT OF BASE BID - BRIDGE WORK ITEMS = $ 260,900.00 | $ 229,769.33 | $ 284,072.40 | $ 203,312.20 | $ 212,350.43 | $ 279,585.50 | $ 250,493.65 | $ 284,332.40
V. BASE BID - PAVING AND MISC. CONSTRUCTION
1 8" THICK CONCRETE PAVEMENT 13,600|SY S 35.88 S 487,968.00 | $ 33.36 | $  453,696.00 | $ 36.00 [ S 489,600.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 544,000.00 | $ 35.75$ 486,200.00 | $ 38.00 [ $ 516,800.00 | $ 3489 | $ 474,504.00 | $ 35.75 | $  486,200.00
2 2-1/2" THICK HOT MIX HOT LAID ASPHALTIC CONCRETE (TXDOT ITEM 340 TYPE "D" SURFACE MIX) 800(SY S 34.00 | $ 27,200.00 | $ 16.56 | $ 13,248.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 29,600.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 13,600.00 | $ 2200 (S 17,600.00 | $ 2200 (S 17,600.00 | $ 36.18 | $ 28,944.00 | $ 2200 (S 17,600.00
3 8" THICK CRUSHED LIMESTONE (OR APPROVED EQUAL) BASE, ETC. 850(SY S 17.00 | $ 14,450.00 | $ 39.70 | $ 33,745.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 23,800.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 14,450.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 15,300.00 | $ 2275 S 19,337.50 | $ 1766 | S 15,011.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 15,300.00
4 SUBGRADE STAB. W/8% LIME BY WEIGHT TO 8" DEPTH (SLURRY METHOD), ETC., ASTM D-698 15,900|SY S 550 |$ 87,450.00 | $ 217 (S 34,503.00 | $ 6.45 (S 102,555.00 | $ 6.50 | $ 103,350.00 | $ 6.00|$ 95,400.00 | $ 510 | $ 81,090.00 | $ 597 |$ 94,923.00 | $ 6.00 S 95,400.00
5 SUBGRADE STAB. W/8% LIME BY WEIGHT TO 6" DEPTH (SLURRY METHOD), ETC., ASTM D-698 320(SY S 4.00 | S 1,280.00 | $ 217 S 694.40 | $ 6.25 (S 2,000.00 | $ 7.00 | S 2,240.00 | $ 575|$ 1,840.00 | $ 435(s 1,392.00 | $ 558 |$ 1,785.60 | $ 575|$ 1,840.00
6 4-1/2" THICK CONCRETE DRIVEWAY PAVEMENT 350(SY S 30.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 46.46 | S 16,261.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 15,750.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 12,250.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 11,900.00 | $ 4465 | S 15,627.50 | $ 2712 | S 9,492.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 11,900.00
7 6" THICK CONCRETE DRIVEWAY PAVEMENT 480(SY S 34.00 | $ 16,320.00 | $ 51.63 | $ 24,782.40 | $ 50.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 18,720.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 19,200.00 | $ 48.80 | S 23,424.00 | $ 31.18 | $ 14,966.40 | $ 40.00 | $ 19,200.00
8 SIDEWALK RAMP ASSEMBLY 10|EA S 1,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 877.63 | $ 8,776.30 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 285.58 | $ 2,855.80 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 14,000.00
9  4-1/2" THICK CONCRETE SIDEWALK PAVEMENT 1,250(SY S 31.00 | $ 38,750.00 | $ 39.49 | $ 49,362.50 | $ 42.00 | $ 52,500.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 52,500.00 | $ 33.00 | $ 41,250.00 | $ 46.75 | $ 58,437.50 | $ 2955 $ 36,937.50 | $ 33.00 | $ 41,250.00
10 6" CONCRETE CURB 5,680|LF S 2001(S 11,360.00 | $ 217 (S 12,325.60 | $ 235]$ 13,348.00 | $ 220 $ 12,496.00 | $ 2501 S 14,200.00 | $ 315 (S 17,892.00 | $ 291 (S 16,528.80 | $ 2501($S 14,200.00
11 TEMP. ACCESS ROAD 6" ASPHALTIC (BLACK) BASE W/ COMPACTED SUBGRADE 1,800(SY S 31.00 | $ 55,800.00 | $ 2962 S 53,316.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 57,600.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 54,000.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 48,600.00 | S 45.00 | $ 81,000.00 | $ 30.58 | $ 55,044.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 48,600.00
12 6" CRUSHED LIMESTONE OR APPROVED EQUAL DRIVEWAY TRANSITION 90(Sy S 17.00 | $ 1,530.00 | $ 2963 (S 2,666.70 | $ 30.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 16.40 | $ 1,476.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 1,350.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 2,880.00 | $ 16.56 | $ 1,490.40 | $ 15.00 | $ 1,350.00
13 CONCRETE RIP RAP 250|SY S 35.00 | $ 8,750.00 | $ 39.24 (S 9,810.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 11,250.00 | $ 44.00 | S 11,000.00 | $ 51.50 | $ 12,875.00 | $ 39.09 | $ 9,772.50 | $ 60.00 | S 15,000.00
14 EXCAV. OF ST. & DRVWYS;SHAPE & COMPACT SUBGRADE TO 95% STAND. PROCTOR COMP TEST, ETC. 22,500|CY S 6.50 | $ 146,250.00 | $ 465 (S 104,625.00 | $ 6.50 [ S 146,250.00 | $ 8.00 (S 180,000.00 | $ 958 |$ 215,550.00 | $ 6.30|$ 141,750.00 | $ 10.07 | $ 226,575.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 225,000.00
15 STORM SEW. TRENCH EXCAV. & REMVL 19,000|CY S 550 |$ 104,500.00 | $ 413 (S 78,470.00 | $ 8.00 [ $ 152,000.00 | $ 0.10 | S 1,900.00 | $ 6.32|$ 120,080.00|$ 7.65|$ 145350.00 | $ 956 | $ 181,640.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 152,000.00
16 SAWCUT EXIST. ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVEMENT 500|LF S 6.00 S 3,000.00 | $ 878 |S 4,390.00 | $ 5.00 (S 2,500.00 | $ 7.00 S 3,500.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 260|S 1,300.00 | $ 2701 S 1,350.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 5,000.00
17 REMVL & DSPSAL OF EXIST. ASPHALT PAVEMENT TO AN APRVD LNDFLL OR EQUAL 9,900(SY S 3201($ 31,680.00 | $ 217 | S 21,483.00 | $ 330(S 32,670.00 | $ 460 (S 45,540.00 | $ 6.00 S 59,400.00 | $ 3.00(S$ 29,700.00 | $ 319 (S 31,581.00 | $ 6.00 S 59,400.00
18 REMVL & DSPSAL OF EXIST. CONCRETE PAVEMENT TO AN APRVD LNDFLL OR EQUAL 550(SY S 3.00($ 1,650.00 | $ 310 $ 1,705.00 | $ 750 | S 4,125.00 | $ 5.00 (S 2,750.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 6,600.00 | $ 7.00|$ 3,850.00 | $ 9.19 | $ 5,054.50 | $ 12.00 | $ 6,600.00
19 UNDERCUT EXISTING DRIVEWAY 240|LF S 500 (S 1,200.00 | $ 826|S 1,982.40 | $ 750 (S 1,800.00 | $ 7.60 S 1,824.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 2665 | S 6,396.00 | $ 241 1S 578.40 | $ 15.00 | $ 3,600.00
20 PEDESTRIAN HANDRAIL 40|LF S 85.00 | $ 3,400.00 | $ 154.88 | $ 6,195.20 | $ 150.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 5,200.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 54.30 | $ 2,172.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 5,200.00
21 SOLID SOD ST AUGUSTINE GRASS & PROVIDE WATERING UNTIL VEG. ESTABLISHMENT 1,500(SY S 375($ 5,625.00 | $ 313 (S 4,695.00 | $ 330(S 4,950.00 | $ 4,00 (S 6,000.00 | $ 340 (S 5,100.00 | $ 4.00 | S 6,000.00 | $ 371 (S 5,565.00 | $ 350 (S 5,250.00
22 HYDROMULCH SEEDING OF DISTURBED AREAS & PROVIDE WATERING UNTIL VEG. ESTABLISHMENT 11,000|SY S 3.00($ 33,000.00 | $ 0.22|s 2,420.00 | $ 027 (S 2,970.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 040 (S 4,400.00 | $ 040 (S 4,400.00 | $ 0.28 S 3,080.00 | $ 0.35( S 3,850.00
23 4" PVC COMMUNICATION CONDUIT 6,630|LF S 10.00 | $ 66,300.00 | $ 1265 (S 83,869.50 | $ 12.25 | $ 81,217.50 | $ 13.00 | $ 86,190.00 | $ 11.25 | $ 74,587.50 | $ 13.00 | $ 86,190.00 | $ 1075 | $ 71,272.50 | $ 16.00 | $ 106,080.00
24 COMMUNICATION HANDHOLE 12|EA S 5,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 513153 | $ 61,578.36 | $ 5,475.00 | $ 65,700.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 4,970.00 | $ 59,640.00 | $ 5,800.00 | $ 69,600.00 | $ 5,367.60 | $ 64,411.20 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 60,000.00
25 4" PLUG & CLAMP 2|EA S 140.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 154.88 | $ 309.76 | $ 350.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 260.00 | S 10.00 | $ 2000 | $ 81.00 | $ 162.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 140.00
26 CONTRACTOR MOBILIZATION 1|LS $ 110,000.00 | $ 110,000.00 | $ 280,000.00 | S 280,000.00 [ $ 80,000.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 140,000.00 | $ 140,000.00 | $ 48,000.00 | $ 48,000.00 | $ 104,000.00 | $ 104,000.00 | $ 304,137.83 | $ 304,137.83 | $ 200,000.00 [ $ 200,000.00
27 PROVIDE BONDS, INSURANCE, & MISC. IN ACCORD. W/CONTRACT DOCUMENTS 1|LS $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 [ $ 52,657.50 | $ 52,657.50 | $ 1.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 40,000.00 | S 40,000.00 [ $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 215,985.51 | $ 215,985.51 [ $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00
28 FURNISH & MAINTAIN SIGNAGE, BARRICADES, FLAGMEN, TRAFFIC CONTROL, ETC. 1|LS S 34,000.00 | $ 34,000.00 | $ 43,932.88 | $ 43,932.88 [ S 26,500.00 | $ 26,500.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 45,000.00 [ $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 38,000.00 | $ 38,000.00 | $ 109,693.66 | $ 109,693.66 [ $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00
29 FURNISH & INSTALL PVMNT MARKINGS INCL. THERMO-PLASTIC STOP BARS, ETC. 1|LS $ 23,000.00 | $ 23,000.00 [ $ 19,389.46 | S 19,389.46 | $ 29,000.00 | $ 29,000.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 [ $ 21,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 27,841.32 | S 27,841.32 | $ 25,000.00 | S 25,000.00
30 FURSNISH, INSTALL, & MAINT. EROSION & SEDIMENT CONTROL STORM WATER POLLUT. PREV. ETC. 1|LS S 1,800.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 21,088.81 | $ 21,088.81 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 13,600.00 | $ 13,600.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
31 CONTRACT. TO PROVIDE CONST. STAKING FOR ALIGN. & GRADE FOR WORK 1|BUDG $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 [ $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 [ $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 [ $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 [ $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 [ $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
32 CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS TESTING 1|LS DELETED DELETED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 4'X8'SIGN 2|EA S 500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 696.94 | S 1,393.88 | $ 850.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 600.00 | S 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 648.00 | S 1,296.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 1,400.00
V. TOTAL AMOUNT OF BASE BID - PAVING AND MISC. CONSTRUCTION = $ 1,473,043.00 | $ 1,528,372.65 | $ 1,513,536.50 | $ 1,480,096.00 | $ 1,532,217.50 | $ 1,616,053.50 | $ 2,053,628.92 | $ 1,795,360.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF BID = $ 4,751,060.00 | $ 4,878,041.02 | $ 4,943,854.30 | $ 5,066,843.20 | $ 5,128,046.93 | $ 5,223,191.15 | $ 5,368,401.10 | $ 5,699,956.40
TOTAL AMOUNT OF CALENDAR DAYS = 300 300 300 300 275 300 300 280
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