From: Aaron Pratt

To: A ie: G .
Subject: RE: Medical Bid
Date: Friday, September 28, 2012 5:56:07 AM

| apologize for not responding sooner. | do not show | received your email from Monday. | did, in error, bid a substitute for the
Microflex gloves. Please withdraw my bid for Section 6 of the bid 13-006.

Mr. Aaron L. Pratt

Bids/Purchasing Manager
QuadMed, Inc.

Phone 800.933.7334

Fax 904.880.2303
www.quadmed.com

From: Kaminski, Debbie [mailto:Debbie.Kaminski@co.fort-bend.tx.us]
Sent: Friday, September 28, 2012 12:01 AM

To: Kaminski, Debbie; Graeber, Rita; Aaron Pratt

Subject: RE: Medical Bid

Aaron,
I have not heard from you. | MUST hear something back tomorrow.

Debbie Kaminski, CPPB
Assistant Purchasing Agent
Travis Annex

301 Jackson, Suite 201
Richmond TX 77469

P: 281-341-8643

F: 281-341-8645

From: Kaminski, Debbie
Sent: Monday, September 24, 2012 10:41 AM

To: Graeber, Rita; Aaron@quadmed.com
Subject: RE: Medical Bid

Aaron,

The bid specified Microflex for the section your company was awarded (Section 6). | understand from the below you bid a
substitute, even though you did not state it on your bid response. The glove you propose to provide does not meet the
specifications of the Microflex, therefore it is not a substitute. Please provide me a letter today stating you wish to withdraw
your bid for Section 6 or respond by email that you will provide the gloves specified.

Debbie Kaminski, CPPB
Assistant Purchasing Agent
Travis Annex

301 Jackson, Suite 201
Richmond TX 77469

P: 281-341-8643

F: 281-341-8645

From: Graeber, Rita

Sent: Monday, September 24, 2012 9:24 AM
To: Kaminski, Debbie

Subject: RE: Medical Bid

Here is a little more info...

Finger Thickness, Microflex = 10.6 - Dermagold = 10
Tensile, Microflex = 28/25 - Dermagold = 18/14
Elasticity, Microflex = 783/701 - Dermagold = 650/500


mailto:Aaron@quadmed.com
mailto:Debbie.Kaminski@co.fort-bend.tx.us
mailto:Rita.Graeber@co.fort-bend.tx.us
mailto:Aaron@quadmed.com

From: Aaron Pratt [mailto:Aaron@quadmed.com]
Sent: Monday, September 24, 2012 7:14 AM

To: Graeber, Rita

Cc: Mindy Langorgen

Subject: FW: Medical Bid

Here are the numbers you requested. Thank you.

egl-527901 DERMAGOLD EP SM 50/BX 10/CS
egl-527902 DERMAGOLD EP MD 50/BX 10/CS
egl-527903 DERMAGOLD EP LG 50/BX 10/CS
egl-527904 DERMAGOLD EP XL 50/BX 10/CS

Mr. Aaron L. Pratt
Bids/Purchasing Manager
QuadMed, Inc.

Phone 800.933.7334

Fax 904.880.2303

www.quadmed.com

From: Graeber, Rita [mailto:Rita.Graeber@co.fort-bend.tx.us]

Sent: Friday, September 21, 2012 5:03 PM
To: Mindy Langorgen
Subject: Medical Bid

INNOV
INNOV
INNOV
INNOV

180100
180200
180300
180350

CASE
CASE
CASE
CASE

50/BX
50/BX
50/BX
50/BX

Please send me your catalog numbers for all items on Medical Bid 13-006 that were awarded to your company.

Thank you,

Rita Graeber
Administrative Coordinator
Fort Bend County EMS

281-633-7088 V
281-633-7087 F

10BX/CS
10BX/CS
10BX/CS
10BX/CS
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http://www.quadmed.com/
mailto:Rita.Graeber@co.fort-bend.tx.us

Term Contract fo Medical Supplies

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 13-006

Term: 1 October 2012 through 30 September 2013

Awarded 9/4/12: Low bidder per section
*Amended 10/09/12

Description Bound Tree | Emed Medical [Guardian EMS| Henry Schein Medical Midwest Physio-Control| Plak Smacker QuadMed
Medical Products Wholesale Medical
Supply

Section 1: $ 19,700.54 No Bid Disqualified: Did| $  19,203.80| Disqualified: Did| $  19,714.30| Disqualified: No Bid No Bid
Airways not bid all items not bid all items Altered delivery

as required as required requirements.
Section 2: $ 39,442.02 No Bid Disqualified: Did[ $  54,648.08| Disqualified: Did| $  57,483.18 No Bid No Bid
IV, Syringes, not bid all items not bid all items
Blood as required as required
Section 3: $ 8,306.010 No Bid $ 9,511.43| $ 9,339.37| Disqualified: Did| Disqualified: Did No Bid $ 8,585.32
Bandages, Splints, not bid all items | not bid all items
Tape as required as required
Section 4: $ 17,481.92 No Bid Disqualified: Did[ $  21,742.00 No Bid $ 22,627.46 No Bid| $ 21,739.70
EKG not bid all items

as required
Section 5: $ 26,150.08 No Bid Disqualified: Did| $  26,825.70 No Bid $ 34,235.72 No Bid| $ 28,863.44
EKG Cables not bid all items

as required
Section 6: $ 12,3056 $ 13,651.20( $ 15,356.16 *$12,072.96 No Bid $ 13,351.68 No Bid *Vendor
Microflex Withdrew Bid
Synetron Latex
Exam Gloves
Section 7: $ 343.50| $ 44500 | $ 47000 | $ 367.80 No Bid $ 396.00 $ 374.00 | $ 439.50

Microflex Ultra-
Sense Non-Latex
Exam Gloves




Description Bound Tree | Emed Medical |Guardian EMS| Henry Schein Medical Midwest Physio-Control| Plak Smacker QuadMed
Medical Products Wholesale Medical
Supply
Section 8: $ 49950( $ 647.50 No Bid $ 457.50 No Bid $ 506.00 No Bid No Bid
NeoPro EC 12"
Non Latex Exam
Gloves
Section 9: $ 8.50 No Bid $ 399.20 | $ 10.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sterile Gloves
Section 10: $ 5,625.90| $ 10,786.50| $ 744480 $ 6,916.05| $ 15,278.00| $ 8,100.45 No Bid $ 8,947.92
AMBU Perfit
Cervical Collars
Section 11: $ 7,476.00| $ 9,975.00( $ 7,455.00 [ $ 8,337.001 $ 10,185.00( $ 10,983.00 No Bid $ 7,938.00
AMBU Head
Wedge
Immobilizer
Section 12: $ 2,116.18 No Bid Disqualified: Did| $ 2,574.80| Disqualified: Did| $ 1,523.73 No Bid Disqualified: Did
Misc Supplies not bid all items not bid all items not bid all items
as required as required as required
Sectin 13: $ 1,276.90 No Bid Disqualified: Did| $ 3,941.27 | Disqualified: Did| $ 1,107.10 No Bid $ 2,663.25
Infection Control not bid all items not bid all items
as required as required
Section 14: $ 32,297.40 No Bid Disqualified: Did No Bid Disqualified: Did No Bid No Bid Disqualified: Did
Capitals not bid all items not bid all items not bid all items

as required

as required

as required




Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 13-006
Term Contract for Medical Supplies

Term: 1 October 2012 through 30 September 2013

Awarded 9/4/12: Low bidder per section *Amended 10/9/12

Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 1: Airways

Vendor: Henry Schein, Inc.

40mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway 5466 $ 0.15
60mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway 6477 $ 0.15
80mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway 6478 $ 0.15
90mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway 6479 $ 0.15
100 mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway 6480 $ 0.15
110mm Berman (dual channel) Oral Airway 6481 $ 0.15
Thomas E.T. Tube Holder Adult size 5467 $ 2.52
Thomas E.T. Tube Holder Pediatric size 6482 $ 2.52
Tube Check Endotracheal tube placement verification 5468 $ 1.93
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 2.5 Uncuffed 5470 $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 3.0 Uncuffed 6483 $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 3.5 Uncuffed 6484 $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 4.0 Uncuffed 6485 $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 4.5 Uncuffed 6486 $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 5.0 Uncuffed 6487 $ 3.54
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 5.5 Cuffed 5471 $ 4.02




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 1: Airways (cont'd)

Vendor: Henry Schein, Inc.

Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 6.0 Cuffed 6488 $ 4.02
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 6.5 Cuffed 6489 $ 4.02
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 7.0 Cuffed 6490 $ 4.02
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 7.5 Cuffed 6491 $ 4.02
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 8.0 Cuffed 6492 $ 4.02
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 8.5 Cuffed 6493 $ 4.02
Slick Set Endotracheal Tubes 9.0 Cuffed 6494 $ 4.02
30F Nasopharyngeal Airways 10088 $ 2.26
36F Nasopharyngeal Airways 10089 $ 2.26
6F Endotracheal Tube Slick Stylet 5474 $ 1.99
8F Endotracheal Tube Slick Stylet 6497 $ 1.99
10F Endotracheal Tube Slick Stylet 6498 $ 1.99
1200cc Suction Canister 5475 $ 2.56
8F whistle tip Suction Catheter 5476 $ 0.34
10F whistle tip Suction Catheter 6499 $ 0.34
18F whistle tip Suction Catheter 6500 $ 0.34
Yankaur Suction Tip w/Control 5477 $ 0.49
Suction Tubing Non Conducting Vinyl 72" x 1/4" ID 5478 $ 1.31
Infant Medium Concentration Oxygen Mask 5479 $ 2.84
02 Mask Pediatric Partial Non-Rebreather w/ safety vent (Hudson #1058) 50/cs 5480 $ 105.51
02 Mask Adult Non-Rebreather w/o safety vent (Hudson #1060) 50/cs 5481 $ 62.51
02 Nasal Cannula Adult 50/cs 5482 $ 13.01
02 Supply Tubing 7' 50/cs 5483 $ 17.51




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 1: Airways (cont'd)

Vendor: Henry Schein, Inc.

02 Nebulizer w/ Tubing and Mouthpiece 50/cs 5484 $ 35.51
Disposable Humidifier 5485 $ 1.70
AMBU Spur Il Bag Valve Mask Adult (with mask) 5486 $ 8.76
AMBU Spur Bag Valve Mask Infant/Child (with Infant and Child masks) 5487 $ 11.61
Oxygen Nut & Stem (Plastic) 5488 $ 1.11
Magill Forceps Adult sizes 5491 $ 3.36
Magill Forceps Child sizes 5492 $ 3.36
Gastric Sump Tube, 48", 18F, Sterile 5493 $ 1.92
V-VAC Replacement Cartridge 5494 $ 16.51
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Macintosh 2 6323 $ 4.26
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Macintosh 3 6505 $ 4.26
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Macintosh 4 6506 $ 4.26
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Miller 1 6507 $ 4.26
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Miller 2 6508 $ 4.26
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Miller 3 6509 $ 4.26
Greenline/D Disposable Fiber Optic Laryngoscope Blades Miller 4 6510 $ 4.26
Greenline/D Fiber Optic, 10/32" Halogen/Xenon Reflector Lamp for Medium Laryngoscope Handle 6324 $ 9.35
emergent respiratory products PORTO2VENT CPAP Soft-Seal Masks, size Small Adult 6325 $ 0.20
emergent respiratory products PORTO2VENT CPAP Soft-Seal Masks, size Medium Adult 10090 $ 0.18
emergent respiratory products PORTO2VENT CPAP Soft-Seal Masks, size Large Adult 6326 $ 0.25




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 1: Airways (cont'd)

emergent respiratory products PORTO2VENT CPAP Breathing Circuit & Mask to include Pressure Balanced 6327 $ 41.90
Inhalation/Exhalation Valve (Single patient use), Soft-seal Mask size medium adult (single patient use) (color

of seal : Yellow), Integral Proximal Airway Pressure Line w/Bacterial/Viral Filter, Six foot corrugated tube

with locking bayonet connector, Soft-Seal Mask - Black Neoprene Head Harness

Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 2: 1V/Syringes/Blood

Vendor: Bound Tree Medical

9" x 3" IV Arm Board 5498 $ 0.63
12" x 3" IV Arm Board 5499 $ 1.00
18" x 3" IV Arm Board 5500 $ 0.61
14g x 5 1/4" Needle, Becton Dickinson # 382269 5501 $ 16.19
B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for automatic safety 5502 $ 1.45
activation, Color-coded packaging, 14gauge x 2"

B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for automatic safety 5503 $ 1.45
activation, Color-coded packaging, 16gauge x 1 1/4"

B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for automatic safety 5504 $ 1.45
activation, Color-coded packaging, 18gauge x 1 1/4"

B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for automatic safety 5505 $ 1.45
activation, Color-coded packaging, 20gauge x 1 1/4"

B BRAUN Introcan Safety IV Catheter, Universal bevel needle, Passive design for automatic safety 5506 $ 1.45
activation, Color-coded packaging, 22gauge x 1"

18g x 1 1/2" Needle Only 100/bx 5509 $ 4.40
20g x 1 1/2" Needle Only 100/bx 5510 $ 4.40
22g x 1 1/2" Needle Only 100/bx 5511 $ 4.40
23g x 1" Needle Only 100/bx 5512 $ 4.43
1cc 25¢g x 5/8" Syringe & Needle 100/bx 5513 $ 10.00




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 2: 1V/Syringes/Blood (cont'd)

Vendor: Bound Tree Medical

5cc 22g x 1" Syringe & Needle 100/bx 5514 $ 30.00
10cc Syringe Luer Lock 100/bx 5515 $ 13.00
30cc Syringe Luer Lock 30/bx 5516 $ 12.00
60cc Syringe Luer Lock 30/bx 10091 $ 12.50
Vacutainer Holder 5517 $ 0.077
Vacutainer Luer Adapter 100/bx 5518 $ 10.71
Vacutainer Tubes Red top, Plastic, 6.0mL, 100/bx 5519 $ 18.24
Vacutainer Tubes Lavender, Plasticm 3,9mL, 100/bx 5520 $ 9.52
Latex Free Tourniquet, 1" x 18", 25 per roll, color = Blue 5521 $ 4.88
Glucometer Test Strips for Abbott OptimumEZ glucose meter, capillary, 100 strip/bx 5522 $ 40.48
Control solution, tri-level, 1 row 1 mid 1 high per box for Optiu or Precision XTRA 9619 $ 10.54
Maxi Drip Set, 82" 10GTTWY/Bravo 24, Pre-slit Port, Removable 7" Extension, 50/bx 5523 $ 99.50
Mini Drop Basic Administration Set with One Injection Site, (60 Drops/mL) Control Clamp, injection site 28’ 6328 $ 1.44
above distal end, two-piece male luer lock. Priming Volume: 12mL, Length: 66 in.

5% Dextrose Injection USP-500ml, 24/cs 6329 $ 1.02
9% Sodium Chloride Injection USP-1000ml, 12/cs 6330 $ 1.00
9% Sodium Chloride Injection USP-500ml, 24/cs 6331 $ 0.86
9% Sodium Chloride for Irrigation, 1000mL 6332 $ 1.13
Sterile Water for Irrigation, 500mL 6334 $ 0.96
Safeline Injection Site: split septum access with two-piece male luer lock. Priming Volume: 0.25mL 6335 $ 1.03
Smallbore Extension Set with bonded Ultrasite Injection site, Length: 7 in, Priming Volume: 0.6mL (approx) 6336 $ 1.60




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 3: Bandage/Splints/Tape

Vendor: Bound Tree Medical

2" x 5yd Elastic Bandage 5524 $ 0.32
4" x 5yd Elastic Bandage 5525 $ 0.47
Occlusive, non-adhering dressing, impregnated with white Petrolatum, 3"x 9" 50/bx 5526 $ 30.00
Small Oval Eye Pad 50/bx 5527 $ 4.58
4x4 Non Sterile, non-woven, 4ply, 200/pkg 5528 $ 2.41
4x4 Sterile 12 ply - 10/tray 5529 $ 0.69
4 1/2" x 4.1yd 6 ply Non Sterile Gauze Roll 5530 $ 0.57
4 1/2" x 4.1yd 6 ply Sterile Gauze Roll 5531 $ 0.54
36" x 51" Triangular Bandage 5532 $ 0.22
8" x 10" Abdominal Pad, 20/tray 5533 $ 3.57
1" x 3" Adhesive Strip Bandage 50/bx 5534 $ 1.53
Burn Sheet Sterile 60" x 96" 5535 $ 2.26
Trauma Dressing Sterile 10" x 30" 5536 $ 0.73
Cardboard Padded Arm Splint 18" x 9" x .5" 5537 $ 1.51
Rapid Heat Instant Heat Pack, Pull Apart Style, 6/bx 5538 $ 6.89
Rapid Cold Instant Cold Pack, Pull Apart Style, 24/cs 5539 $ 21.61
Ferno KED forehead/Chin Strap Replacement set of 2 5540 $ 3.94
54" Padded Board Splint 5541 $ 4.41
Wire Ladder Splint 12/pkg 5542 $ 55.32
3M Transpore Tape 1" x 10yd 12/bx 5543 $ 13.65
2" x 10yd Waterproof Tape Kendall #3267 6/bx 5546 $ 16.50
Sterile Aluminum Foil 18" x 25" roll 5547 $ 4.17
Flex-All splint, orange, bendable foam and aluminum splint, 4" x 36" rolled 9620 $ 4.76




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 4: EKG

Vendor: Bound Tree Medical

Recording Paper for Physio Control Life Pak 12, 4" wide. 5/pk 5548 $ 8.41
Medicotest Blue Sensor Disposable Electrodes # R-00-S-10 10/pk 5549 $ 2.78
Self adhesive pregelled low impedance electrodes with direct connect to Physio Control Quick combo cables 5550 $ 14.46
Kimberly Clark #3112-1730 (pediatrics)

Self adhesive pregelled low impedance electrodes with direct connect to Physio Control Quick combo cables 5551 $ 14.46
Kimberly Clark #3112-1731 (adult)

FilterLine H Set Adult/Pediatric Medtronic Ref# XS04660 5552 $ 6.87
Nasal FilterLine Adult Medtronic Ref# XS04664 5553 $ 9.04
Highly Conductive Multi Purpose Electrode Gel, 20z tube 5554 $ 1.33
Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 5: EKG Cables

Vendor: Bound Tree Medical

LifePack12 Power Adapter Extension Cable Physio Control #11110-000051 6337 $ 101.21
LifePack12 12-Lead ECG trunk cable with 4-wire limb leads, 5' Physio Control #11110-000018 6339 $ 269.88
LifePack12 12-Lead ECG Patient Cable, 6-Wire Precordial Lead Attachment, Physio Control #11110-000022 6340 $ 107.96
LifePack12 QUIK-COMBO Therapy Cable for use with LifePack12 defibrillator/monitor, Physio Control 6341 $ 273.26
#11110-000040

Masimo SET LNC-4 LNCS Patient Cable, 4-foot reusable connector cable, Physio Control #11171-000024 6342 $ 151.81
Masimo SET LNCS DCIP Reusable Sensor, Multiuse sensor for patients 10-50kg, Physio Control #11171- 6343 $ 234.46
000018

Masimo SET LNCS DCI Adult Reusable Sensor, Multiuse sensor for patients >30kg, Physio Control #111714 6344 $ 234.46
000017

MNC-1 Adapter Cable (4 foot), allows LifePack 12 defibrillator/monitor with Masimo SpO2 to connect to 6345 $ 390.49
Nellcor sensors, Physio Control #11996-000198

NELLCOR SpO2 Sensor, DS100A, Adult reusable, Physio Control #11996-000060 6346 $ 66.27




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 5: EKG Cables (cont'd)

Vendor: Bound Tree Medical

NELLCOR SpO2 Cable Extension, DEC-4, Reusable, Physio Control #11110-000042 6347 $ 42.62
NELLCOR Oxisensor Il Disposable Pediatric SpO2 Sensor, Physio Control #11996-000116 6348 $ 14.07
NELLCOR Oxisensor Il Disposable Infant SpO2 Sensor, Physio Control #11996-000115 6349 $ 17.85
NIBP Adult Cuff for LifePack 12, 14x37.5cm, reusable, Physio Control #11996-000024 6350 $ 22.78
NIBP Small Child Cuff for LifePack 12, 7x21cm, reusable, Physio Control #11996-000021 6351 $ 18.33
NIBP Hose, 9 feet, reusable, Physio Control #11996-000033 6352 $ 42.17
Lifepack 12 defibrillator/monitor to PC Serial Port cable, Physio Control #11996-000369 9621 $ 91.09
Lifepack 12 standard hard paddles, Physio Control #11130-000001 9622 $ 477.79
Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
*Section 6: Microflex Synetron Latex Exam Gloves

Vendor: Henry Schein

Microflex Synetron Latex Exam Gloves, powerderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 7.1 mil Cuff Thickness 5555 $ 10.48
9.1 mil Palm Thickness, 10.6 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile Strength = 28 before aging (25 After aging),

Elasticity = 783% Before Aging (701% after aging), Protein Rating = 60 micrograms or less, Small

Microflex Synetron Latex Exam Gloves, powerderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 7.1 mil Cuff Thickness 5556 $ 10.48
9.1 mil Palm Thickness, 10.6 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile Strength = 28 before aging (25 After aging),

Elasticity = 783% Before Aging (701% after aging), Protein Rating = 60 micrograms or less, Medium

Microflex Synetron Latex Exam Gloves, powerderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 7.1 mil Cuff Thickness 5557 $ 10.48
9.1 mil Palm Thickness, 10.6 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile Strength = 28 before aging (25 After aging),

Elasticity = 783% Before Aging (701% after aging), Protein Rating = 60 micrograms or less, Large

Microflex Synetron Latex Exam Gloves, powerderfree Exam Gloves, 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 7.1 mil Cuff Thickness 5558 $ 10.48

9.1 mil Palm Thickness, 10.6 mil Finger Thickness, Tensile Strength = 28 before aging (25 After aging),
Elasticity = 783% Before Aging (701% after aging), Protein Rating = 60 micrograms or less, Extra Large




Description

Lawson Item #

Unit Pricing

Section 7: Microflex Ultrasence Non Latex Exam Gloves
Vendor: Bound Tree Medial

Microflex Ultrasense Non Latex Exam Gloves Nitrile Powderfree Exam Gloves(not manufactured from
natural rubber latex)100/bx, 10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 9" Cuff Length, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 4.7 mi
Finger Thickness, Extra Small

5621

6.87

Microflex Ultrasense Non Latex Exam Gloves Nitrile Powderfree Exam Gloves(not manufactured from
natural rubber latex)100/bx, 10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 9" Cuff Length, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 4.7 mi
Finger Thickness, Small

5622

6.87

Microflex Ultrasense Non Latex Exam Gloves Nitrile Powderfree Exam Gloves(not manufactured from
natural rubber latex)100/bx, 10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 9" Cuff Length, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 4.7 mi
Finger Thickness, Medium

5623

6.87

Microflex Ultrasense Non Latex Exam Gloves Nitrile Powderfree Exam Gloves(not manufactured from
natural rubber latex)100/bx, 10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 9" Cuff Length, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 4.7 mi
Finger Thickness, Large

5624

6.87

Microflex Ultrasense Non Latex Exam Gloves Nitrile Powderfree Exam Gloves(not manufactured from
natural rubber latex)100/bx, 10bx/cs, 2.8 mil Cuff Thickness, 9" Cuff Length, 3.5 mil Palm Thickness, 4.7 mi
Finger Thickness, Extra Large

5625

6.87

Description

Lawson Item #

Unit Pricing

Section 8: NeoPro EC 12" Non Latex Exam Gloves
Vendor: Henry Schein, Inc.

PolyChloroprene Powderfree Exam Gloves (not manufactured from natural rubber latex), 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 5.3
mil Cuff Thickness, 11" Cuff Length, 6.1 mil Palm Thickness, 8.0 mil Finger Thickness, Small

5626

9.15

PolyChloroprene Powderfree Exam Gloves (not manufactured from natural rubber latex), 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 5.3
mil Cuff Thickness, 11" Cuff Length, 6.1 mil Palm Thickness, 8.0 mil Finger Thickness, Medium

5627

9.15

PolyChloroprene Powderfree Exam Gloves (not manufactured from natural rubber latex), 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 5.3
mil Cuff Thickness, 11" Cuff Length, 6.1 mil Palm Thickness, 8.0 mil Finger Thickness, Large

5628

9.15

PolyChloroprene Powderfree Exam Gloves (not manufactured from natural rubber latex), 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 5.3
mil Cuff Thickness, 11" Cuff Length, 6.1 mil Palm Thickness, 8.0 mil Finger Thickness, Extra Large

5629

9.15

PolyChloroprene Powderfree Exam Gloves (not manufactured from natural rubber latex), 50/bx, 10bx/cs, 5.3
mil Cuff Thickness, 11" Cuff Length, 6.1 mil Palm Thickness, 8.0 mil Finger Thickness, Extra Extra Large

5630

9.15




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 9: Sterile Gloves

Vendor: Bound Tree Medical

Sterile Gloves, Individually packed, ASTM D6319 Standard Specification for Nitrile Exam Gloves for 5559 $ 170.00
Medical Application, size: 6-1/2, 4 bx/cs, per case

Sterile Gloves, Individually packed, ATM D6319 Standard Specification for Nitrile Exam Gloves for Medica 6501 $ 170.00
Application, size: 8, 4 bx/cs, per case

Sterile Gloves, Individually packed, ASTM D6319 Standard Specification for Nitrile Exam Gloves for 6502 $ 170.00
Medical Application, size: 9, 4 bx/cs, per case

Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 10: AMBU PERFIT Cervical Collars

Vendor: Bound Tree Medical

Infant 5631 $ 2.66
Pediatric 5632 $ 2.66
Regular 5633 $ 2.66
Neckless 5634 $ 2.66
Short 5635 $ 2.66
Tall 5636 $ 2.66
Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 11: AMBU Head Wedge Disposable Head Immobilizer

Vendor: Guardian EMS Products

Must be able to be applied to any size backboard, must be made of 100% plastic components, single slide 6353 $ 3.55

mechanism that pulls up both side-panels at the same time, re-adjustable side-panel slide mechanism
symmetrical side panels that always stay the same height, be 100% water-resistant, have graphic directions for
use printed directly on product, able to be stored "completely" flat, be radiolucent, CT and MRI compatible,

include 2 head straps, No substitutions.




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 12: Miscellaneous Supplies

Vendor: Midwest Medical Supply Co.

Disposable OB Kit, Soft Packaging 5560 $ 4.89
Alcohol Prep Pads, Medium Size TRIAD 200/bx 5561 $ 1.36
Bite Stick made of high density polyethylene 5563 $ 0.29
Bulb Syringe, 20z size 5564 $ 0.29
Emesis Bags 25/pk 5567 $ 10.35
Hydrogen Peroxide 160z Plastic bottle 5568 $ 0.58
Sterile Lubricating Jelly, 5g, 72/bx 9771 $ 6.08
Oxygen Cylinder Handwheel, Metal 5573 $ 9.58
Large Oxygen Cylinder Wrench (aluminum) 5574 $ 4.83
Encono Paramedic Shears Drk Blue 7 1/2" 5575 $ 0.83
Disposable Penlight 5576 $ 0.60
Single use push button activated, spring loaded, retractable Lancet, 100/bx 5577 $ 941
PVP Surgical Scrub Brush-Sponge 30/bx 5579 $ 21.56
METTAG Triage Tags, with Bar code, single part 50/pk 5580 $ 42.61
Safety control seals, Pull Tite (numbered), 100/pkg 5581 $ 19.16
Razor, Medline Fixed Head, 100/bx 5582 $ 40.00
100% Acrylic Cot Blanket, 60" x 84", Blue 5583 $ 4.87
Oxygen "D" Cylinder Gasket, Brass w/Rubber Center 6354 $ 0.51
Disposable Probe Cover for SureTemp Plus Thermometer, 25/bx 6355 $ 1.03
Heavy Duty Ring Cutter 6356 $ 11.55
Paper drape sheet, 40" x 84" 6357 $ 0.52
Tongue Depressor, Adult, Sterile 6358 $ 0.025
Cotton Tip Applicator, 6", Sterile, 2/pkg 6359 $ 0.0125




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 13: Infection Control
Vendor: Midwest Medical Supply
Sharps shuttle 6" long, 1.1" diameter, 24/bx 9626 $ 39.41
Bemis bio hazard box wall safe type Bemis #150-020 9627 $ 3.89
Wrap around goggles with indirect shield-vent 24/cs 9628 $ 32.11
Clear lens safety glasses, anti-fog, contemporary styling, ANSI Z87.1 compliant 9629 $ 3.55
Fluid shield mask with clear visor, anti-fog, 2" wrap around, ear loops 25/bx 9630 $ 12.93
Inovel medical N95 respirator, all sizes, must meet CDC guidelines for tuberculosis exposure control in 9631 $ 0.96
addition to NIOSH and CDC standards for N95 protection against airbourne pathogens 24/pk
Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 14: Capitals
Vendor: Bound Tree Medical
Lifepack 12 basic carry case, to include Shoulder strip, right pouch, left pouch, and front cover, Physio 9632 $ 226.03
Control #11260-00030
Lifepack 12 back pouch for carry case, Phylsio Control #11260-000029 9633 $ 61.57
Lifepack 12 top pouch for carry case, Physio Control #11220-000028 9634 $ 40.49
Liftpack 12 replacement should strap, Physio Control #11260-000037 9635 $ 24.46
Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, infant, Nylon cuff, minimum 10 year calibration Warranty, with zippered carry 9636 $ 5.79
case
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, pedi, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration warranty, with zippered 9637 $ 5.79
carry case
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, adult, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration warranty, with zippered 9638 $ 5.79
carry case
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, large adult, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration warranty, with 9639 $ 5.79
zippered carry case
Aneroid Sphygomomanometer, thigh, Nylon cuff, latex, minimum 10 year Calibration warranty, with zippered 9640 $ 5.79
carry case

9641 $ 20.93

Adult full arm splint Fracture-Pak




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 14: Capitals (cont'd)

Vendor: Bound Tree Medical

Adult full leg splint Fracture-Pak 9642 $ 39.68
Ankle/Elbow splint Fracture-Pak 9643 $ 20.57
Pedi full arm splint Fracture-Pak 9644 $ 19.38
Pedi full leg splint Fracture-Pak 9645 $ 30.60
Greenline/D disposable fiber optic Laryngoscope handle, medium 9646 $ 43.44
V Vac manual suction starter kit, Laerdal #985000, includes handle, 2 Replacement cartridges, short suction 9647 $ 71.65
Catheter with adapter tip, double male connector and directions

Oxygen flow meter with Ohmeda QC Adapter 1-15LPM 9648 $ 32.11
Sprague Rappaport stethoscope, blue, 22, Adult and pediatric diaphragm, 3 bells, latex free 9649 $ 4.82
CPARP starter kit promo w/CPAP unit, 1 breathing circuit with harness, back pack, Medium mask 9650 $ 1,215.07
Oxygen/Ventillator bag, yellow, D size, ProPak, #SA:06 9651 $ 173.03
Ohmeda Male and Ohmeda Female quick connect w/6” hose 9652 $ 46.99
Thermometer, electronic, SureTemp Plus Model 690 9653 $ 242.60
Probe and well kit, rectal 4’, for SureTempPlus 690 thermometer 9654 $ 71.69
Probe and well kit, oral, 4’, for SureTempcPlus 690 themometer 9655 $ 71.69
Restraint strap seat belt buckle loop end, Black, 2 piece, 5’ 9657 $ 6.33
Restraint straps chest system, black, nylon, Metal push button, loop ends 9658 $ 27.84
Oxygen cylinder with toggle, aluminum, D size 9659 $ 44.05
Oxygen regulator/pressure reducer, brass, CGA 540 2800-R-2 9660 $ 63.25
Oxygen regulator, 1 DISS 1BARB 0-25 LPM 9661 $ 59.04
Stretcher, wheeled, easy-fold 9662 $ 263.20
Megamover plus transport unit, 40x80 Nonwoven ply gret w/backboard pockets, 1500 Ib capacity 9663 $ 23.69
Break-apart stretcher, aluminum, w/3 Patient restraint straps, minimum load Capacity 400 Ib 9664 $ 219.51




Description Lawson Item # Unit Pricing
Section 14: Capitals (cont'd)

Vendor: Bound Tree Medical

Traction splint w/aluminum ratchet, Adult QD-4 9665 $ 189.16
Traction splint w/aluminum ratchet, child QD-3 9666 $ 189.16
Traction splint w/aluminum ratchet, Combination QD-3 and QD-4 9667 $ 361.45
Kendrick KODE 1 vest, green 9668 $ 54.22
S-Scort “ten” port suction unit w/charging shelf and power cord 9669 $ 1,216.46
S-Scort “ten” replacement battery, SN >3001 and above 9670 $ 37.96
S-Scort Quickdraw spare battery, rechargeable 12V sealed lead acid 9671 $ 492.38
S-Scort Jr Quickdraw single use disposable canister 9672 $ 12.60
Clipboard, 8.5” x 14” 6/cs Style-A holder 9673 $ 23.22
LA Rescue cervical collar bag, 24”L x 11”H x 5"W 9674 $ 16.16
Trama/Air management bag 111, 26 x 18.5” x 12.5”, blue, Ferno #5111 9675 $ 231.01
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