Term Contract fo Medical Supplies

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 13-006

Term: 1 October 2012 through 30 September 2013

Recommendation: Low bidder per section

Description Bound Tree | Emed Medical [Guardian EMS| Henry Schein Medical Midwest Physio-Control| Plak Smacker QuadMed
Medical Products Wholesale Medical
Supply

Section 1: $ 19,700.54 No Bid Disqualified: Did| $  19,203.80| Disqualified: Did[ $  19,714.30| Disqualified: No Bid No Bid
Airways not bid all items not bid all items Altered delivery

as required as required requirements.
Section 2: $ 39,442.02 No Bid Disqualified: Did| $  54,648.08( Disqualified: Did| $  57,483.18 No Bid No Bid
IV, Syringes, not bid all items not bid all items
Blood as required as required
Section 3: $ 8,306.010 No Bid $ 9,51143( $ 9,339.37| Disqualified: Did| Disqualified: Did No Bid $ 8,585.32
Bandages, Splints, not bid all items | not bid all items
Tape as required as required
Section 4: $ 17,481.92 No Bid Disqualified: Did[ $  21,742.00 No Bid $ 22,627.46 No Bid| $ 21,739.70
EKG not bid all items

as required
Section 5: $ 26,150.08 No Bid Disqualified: Did[ $  26,825.70 No Bid $ 34,235.72 No Bid| $ 28,863.44
EKG Cables not bid all items

as required
Section 6: $ 12,130.56| $ 13,651.20( $ 15,356.16| $ 12,072.96 No Bid $ 13,351.68 No Bid $ 9,780.48
Microflex
Synetron Latex
Exam Gloves
Section 7: $ 343.50( $ 44500 | $ 47000 | $ 367.80 No Bid $ 396.00 $ 374.00 | $ 439.50
Microflex Ultra-
Sense Non-Latex
Exam Gloves
Section 8: $ 49950( $ 647.50 No Bid $ 457.50 No Bid $ 506.00 No Bid No Bid

NeoPro EC 12"
Non Latex Exam
Gloves




Description Bound Tree | Emed Medical [Guardian EMS| Henry Schein Medical Midwest Physio-Control| Plak Smacker QuadMed
Medical Products Wholesale Medical
Supply
Section 9: $ 8.50 No Bid $ 399.20 | $ 10.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sterile Gloves
Section 10: $ 5625901 $ 10,786.50| $ 744480 $ 6,916.05 $ 15,278.00| $ 8,100.45 No Bid $ 8,947.92
AMBU Perfit
Cervical Collars
Section 11: $ 7,476.00| $ 9,975.00| $ 7,455.00 | $ 8,337.001 $ 10,185.00| $ 10,983.00 No Bid $ 7,938.00
AMBU Head
Wedge
Immobilizer
Section 12: $ 2,116.18 No Bid Disqualified: Did| $ 2,574.80| Disqualified: Did| $ 1,523.73 No Bid Disqualified: Did
Misc Supplies not bid all items not bid all items not bid all items
as required as required as required
Sectin 13: $ 1,276.90 No Bid Disqualified: Did| $ 3,941.27 | Disqualified: Did| $ 1,107.10 No Bid $ 2,663.25
Infection Control not bid all items not bid all items
as required as required
Section 14: $ 32,297.40 No Bid Disqualified: Did No Bid Disqualified: Did No Bid No Bid Disqualified: Did
Capitals not bid all items not bid all items not bid all items

as required

as required

as required




	Recap

