2012 Vehicles

Bid 12-014
Commissioners Court 02/28/12
Drainage District Vehicle 11
Grapevine Dodge $39,490.00 x 1

Replacement to fleet

Funding: Drainage Budget



Tabulation
Bid 12-014

Purchase of Vehicles

Awarded 12/20/11: Low bidder per item as highlighted

Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grapevine |Helfman Ford| Meador Sand Dollar

Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet Dodge Stafford Dodge Autoplex
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | Grapevine Fort Worth | Galveston
Caldwell

Vehicle 1: Truck, 1/2 ton, ext cab, $19,149.00 $18,791.00 $21,999.77 $20,071.00 $18,999.00 | Disqualified: does | $24 815.88

SWB, power, cloth bench not meet specs

Vehicle 2: Truck, 1/2 ton, ext cab, Disqualified: does | Disqualified: does $23,881.77 No Bid Disqualified: does No Bid Disqualified: does

LWB, pOWQr, Vinyl bUCket not meet specs not meet specs not meet specs not meet specs

Vehicle 3: Truck, 1/2 ton, ext cab, $19,421.00 | $18,256.00 | $21,701.99 No Bid $18,695.00 No Bid $25,487.88

LWB, power, vinyl bench

Vehicle 4: Truck, 1/2 ton, ext cab, Disqualified: does | Disqualified: does $23,385.51 Disqualified: does | Disqualified: does No Bid Disqualified: does

SWB, power’ Vinyl bUCket not meet specs not meet specs not meet specs not meet specs not meet specs

Vehicle 5: Truck, 1/2 ton, ext cab, $19,149.00 $18,784.00 $20,581.95 $19,542.00 $18,999.00 | Disqualified: does | $26,045.88

SWB, power, vinyl bench not meet specs

Vehicle 6: Truck, 3/4 ton, reg cab, $19,337.00 | Disqualified: does [ $19 295.75 $20,679.00 No Bid $20,294.00 $26,774.82

LWB, tow hooks, vinyl bench not meet specs

Vehicle 7: Truck, 3/4 ton, ext cab, $26,447.00 $27,117.00 $27,298.26 $26,370.00 $26,790.00 No Bid $33,971.81

LWB, 4WD, power, cloth bucket

Vehicle 8: Truck, 3/4 ton, ext cab, $21,275.00 $20,687.00 $23,169.66 $20,789.00 $20,450.00 No Bid $28,196.82

LWB, power, vinyl bench

Vehicle 9: Truck, 3/4 ton, ext cab, Disqualified: does | Disqualified: does $26,389.01 Disqualified: does | Disqualified: does No Bid Disqualified: does

LWB, pOWQr, Vinyl bUCket not meet specs not meet specs not meet specs not meet specs not meet specs

Vehicle 10: Truck, 1 ton, 4 door, No Bid $31,664.00 $34,362.56 | Disqualified: does | $31 650.00 $29,977.00 $37,528.64

dually, LWB, power, cloth bench

not meet specs




Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grapevine |Helfman Ford| Meador Sand Dollar
Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet Dodge Stafford Dodge Autoplex
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | Grapevine Fort Worth | Galveston
Caldwell
Vehicle 11: Truck, 5500, reg cab, No Bid $43,447.00 No Bid $39,490.00 No Bid $40,963.00 | $40,179.52
cab and chassis, 4WD, vinyl bench
Vehicle 12: Truck, 5500, crew cab, No Bid $44,629.00 No Bid $42,701.00 No Bid $42,803.00 | $43,046.52

cab and chassis, 4WD, vinyl bench
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