
Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

 Classic 
Chevrolet    

Sugar Land 
 

Helfman 
Dodge       

Houston
 
Helfman Ford 

Stafford
Grapevine 

Dodge       
Grapevine

 
Meador 
Dodge       

Fort Worth
 

Parkway 
Chevrolet   
Tomball

Vehicle 1: Truck, 1/2 ton, ext cab, 
SWB, power

 $    20,733.00  Disq: engine  No Bid  $    17,155.00  No Bid  $    22,687.00 20,783.61$     

Vehicle 2: Truck, 1/2 ton, ext cab, 
SWB, power, runnings boards, 
chrome

 $    21,447.00  Disq: engine  No Bid  $    22,499.00  $    23,428.00  $    23,179.00 21,625.11$     

Vehicle 3: Truck, 3/4 ton, ext cab, 
SWB, power, TTP

 $    21,433.00  $    22,373.77  No Bid  $    20,599.00  $    21,247.00  No Bid  $    23,405.35 

Vehicle 4: Truck, F550, cab & 
chassis, power

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    31,559.00  $    35,851.00  $    36,695.00  No Bid 

Vehicle 5: Van, cargo, 1/2 ton, 
power, rear seat, rear AC, glass side 
door and rear

 No Bid  $    19,873.77  No Bid  $    20,355.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Vehicle 6: Van, cargo, 3/4 ton, 
power, rear AC, glass side door and 
rear

 No Bid  $    21,934.17  No Bid  $    22,250.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    22,169.75 

Vehicle 7: Van, 15 passenger, 1 ton, 
ext length, power, rear AC

 $    23,991.00  $    26,355.75  No Bid  $    25,245.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    27,283.25 

Vehicle 8: Van, 15 passenger, 1 ton, 
ext length, non-power, rear AC

 $    23,557.00  $    25,850.75  No Bid  $    24,845.00  No Bid  No Bid  $    26,879.50 

Vehicle 9:  PPV, Dodge Charger, 
V6, power, spotlight

 No Bid  No Bid  $    24,195.00  No Bid  $    21,765.00  $    21,757.00  No Bid 

Tabulation

Purchase of Vehicles
Bid 11-028

Recommendation: Low bidder per item as highlighted



Description Caldwell 
Country 

Chevrolet    
Caldwell

 Classic 
Chevrolet    

Sugar Land 
 

Helfman 
Dodge       

Houston
 
Helfman Ford 

Stafford
Grapevine 

Dodge       
Grapevine

 
Meador 
Dodge       

Fort Worth
 

Parkway 
Chevrolet   
Tomball

Vehicle 10:  PPV, Dodge Charger, 
V6, power, no spotlight

 No Bid  No Bid  $    24,025.00  No Bid  $    21,597.00  $    21,585.00  No Bid 

Vehicle 11:  PPV, Dodge Charger, 
V8 Hemi, power, spotlight

 No Bid  No Bid  $    24,999.00  No Bid  $    22,980.00  $    22,975.00  No Bid 

Vehicle 12:  PPV, Dodge Charger, 
V8 Hemi, power, no spotlight

 No Bid  No Bid  $    24,830.00  No Bid  $    22,812.00  $    22,803.00  No Bid 

Vehicle 13: PPV, Chevrolet Tahoe, 
power, spotlight

 $    24,691.00  $    24,973.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $    25,809.35 

Vehicle 14: PPV, Chevrolet 
Caprice, power, spotlight

 $    24,986.00  $    23,987.63  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 



 
2011 Vehicles 

Bid 11-028 
 

Commissioners Court 02/08/11 
 
 

CSCD, 2011 budget: 
 
Vehicle 8 (Van) = $23,557.00 x 1 from Caldwell Chevrolet 
 
 
Facilities, 2011 budget: 
 
Vehicle 2 (F150 truck) = $21,447.00 x 1 from Caldwell Chevrolet 
 
Vehicle 5 (van) = $19,873.77 x 1 from Classic Chevrolet 
 
 
Library, 2011 budget: 
 
Vehicle 6 (Van) = $21,934.17 x 1 from Classic Chevrolet 
 
 
Road and Bridge, 2011 budget: 
 
Vehicle 4 (F550 truck) = $31,559.00 x 1 from Helfman Ford 
 
Vehicle 7 (Van) = $23,991.00 x 1 from Caldwell Chevrolet 
 
Vehicle 13 (Tahoe) = $24,691.00 plus $143.00 for dual battery option = $24,834.00 x 1 from 
Caldwell Chevrolet 
 
 
Sheriff, 2011 budget: 
 
Vehicle 11 (Charger) = $22,975.00 x 7 = $160,825.00 from Meador Dodge 
Vehicle 11 (Charger w/o spotlight) = $22,803.00 x 2 = $45,606.00 from Meador Dodge 
 
 
Vehicle Maintenance, 2011 budget: 
 
Vehicle 13 (Tahoe) = $24,691.00 plus $143.00 for dual battery option = $24,834.00 x 5 = 
$124,170.00 from Caldwell Chevrolet 
 
Vehicle 14 (Caprice) = $23,987.63 plus $212.50 for dual battery option = $24,200.13 x 5 = 
$121,000.65 from Classic Chevrolet 
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